

December 15, 2022

#### VIA ELECTRONIC MAIL

Luly E. Massaro, Commission Clerk Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission 89 Jefferson Boulevard Warwick, RI 02888

RE: Docket No. 5189 – 2022 Annual Energy Efficiency Program Plan Quarterly Report of EERMC Invoices – 2022 – Quarter 4

Dear Ms. Massaro:

On behalf of The Narragansett Electric Company d/b/a Rhode Island Energy (the "Company"), attached please find the 2022 – quarter 4 report showing Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council ("EERMC") expenses for work performed by EERMC vendors in connection with the 2022 energy efficiency program year that were paid by the Company between October 1, 2022 and December 15, 2022.

This report is being filed in accordance with directives issued by the Public Utilities Commission ("PUC") at an open meeting that occurred on January 25, 2022. Specifically, the PUC directed the Company to file copies of all invoices paid to cover EERMC's expenses on a quarterly basis by the 15<sup>th</sup> of April, July, October, and December.

Please note that consistent with the directives issued by the PUC, the Company will also send a copy of this report to each member of the EERMC individually via e-mail.

Thank you for your attention to this filing. If you have any questions or concerns, please do not hesitate to contact me at 401-784-4263.

Sincerely,

Andrew S. Marcaccio

Soul & m

#### Enclosures

cc: Docket 5189 Service List Margaret Hogan, Esq. Christy Hetherington, Esq. John Bell, Division Joel Munoz

						Date Approval by	
					Date Invoice	EERMC Executive	Date Invoice
Vendor Name	Vendor Invoice #	Date Range for Time Worked	In	voice \$	Received	Director Received	Paid
Optimal Energy	287082	6/1/2022 - 6/30/2022	\$	46,402.75	7/1/2022	9/28/2022	10/13/2022
Optimal Energy	291079	7/1/2022 - 7/31/2022	\$	61,987.50	8/1/2022	9/28/2022	10/11/2022
Regine Printing	34217	8/18/2022 - 8/18/2022	\$	1,695.00	8/18/2022	9/14/2022	10/13/2022
Optimal Energy	294118	8/1/2022-8/31/2022	\$	58,462.50	9/1/2022	10/26/2022	11/7/2022
Desautel Law	949	8/12/2022 - 9/9/2022	\$	2,185.00	9/15/2022	9/28/2022	10/13/2022
Rhode Island College	E15013	6/30/2022	\$	229.30	9/26/2022	10/24/2022	11/7/2022
Desautel Law	968	9/9/22 - 10/13/2022	\$	4,965.72	10/13/2022	10/26/2022	11/7/2022
Optimal Energy	297114	9/1/2022-9/30/2022	\$	64,034.25	11/15/2022	11/28/2022	12/4/2022
GBRI		2022	\$	22,574.00	11/20/2022	11/23/2022	12/3/2022
Duffy & Shanley	63290A	2022	\$	9,900.00	11/29/2022	12/5/2022	TBD
Optimal Energy	300637	10/1/2022-10/29/2022	\$	41,681.50	12/11/2022	12/12/2022	TBD
Desautel Law	987	10/10/2022-11/11/22	\$	14,124.03	11/29/2022	12/12/2022	TBD

#### INVOICE Federal Tax ID# 03-0351557



Remit checks to: Optimal Energy, Inc. PO Box 74008680 Chicago, IL 60674-8680

#### Remit ACH transfer to: ABA Routing Number 063100277 Account Number 898052466590

Email ACH/Wire remittance details to RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com

Remit Wire Transfers to: ABA Routing Number 026009593 Account Number 898052466590 Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N

June 30, 2022 Project No: 863221-0007465.00 Steven Chybowski Invoice No: 000000287082 Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources Professional Services from June 1, 2022 to June 30, 2022 Phase **EERMC Intern Additional Fees** Monthly Intern Fee (June 2022) 3,000.00 **Total Additional Fees** 3,000.00 3,000.00 **Total this Phase** \$3,000.00 \_\_\_\_\_EE Program Planning & Implementation 01 Task Council Representation **Professional Personnel** Hours Rate **Amount** Johnson, Craig 1.75 325.50 186.00 Ross, Samuel 1.50 198.00 297.00 **Totals** 3.25 622.50 **Total Labor** 622.50 **Total this Task** \$622.50 02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Develop Task **Professional Personnel** Hours Rate **Amount** Belliveau, Eric .25 212.00 53.00 Caesar, Adrian 32.25 135.00 4,353.75 Johnson, Craig 24.75 186.00 4,603.50 Keller, Michelle 4.50 198.00 891.00 Ross, Samuel 9.25 198.00 1,831.50 **Totals** 71.00 11,732.75 **Total Labor** 11,732.75 **Consultants** Core Energy Insights Inc. 837.00 Energy Futures Group, Inc. 2,376.00 Jennifer Chiodo 841.50 Ralph Prahl 742.50 **Total Consultants** 4,797.00 4,797.00

Project	863221-0007465.0	00 Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	0000002870
				Total th	is Task	\$16,529.75
- <b>– – –</b> ask	03	Education Initiatives				
Profession	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar	, Adrian		4.00	135.00	540.00	
	Totals		4.00		540.00	
	Total Lab	or				540.00
Consultan	ts					
Rachel					1,240.00	
	Total Con	sultants			1,240.00	1,240.00
				Total th	•	•
				i Otai tii	IIS TASK	\$1,780.00
				Total this	s Phase	\$18,932.25
hase	008	Regulatory Proceedings				
- <b></b> - Task	01	Council Representation		<b></b> -		
	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Johnso	n, Craig		1.50	186.00	279.00	
	Totals		1.50		279.00	
	Total Lab	or				279.00
				Total th	is Task	\$279.00
				Total this	s Phase	\$279.00
<b>-                                    </b>		Council Connected Machine				
	009	Council Sponsored Meetir	igs & Materia			
Task	01	Meeting Attendance				
rofession	nal Personnel				_	
•			Hours	Rate	Amount	
	, Adrian		3.25	135.00	438.75	
_	ni, Gretchen		2.25	198.00	445.50	
Ross, S	n, Craig		3.25 7.25	186.00 198.00	604.50 1,435.50	
NU35, 3	Totals		16.00	190.00	2,924.25	
	Total Lab	or	10.00		2,324.23	2,924.25
Consultan						_,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,
	Sholly				2,518.75	
Rachel	Total Con	sultants			2,518.75	2,518.75
Rachel				Total th	-	\$5,443.00
Rachel						
		Dovolon Tochnical Materia				
 Fask		Develop Technical Materi	<b></b>			
<b></b> Fask		Develop Technical Materia	— — — — . als <b>Hours</b>		Amount	
 Task <b>Professio</b> n		Develop Technical Materia		Rate 135.00	<b>Amount</b> 1,518.75	

Project	863221-0007465	i.00 Rhode Island EER	MC - 2022		Invoice	00000028708
	n, Craig		20.25	186.00	3,766.50	
Ross, S	Samuel		19.75	198.00	3,910.50	
	Totals		57.50		10,433.25	
	Total La	bor				10,433.25
Consultan	ts					
Rachel	•				775.00	
	Total Co	onsultants			775.00	775.00
				Total th	is Task	\$11,208.25
– – – – Task	03	Other Council Respo	nsibilities			
Profession	al Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Johnso	n, Craig		16.25	186.00	3,022.50	
	Totals		16.25		3,022.50	
	Total La	bor				3,022.50
Consultan	ts					
Rachel	Sholly				2,092.50	
	Total Co	onsultants			2,092.50	2,092.50
				Total th	nis Task	\$5,115.00
				Total this	s Phase	\$21,766.25
Phase	010	Research, Analysis 8	t Oth Council Sup	port		
Profession	al Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
	, Adrian		2.25	135.00	303.75	
	n, Craig		7.00	186.00	1,302.00	
Ross, S			1.25	198.00	247.50	
	Totals		10.50		1,853.25	
	Total La	bor				1,853.25
Consultan	ts					
Rachel	•	_			232.50	
	Total Co	onsultants			232.50	232.50
				Total this	s Phase	\$2,085.75
<b>– – – –</b> Phase	011	Administrative				
Profession	al Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Johnso	n, Craig		.75	186.00	139.50	
	Totals		.75		139.50	
	Total La	bor				139.50
Consultan	ts					
Rachel	Sholly				200.00	
		onsultants			200.00	200.00
				Tabelel		
				Total this	s rnase	\$339.50

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC - 2022		Invoice	000000287082
Billing Lin	nits	Current	Prior	To-Date	
Total E	Billings	46,402.75	213,851.25	260,254.00	
Lir	mit			952,976.00	
Re	emaining			692,722.00	
			Total this	Invoice	\$46,402,75

#### **Billings To Date**

	Current	Prior	Total	
Labor	31,547.00	167,744.25	199,291.25	
Consultant	11,855.75	37,107.00	48,962.75	
Add-on	3,000.00	9,000.00	12,000.00	
Totals	46,402.75	213,851.25	260,254.00	

Project 863221-0007465.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2022 Invoice 000000287082

## Billing Backup

NV5, Inc. Invoice 000000287082 Dated 6/30/2022 Phase 006 EE Program Planning & Implementation 01 Council Representation Task **Professional Personnel** Hours Rate **Amount** 6/6/2022 1.00 186.00 186.00 Johnson, Craig Bi-weekly check-in meeting with OER. Discussed council meeting materials, councilor onboarding, education and advancement meeting, and updates on education RFPs and Home Energy Estimators RFI. Associated meeting prep and debrief. .75 Johnson, Craig 6/14/2022 186.00 139.50 Bi-weekly check-in meeting with OER and RI Energy Ross, Samuel 6/14/2022 1.00 198.00 198.00 Check in with OER grid on range of issues including plan development progress, Council mtg, MPS RFP, and others. 99.00 Ross, Samuel 6/28/2022 198.00 attend OER/RI Energy check in call; disc. planning expectations, CEA meeting, etc. Totals 3.25 622.50 **Total Labor** 622.50 **Total this Task** \$622.50 02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Develop Task **Professional Personnel Hours Rate Amount** .25 Belliveau, Eric 6/13/2022 212.00 53.00 discuss amortization and respond to discuss thread 6/1/2022 Caesar, Adrian .50 135.00 67.50 June C&I Sector team call and 2023 Plan C&I deep dive mtg coordination and planning Caesar, Adrian 6/2/2022 1.25 135.00 168.75 June C&I sector team call prep, notetaking, and follow ups; Caesar, Adrian 6/6/2022 135.00 472.50 2023 Annual EE Plan outline memorandum review and comments; custGas PY2020 workplan and responses to C-Team comments, and DNV memo review, EMV study tracker updates; 2023 Plan trade off analysis process outline and mtg. prep; June C&I EM&V call agenda development; SBDI/Wx 2023 Plan deep dive mtg. prep and agenda development; Caesar, Adrian 6/7/2022 438.75 2023 plan trade offs analysis; 2023 plan trade off analysis kick off; 2023

Please Reference Our Invoice Number on your Payment

RICE18/19 site report review;

memorandum review and comments

cross-jurisdiction equity metrics and reporting

Caesar, Adrian

Caesar, Adrian

Plan deep dive mtg #1 - SBDI/Wx prep and call; EM&V coordination - June C&I EM&V mtg agenda development, updated study tracker review,

6/8/2022

6/9/2022

June C&I EM&V call, prep, notetaking, and follow-ups; plan outline

1.75

.25

135.00

135.00

236.25

33.75

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC -	- 2022		Invoice	000000287082
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/13/2022	.75	135.00	101.25	
	2023 Plan C&I Deep Div					
	Building analytics progra					
	coordination and agenda		n outline Mem	0		
`accar Adr	comments, 2023 Plan tr		2 50	125.00	227 50	
Caesar, Adr		6/14/2022	2.50 Equity Workin	135.00	337.50	
	C&I 2023 Plan deep diverse: outreach/engagemersubgroup activities; RI A compliance studies	nt enhancements and be	est practices,	EWG		
Caesar, Adr	•	6/15/2022	1.75	135.00	236.25	
,	EERMC equity working g		V study coord	lination -		
	confirmation of final C-T					
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/16/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	EM&V 2023 plan developereport finalization	oment, NP/Participant st	udy coordinat	tion for		
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/17/2022	1.50	135.00	202.50	
	EERMC mtg. debrief, No Equity working group we participation request					
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/21/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
	EERMC education mtg. a EERMC mtg.	and budget planning/rev	risions based o	on June		
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/22/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	Annual CHP stakeholder	forum prep and mtg.				
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/23/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	RI Program performance reporting template/corre input development, revie comments on NP/Part st	ections; EM&V study coo ew of MA studies applica	ordination - 20	23 Plan		
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/24/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	Monthly C&I Lighting ca 5.1, Linear LED NTG rati					
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/27/2022	2.75	135.00	371.25	
	Residential/C&I Data thr development; C&I lightin Marketing characterizati	ng NTG planning value a	analysis; Light			
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/28/2022	4.00	135.00	540.00	
	EE and climate goal rese	earch and memo develop	oment			
Caesar, Adr	ian	6/29/2022	3.00	135.00	405.00	
	EE and climate research meeting agenda develor distribution of key takea continued planning discu	oment; 2023 plan C&I de ways/action items and c	eep dive notes	s review and		
Caesar, Adr	·	6/30/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
·	EE and climate change r team agenda finalization	nemo development for I	EERMC, Res/C	&I sector		
ohnson, Cr	=	6/3/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
	Annual Planning - initial	review of plan outline m	nemo.			
,		6/5/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
	alg					
	Review monthly resident meeting, including finish	tial sector team data. Pr	ep for Res se			
ohnson, Cr	Review monthly resident meeting, including finish	tial sector team data. Pr	ep for Res se		325.50	
Johnson, Cr	Review monthly resident meeting, including finish	tial sector team data. Pr putting together and di 6/6/2022 outline to help guide di	ep for Res sec istributing age 1.75	enda. 186.00	325.50	

Project 863221-0007465.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2022	Invoice	000000287082
Planning - Review draft outline with Adrian and prep for meeting with RI Energy on plan trade-off analysis memo. Meeting with RI Energy and OER to discuss plan trade-off analysis. Sector Team - Residential sector team meeting, associated meeting prep.		
ohnson, Craig 6/8/2022 2.00 186.00	372.00	
Annual Plan - Review plan outline memo and develop initial comments for inclusion in Council presentation.		
ohnson, Craig 6/9/2022 3.00 186.00	558.00	
Annual Plan - MF Deep Dive meeting, associated meeting prep including review of relevant materials.		
lohnson, Craig 6/9/2022 .25 186.00	46.50	
Review and discuss Jesse's work on EE equity metrics research.		
lohnson, Craig 6/15/2022 1.00 186.00	186.00	
Plan outline memo - continue review and comment on memo.		
lohnson, Craig 6/16/2022 .75 186.00	139.50	
Annual Planning - review plan outline memo along with RI Energy council presentation to ensure consistency between documents.		
Johnson, Craig 6/17/2022 .50 186.00	93.00	
Plan outline memo - finalize comments.		
lohnson, Craig 6/20/2022 1.25 186.00	232.50	
Review appliance and equipment standards guidance document and identify areas where we may or may not want to submit public comment on behalf of the Council. E-mails with Glenn R. re: the same. Attend brief public hearing on appliance standards guidance document.		
lohnson, Craig 6/22/2022 1.50 186.00	279.00	
Review 2022 plan data and implementation and oversight tracker.		
lohnson, Craig 6/24/2022 2.00 186.00	372.00	
Review responses to Home Energy Estimators RFI. Discussion with Margie and Richard re: RFI and best next steps. Discuss upcoming planning activities with Margie and Richard.		
lohnson, Craig 6/27/2022 .50 186.00	93.00	
Initial high-level review of residential may data report		
ohnson, Craig 6/28/2022 1.25 186.00	232.50	
Coordinate with Glenn on comments for RI Appliance Standards Guidance document. Review CT DEEP Weatherization Barrier Remediation program operation, share press release with RI residential sector team as a follow-up to IES deep dive meeting.		
lohnson, Craig 6/29/2022 .25 186.00	46.50	
Coordination with Angela re: IES Q2 BP meeting, e-mails with Sam and Steve re: same.		
Johnson, Craig 6/30/2022 2.50 186.00	465.00	
Residential Sector Team Planning - Develop and distribute agenda and materials for July sector team meeting. Review monthly residential data report. Coordinate on agendas with Adrian.		
Keller, Michelle 6/1/2022 .75 198.00	148.50	
RI C&I Deep Dive Mtg prep		
Keller, Michelle 6/6/2022 .25 198.00	49.50	
Prep for 2023 Plan C&I Deep Dive		
Keller, Michelle 6/7/2022 1.75 198.00	346.50	
Prep and 2023 Plan C&I Deep Dive Mtg		
Keller, Michelle 6/9/2022 .25 198.00	49.50	
Prep for 6/14 C&I Deep Dive Mtg		
Keller, Michelle 6/14/2022 1.25 198.00	247.50	
RI 2023 Plan Deep Dive Call #2 + review of materials	217.50	
Keller, Michelle 6/30/2022 .25 198.00	49.50	
Circly 1-indicine 0/30/2022 .23 190.00	TJ.JU	

Project	863221-0007465	5.00 Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	0000002870
	C&I Deep Dive Fol	low up - 2023 RR Plan				
Ross, Samue		6/19/2022	2.50	198.00	495.00	
_	-	ile C-team comments on Plan C				
Ross, Samue		6/21/2022	.75	198.00	148.50	
D C		stribution of C-Team comment			640 =0	
Ross, Samue		6/23/2022	3.25	198.00	643.50	
	planning needs an	d EE TWG, incl. discussion of e d timing; corresp re: appliance from MA for RI planning				
Ross, Samue		6/24/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
,		oowski re: NEEP state partners	hips, cont. co	orresp. re:		
Ross, Samue	el	6/27/2022	1.25	198.00	247.50	
	reflected; corresp confirm plan for in	view to affirm Council requests and subsequent conversation v corporating utility review of drains council ownership of study	with S. Chybo aft and final	owski to		
Ross, Samue	el	6/30/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	delivered fuels bill	impacts model corresp.				
	Totals		71.00		11,732.75	
	Total La	bor				11,732.75
				Total th	is Task	\$16,529.75
=	<b></b>	. <b></b>	<b></b>			· <b></b>
_	03	Education Initiatives	<b></b> .	<b></b>		<b></b>
ı ask						
	al Personnel					
	al Personnel		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Profession		6/13/2022	Hours 3.00	<b>Rate</b> 135.00	<b>Amount</b> 405.00	
Profession	ian New EERMC memb development and i	6/13/2022 ber education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mt	3.00 presentation onboarding	135.00		
<b>Profession</b> Caesar, Adri	ian  New EERMC members and in the finalization for 6/1-1 ian	6/13/2022 ber education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00	135.00		
<b>Profession</b> Caesar, Adri	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1sian  EERMC new members	6/13/2022 ber education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mt	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call	135.00 slide	405.00 135.00	
<b>Profession</b> Caesar, Adri	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1sian  EERMC new member Totals	6/13/2022 ber education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022 ber onboarding and orientation	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00	135.00 slide	405.00	
Professiona Caesar, Adri	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1sian  EERMC new members	6/13/2022 ber education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022 ber onboarding and orientation	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call	135.00 slide	405.00 135.00	540.00
<b>Profession</b> Caesar, Adri	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1sian  EERMC new member Totals	6/13/2022 ber education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022 ber onboarding and orientation	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call	135.00 slide	405.00 135.00 540.00	540.00 \$1,780.00
<b>Profession</b> Caesar, Adri	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1sian  EERMC new member Totals	6/13/2022 ber education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022 ber onboarding and orientation	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call	135.00 slide 135.00	405.00 135.00 540.00 is Task	
<b>Profession</b> Caesar, Adri	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1sian  EERMC new member Totals	6/13/2022 ber education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022 ber onboarding and orientation	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call	135.00 slide 135.00 <b>Total th</b>	405.00 135.00 540.00 is Task	\$1,780.00
Professiona Caesar, Adri Caesar, Adri	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1- ian  EERMC new member Totals  Total La	6/13/2022 Deer education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022 Deer onboarding and orientation  bor  Regulatory Proceedings	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call	135.00 slide 135.00 <b>Total th</b>	405.00 135.00 540.00 is Task	\$1,780.00
Professional Caesar, Adri Caesar, Adri Caesar, Adri Phase	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1- ian  EERMC new member Totals  Total La  008  01	6/13/2022 Deer education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mty 6/14/2022 Deer onboarding and orientation  bor	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call	135.00 slide 135.00 <b>Total th</b>	405.00 135.00 540.00 is Task	\$1,780.00
Professiona Caesar, Adri Caesar, Adri Caesar, Adri	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1s ian  EERMC new member Totals  Total La	6/13/2022 Deer education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022 Deer onboarding and orientation  bor  Regulatory Proceedings	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call 4.00	135.00 slide 135.00  Total th  Total this	405.00  135.00  540.00  is Task  Phase	\$1,780.00
Professional Caesar, Adri Caesar, Adri Caesar, Adri Phase Task Professional	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1s ian  EERMC new member Totals  Total La  008 01 al Personnel	6/13/2022 Deer education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mty 6/14/2022 Deer onboarding and orientation  bor  Regulatory Proceedings  Council Representation	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call 4.00	135.00 slide 135.00  Total th  Total this	405.00  135.00  540.00  is Task  Phase  Amount	\$1,780.00
Caesar, Adri	New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1/2 finalization for for all La    008	6/13/2022 Deer education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022 Deer onboarding and orientation  bor  Regulatory Proceedings	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call 4.00  Hours 1.50 Review mate	135.00 slide 135.00  Total this Total this Rate 186.00 erials in	405.00  135.00  540.00  is Task  Phase	\$1,780.00
Professional Caesar, Adri Caesar, Adri Caesar, Adri Phase Task Professional	ian  New EERMC member development and infinalization for 6/1- ian  EERMC new member Totals  Total La  O08  01  al Personnel  aig  Monitor PUC Open	6/13/2022  per education and onboarding/ meeting prep; EERMC member 4 new member onboarding mto 6/14/2022  per onboarding and orientation  bor  Regulatory Proceedings  Council Representation  6/27/2022  meeting on Docket 22-05-EE.	3.00 presentation onboarding g. 1.00 call 4.00  Hours 1.50 Review mate	135.00 slide 135.00  Total this Total this Rate 186.00 erials in	405.00  135.00  540.00  is Task  Phase  Amount	\$1,780.00

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	000000287082
				Total thi	s Task	\$279.00
				Total this	Phase	\$279.00
<b>– – –</b> . Phase	009	Council Sponsored Meet	ings & Materia	<b></b>		
<b>– – –</b> . Task	01	Meeting Attendance				
	nal Personnel					
101033101	idi i Ci Soimici		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adı	rian	6/16/2022	2.00	135.00	270.00	
cacsai, Aui	June EERMC Mtg. Prep		2.00	155.00	270.00	
Caesar, Adı		6/30/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
	June 30 EERMC CEA m			100.00	200.70	
Calcagni, G		6/16/2022	2.25	198.00	445.50	
<b>.</b> .	Attended and presente					
Johnson, C	•	6/16/2022	2.25	186.00	418.50	
, -	-	g and present technical m				
Johnson, C	•	6/30/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
		tendance, primarily focus presentations and discuss				
Ross, Samu		6/14/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
	Councilor orientation p	resentation, follow up cor	rrespondence	re: same		
Ross, Samu	ıel	6/16/2022	2.75	198.00	544.50	
		and follow up re: same, i olan outline memorandum		e to present		
Ross, Samu	ıel	6/30/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
	attend and facilitate El	ERMC CEA meeting				
	Totals		16.00		2,924.25	
	Total Labor					2,924.25
				Total thi	s Task	\$5,443.00
<b></b> . Task	02		<b>– – – – .</b> rials			
Profession	nal Personnel	·				
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adı	rian	5/18/2022	Hours .50	<b>Rate</b> 135.00	<b>Amount</b> 67.50	
Caesar, Adı		5/18/2022 - council budget planning	.50	135.00	<b>Amount</b> 67.50	
	May EERMC mtg prep studies for 2023		.50	135.00		
	May EERMC mtg prep studies for 2023 rian June EERMC mtg mate	- council budget planning	.50 and potential .75 outline memo	135.00 activities/ 135.00	67.50	
Caesar, Adı	May EERMC mtg prep studies for 2023 rian June EERMC mtg mate refresh, annual report	- council budget planning 6/6/2022 erials development - plan	.50 and potential .75 outline memo	135.00 activities/ 135.00	67.50	
Caesar, Adı	May EERMC mtg prep studies for 2023 rian June EERMC mtg mate refresh, annual report	- council budget planning 6/6/2022 erials development - plan update, EERMC budget p 6/7/2022	.50 and potential .75 outline memo roposal	135.00 activities/ 135.00 , MPS	67.50 101.25	
Caesar, Adı Caesar, Adı	May EERMC mtg prep studies for 2023 rian June EERMC mtg mate refresh, annual report rian EERMC Budget propos	- council budget planning 6/6/2022 erials development - plan update, EERMC budget p 6/7/2022	.50 and potential .75 outline memo roposal	135.00 activities/ 135.00 , MPS	67.50 101.25	
Caesar, Adı Caesar, Adı	May EERMC mtg prep studies for 2023 rian  June EERMC mtg mate refresh, annual report rian  EERMC Budget propos rian  2023 Plan outline mem development; June EE	- council budget planning 6/6/2022 erials development - plan update, EERMC budget p 6/7/2022 al memo development	.50 and potential .75 outline memoroposal .50 2.00 oposal presentation - plan or	135.00 activities/ 135.00 , MPS 135.00 135.00 ation	67.50 101.25 67.50	
Caesar, Adı Caesar, Adı Caesar, Adı	May EERMC mtg prep studies for 2023 rian  June EERMC mtg mate refresh, annual report rian  EERMC Budget propos rian  2023 Plan outline mem development; June EE presentation, EERMC b	- council budget planning 6/6/2022 erials development - plane update, EERMC budget pl 6/7/2022 al memo development 6/8/2022 no and EERMC budget pro RMC mtg materials finaliz	.50 and potential .75 outline memoroposal .50 2.00 oposal presentation - plan or	135.00 activities/ 135.00 , MPS 135.00 135.00 ation	67.50 101.25 67.50	
Caesar, Adı Caesar, Adı Caesar, Adı	May EERMC mtg prep studies for 2023 rian  June EERMC mtg mate refresh, annual report rian  EERMC Budget proposician  2023 Plan outline mem development; June EE presentation, EERMC brian  June EERMC mtg prep	- council budget planning 6/6/2022 erials development - plan update, EERMC budget planning 6/7/2022 al memo development 6/8/2022 no and EERMC budget pro RMC mtg materials finaliz	.50 and potential .75 outline memo roposal .50 2.00 posal present ation - plan or ion .75 cation assignm	135.00 activities/  135.00 , MPS  135.00  135.00 ation utline memo  135.00 eents; MA/RI	67.50 101.25 67.50 270.00	
Caesar, Adi Caesar, Adi Caesar, Adi Caesar, Adi Caesar, Adi	May EERMC mtg prep studies for 2023 rian  June EERMC mtg mate refresh, annual report rian  EERMC Budget proposition  2023 Plan outline mem development; June EE presentation, EERMC brian  June EERMC mtg prep equity metrics research meeting	- council budget planning  6/6/2022  rials development - plan update, EERMC budget proposal presentate 6/15/2022  al memo development 6/8/2022  no and EERMC budget proposal presentate 6/15/2022  , attendance, and present	.50 and potential .75 outline memo roposal .50 2.00 posal present ation - plan or ion .75 cation assignm	135.00 activities/  135.00 , MPS  135.00  135.00 ation utline memo  135.00 eents; MA/RI	67.50 101.25 67.50 270.00	

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	000000287082
Caesar, Adr	rian	6/24/2022	1.50	135.00	202.50	
	2023 EERMC budget pro					
	survey on budget propos			program		
	administration procurem	-				
Caesar, Adr		6/27/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	EERMC CEA prep - Nonp study process summary	articipation and Particip	ant Study/MF	Census		
Caesar, Adr		6/27/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
acsar, Aar	EERMC Education/Advar	cement meeting materi	als developme		07.50	
\ · · · · <b>A</b> -l.	facilitated discussion top	•		125.00	160.75	
Caesar, Adr		6/28/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
·	EERMC CEA meeting pre			125.00	125.00	
Caesar, Adr		6/29/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	EERMC CEA meeting pre	-		105.00	405.00	
Caesar, Adr		6/30/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	EERMC background and NP/Participant study and major feedback summar	I MF census materials re				
Calcagni, G	•	6/1/2022	.25	198.00	49.50	
alcagiii, c	Coordinated with Craig of meeting	• •	_		13.30	
Calcagni, G		6/6/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
alcagiii, G		• •		190.00	99.00	
alcagni, G	Coordinated with Craig of	6/9/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
aicagiii, G			2.00	190.00	390.00	
alcaeni C	Drafted slides for EERM(	<del>-</del>	1.50	198.00	297.00	
alcagni, G		6/10/2022		198.00	297.00	
-l: C	Updated MA GHG preser		_	100.00	00.00	
alcagni, G		6/15/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	Council meeting prep ca		4 50	100.00	207.00	
Calcagni, G		6/16/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
	Prep for EERMC meeting	•				
ohnson, Cı	=	6/6/2022	2.00	186.00	372.00	
	Develop materials for Ju presentation/material ne plan outline memo prese development. Review Sa comments and send bac discuss content of MA C	eds, begin work on out entations. Meeting with m's comments on MPS k to Steve for review. M	lining annual ( Adrian to revi Update RFP, ( leeting with G	ew material consolidate		
ohnson, Cı	raig	6/7/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
	Develop materials for Ju Council budget proposal		rk on slide co	ntent for		
ohnson, Cı		6/8/2022	5.25	186.00	976.50	
, -	Develop materials for Ju content for Council budg slide content for Plan Ou content for Annual Repo review and finalize budg report update presentati	ne Council meeting. Cor jet considerations prese itline memo presentatio rt update presentation. et consideration, plan o	mplete draft on ntation. Comp n. Complete on Meetings with utline memo,	f slide blete draft of Iraft of slide n Adrian to		
lohnson, Cı		6/9/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
<b>,</b>	Meeting Materials - Revi slide deck. Update mate	ew feedback from OER	_			
ohnson, Cı		6/10/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
	Develop materials for Ju MA Climate and EE pres	ne Council meeting. Reventation, provide feedba	view Gretchen	slides on	200.00	
	deck for delivery to OER					
	raig	6/16/2022	.75	186.00	139.50	

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	000000287082
		points for C-Team tech Council budget considera entation.				
lohnson, Cra	aig	6/17/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
		am to develop agenda a ation and Advancement r presentation materials.				
Johnson, Cra	aig	6/20/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
	Discussion with Steve re Councilors on additional	egarding options for colle budget areas of interest buncil for approval. Draft derations.	and strategy	for		
Johnson, Cra	aig	6/22/2022	.75	186.00	139.50	
	2023 Council Budget - f	nalize and distribute dra	ft survey to S	teve.		
Johnson, Cra	aig	6/22/2022	.75	186.00	139.50	
	Council Education and A development.	dvancement Meeting ag	enda and ma	terials		
Johnson, Cra	aig	6/24/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
	Council Education and A coordinate on material of	dvancement Meeting, fir development.	nalize agenda	and		
Johnson, Cra	aig	6/27/2022	.75	186.00	139.50	
	work on facilitated ee de	ocument for June CEA m	eeting.			
Johnson, Cra	=	6/28/2022 g, including working ses	2.50	186.00	465.00	
	presentations, merge fir to Steve to post to Cour memo.	oics, review of Cadeo slid nal versions of EM&V pre ncil website, draft facilita	sentations an	d distribute		
Johnson, Cra	aig	6/30/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
		pare materials. July Cour ding draft write-ups of p o consider.				
Ross, Samue	el	6/13/2022	2.50	198.00	495.00	
	including MPS Refresh F Commissioner Ucci rega other Council members Case regarding council I	Chybowski regarding Jun RFP; review and resolution rding draft EERMC Annut regarding same; correspoudget development and gas infrastructure/appliarurces regarding EE amon	on of commen al Report, cor ondence with potential allo nces; initial er	ts from resp. with Councilor cations, ngagement		
Ross, Samue		6/15/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	Sholly on recently finalize	ation, incl. G. Calcagni or ted annual report and ed on review and determina	uc budget top	oics, C.		
Ross, Samue	• •	6/16/2022	1.25	198.00	247.50	
,		uncilors Case and Ander		ce of		
		same w/Councilor Case				
Ross, Samue	el	6/17/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
	content planning, corres	dvancement meeting age op re: same; framing out ading into Jul, incl. budg	key next step	os from		
Ross, Samue		6/20/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
•						
	Review and provide edit surveying Councilor price		il budget cate	egories for		

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMO	C - 2022		Invoice	000000287082
	final review of Council b review; CEA meeting ag					
oss, Samue	I	6/23/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	finalizing EAC mtg agen	da, incl. responding to	OER comments	5		
loss, Samue	l	6/24/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
	review CEA finalized age deliverables and suppor introductions session, p	t, incl. facilitation of va	rious discussior			
Ross, Samue	· ·	6/24/2022	.75	198.00	148.50	
	budget research task de		ments			
Ross, Samue	=	6/27/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
	continued CEA and budg CEA slides; corresp. w/ Councilor engagement i for non-voting members	S. Chybowski re: these n subcommittees and i	and other topic	cs incl.		
Ross, Samue	l	6/28/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
	CEA meeting prep - fina questions; review and fi C-team materials, distril	nalize C-Team facilitat	ion slide deck a			
Ross, Samue	l	6/29/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	CEA meeting prep - faci	litation planning				
Ross, Samue		6/29/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
	budget topic and approv					
	review of potential appr	· -				
loss, Samue		6/30/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	CEA meeting prep - fina	I review of meeting ma			40 400 5-	
	Totals		57.50		10,433.25	40 455 55
	Total Labor					10,433.25
				Total th	is Task	\$11,208.25
- <b>– – –</b> ask		— — — — — — — Other Council Respons	ibilities			
Professiona	l Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
ohnson, Cra	ia	6/1/2022	2.25	186.00	418.50	
omison, cra	Continued work on Anni developing of new conte recommendations into o	ual Report - including r ent to put Council polic	review of new c	ontent and	110,00	
ohnson, Cra	ig	6/3/2022	2.50	186.00	<del>4</del> 65.00	
	Annual Report - Review incorporating final data	final data from Nation	al Grid and wor	k on		
Iohnson, Cra	ig	6/5/2022	4.50	186.00	837.00	
	Annual Report - Review Update numbers throug end report. Update grap	hout based on final nu	mbers in the ut	ility's year-		
Iohnson, Cra	ig	6/6/2022	2.00	186.00	372.00	
	Annual Report - Finish unumbers. Finish prepari working group.					
lohnson, Cra	ig	6/10/2022	3.00	186.00	558.00	
	Work on final edits for E	ERMC Annual Report.	Review OER fee	edback.		
ohnson, Cra	ig	6/13/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
	Review OER comments Sam about comments, a addressed.					

and R Johnson, Craig Annua Ann	Rachel on incorpo	6/6/2022  arding materials develop 6/9/2022  cooarding materials develop 6/10/2022  g prep; EERMC membe	.25 ization and distr 16.25  Oth Council Supplement .50 coment .25	186.00 ibution of  Total this  Total this port  Rate 135.00		3,022.50 \$5,115.00 \$21,766.25 
and R Johnson, Craig Annua Ann	Rachel on incorpo	rating final feedback. 6/22/2022 c-in with Rachel on final Research, Analysis & 6 6/6/2022 arding materials develop 6/9/2022 coarding materials develop 6/10/2022 cg prep; EERMC membe	.25 ization and distr 16.25  Oth Council Support Soment .25 lopment, EERMC	186.00 ibution of  Total this  Total this port  Rate 135.00	3,022.50 <b>5 Task Phase Amount</b> 67.50	\$5,115.00
Annua	al Report - Check al report Totals Total Labor 010 sonnel IC member onboa MC councilor onboadvancement mtg	6/22/2022 c-in with Rachel on final c-in with Rachel on final Research, Analysis & 6 6/6/2022 carding materials develop 6/9/2022 cooarding materials develop 6/10/2022 cg prep; EERMC membe	tization and distriction 16.25  16.25  Oth Council Support 1.50  Doment 1.25  Lopment, EERMC	Total this Total this Total this port  Rate 135.00	3,022.50 <b>5 Task Phase Amount</b> 67.50	\$5,115.00
Phase Professional Pers Caesar, Adrian EERM Caesar, Adrian EERM and ac Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb	al report Totals Total Labor  Total Labor  010  sonnel  IC member onboa  MC councilor onboadvancement mtg	6/6/2022 arding materials develop 6/9/2022 boarding materials develop 6/9/2022 boarding materials develop 6/10/2022 by prep; EERMC membe	16.25  Oth Council Support  Hours  .50  Doment  .25  lopment, EERMC	Total this port  Rate 135.00	Amount 67.50	\$5,115.00
Caesar, Adrian EERM Caesar, Adrian , EERI and a Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig Revieu onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetii Johnson, Craig	Total Labor  010  sonnel  IC member onboa  MC councilor onboadvancement mtg	6/6/2022  arding materials develop 6/9/2022  cooarding materials develop 6/10/2022  g prep; EERMC membe	Hours .50 pment .25 lopment, EERMC	Total this port  Rate 135.00	Amount 67.50	\$5,115.00
Caesar, Adrian EERM Caesar, Adrian , EERI and a Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig Revieu onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetii Johnson, Craig	010  sonnel  IC member onboa  MC councilor onboadvancement mtg	6/6/2022  arding materials develop 6/9/2022  cooarding materials develop 6/10/2022  g prep; EERMC membe	Hours .50 oment .25 lopment, EERMC	Total this port  Rate 135.00	Phase	\$5,115.00
Caesar, Adrian EERM Caesar, Adrian , EERI and a Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig New o introd identif Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb	sonnel  IC member onboa  IMC councilor onboadvancement mtg  IC onboarding mt	6/6/2022  arding materials develop 6/9/2022  boarding materials develop 6/10/2022  g prep; EERMC membe	Hours .50 oment .25 lopment, EERMC	Total this port  Rate 135.00	Phase	
Caesar, Adrian EERM Caesar, Adrian , EERI and a Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig New o introd identif Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetif Johnson, Craig	sonnel  IC member onboa  IMC councilor onboadvancement mtg  IC onboarding mt	6/6/2022  arding materials develop 6/9/2022  boarding materials develop 6/10/2022  g prep; EERMC membe	Hours .50 oment .25 lopment, EERMC	Rate 135.00	<b>Amount</b> 67.50	\$21,766.25 -
Caesar, Adrian EERM Caesar, Adrian , EERI and a Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig New o introd identif Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetif Johnson, Craig	sonnel  IC member onboa  IMC councilor onboadvancement mtg  IC onboarding mt	6/6/2022  arding materials develop 6/9/2022  boarding materials develop 6/10/2022  g prep; EERMC membe	Hours .50 oment .25 lopment, EERMC	<b>Rate</b> 135.00	67.50	
Caesar, Adrian EERM Caesar, Adrian , EERI and a Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig New o introd identif Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetif Johnson, Craig	IC member onboom IC councilor onboom IC councilor onboom IC onboom	arding materials develop 6/9/2022 coarding materials develop; 6/10/2022 g prep; EERMC membe	.50 oment .25 lopment, EERMC	135.00 135.00	67.50	
Caesar, Adrian , EERI and ac Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig New C introd identif Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetif Johnson, Craig	MC councilor onbody and wancement mtg	arding materials develop 6/9/2022 coarding materials develop; 6/10/2022 g prep; EERMC membe	.50 oment .25 lopment, EERMC	135.00 135.00	67.50	
Caesar, Adrian , EERI and a Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetii Johnson, Craig	MC councilor onbody and wancement mtg	arding materials develop 6/9/2022 coarding materials develop; 6/10/2022 g prep; EERMC membe	oment .25 lopment, EERMC	135.00		
Caesar, Adrian , EERI and a Caesar, Adrian EERM develo Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetii Johnson, Craig	MC councilor onbody and wancement mtg	6/9/2022 poarding materials devel i; 6/10/2022 g prep; EERMC membe	.25 lopment, EERMC		33.75	
and and and Caesar, Adrian  EERM develor Johnson, Craig  New Control identification of the control of the contr	ndvancement mtg 1C onboarding mt	poarding materials devel ; 6/10/2022 g prep; EERMC membe	lopment, EERMC		33.75	
and and and Caesar, Adrian EERM develor Johnson, Craig New Control identification of the control	ndvancement mtg 1C onboarding mt	6/10/2022 g prep; EERMC membe		education		
EERM develo Johnson, Craig New o introd identif Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetif		g prep; EERMC membe	1.50			
develor Johnson, Craig New orintrod identification Johnson, Craig Counce works Johnson, Craig Counce talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetification Johnson, Craig				135.00	202.50	
New of introd identification in the composition of		contiction of 14 ottpoardi		de deck		
introd identif Johnson, Craig Review onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetif		6/1/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
Revieu onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetid Johnson, Craig	ductory e-mail, w	welcome and orientatior rite-up and send introdu eet with newly appointe	uctory e-mail, ar			
onboa Johnson, Craig Counc works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meeti		6/9/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
Counce works Johnson, Craig Counce talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meetin Johnson, Craig		esentation needs for ne n meeting next week.	ew Councilor			
works Johnson, Craig Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meeti		6/13/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
Counc talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meeti Johnson, Craig		rep for orientation mee presentation deck with				
talking memb Johnson, Craig Send meeti Johnson, Craig		6/14/2022	3.00	186.00	558.00	
Johnson, Craig Send meeti Johnson, Craig	g points for orien	finalize slide deck for c station. Conduct orienta d send follow-up materi	tion with new Co			
Send meeti Johnson, Craig		6/28/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
· –	Councilor Case a	n update on high-level	outcomes of PU	C open		
Check		6/29/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
22-05		Councilor Case. Covere budget categories for in				
Ross, Samuel		6/13/2022	1.25	198.00	247.50	
prese	entation order and	dits for Councilor Orient d confirm speaking resp G. Chybowski re: same				
	Totals		10.50		1,853.25	
						1,853.25
	Total Labor			Total this	Phase	\$2,085.75
<b></b>	Total Labor					

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	000000287082
Profession	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Johnson, Ci	raig	6/3/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
	E-mail with new Council	members to coordinate	e orientation m	neetings.		
Johnson, Ci	raig	6/17/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
	Review Council website Steve regarding same.	and identify items requ	iring updates.	E-mail to		
	Totals		.75		139.50	
	Total Labor					139.50
				Total this	Phase	\$339.50
				Total this Project		\$43,402.75
				\$43,402.75		

# Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc. 4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

### INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: CEI RI 6-2022
Invoice Date: June 30, 2022
OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description	Description of Services					
Services Performed 06/01/2022 thr	ough 06/30/2022					
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 4.50 0.00	Hourly Rate \$186.00 \$93.00	Amount Due \$837.00 \$0.00			
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form	for details.)		\$0.00			

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$837.00

## Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc. Services Performed 06/01/2022 through 06/30/2022

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
6/7/22	Prepared for and participated in Res Sector Team meeting		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
6/9/22	Prepared for and participated in MF Deep Dive		1.75			1.75	0.00	1.75
	Reviewed Home Energy Estimators RFI response; discussed							
6/24/2022	same w/C. Johnson and R. Faesy		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
6/30/2022	Reviewed and commented on PPT summarizing RFI responses		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	4.50	0.00	0.00	4.50	0.00	4.50
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$837.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$837.00	0.00	\$837.00

Energy Futures Group, Inc. PO Box 587 Hinesburg, VT 05461

### INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: 5204
Invoice Date: June 30, 2022
OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Service	es		Amount		
Services Performed 6/1/22 through 6/30/2	22				
	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Amount Due		
LABOR - Regular Hours	12.00	\$198.00	\$2,376.00		
LABOR - Travel Hours	0.00	\$99.00	\$0.00		
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for det	ails.)		\$0.00		

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$2,376.00

## Energy Futures Group, Inc. Services Performed 6/1/22 through 6/30/22

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
6/1/2022	Review RI sector meeting agenda and data from Adrian		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
6/2/2022	C&I sector meeting; follow-up communications		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
6/7/2022	Small business deep dive meeting		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
6/9/2022	RI call on 2023 Plan: MF Deep Dive		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
6/15/2022	Set up Glenn for RI appliances review.		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
6/15/2022	Initial review of RI lighting standards and outreach to C. Johnson		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
6/17/2022	Follow up on Ri standards review		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
6/20/2022	Continued review of RI standards documents and engagement with NEEP		2.00			2.00	0.00	2.00
6/22/2022	Outreach to ASAP re: RI appliance standards		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
	Review labeling RFI responses.		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
6/24/2022	Appliance standards follow up w/NEEP and ASAP		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	Prep for RI lighting call; lead lighting call; conversation with Travis re: Performance Lighting; clean up and send notes		2.25			2.25	0.00	2.25
6/27/2022	Appliance standards follow up		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
6/28/2022	Proposed appliance standards recommendations		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
6/29/2022	Call w/C. Johnson re: RI appliance standards		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
6/29/2022	Automated labeling RFI responses PPT develop		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
6/30/2022	Automated energy labeling RFI PPT out for review.		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
		•				0.00	0.00	0.00
			,			0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	12.00	0.00	0.00	12.00	0.00	12.00
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$2,376.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,376.00	0.00	\$2,376.00

Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo

JLC Consulting, LLC 52 Bent Creek Road Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: R-22.03
Invoice Date: June 30, 2022
OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Service	ces		Amount
Services Performed 6/1/22 through 6/30/2	22		
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 4.25 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$841.50 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for det	tails.)		\$0.00

TOTAL DUE \$841.50

#### Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo

### Services Performed 6/1/22 through 6/30/22

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
6/2/2022	C&I Sector team mtg prep/mtg/followup		1.75			1.75	0.00	1.75
6/3/2022	Deep dive prep		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
6/7/2022	Small business deep dive call prep & call		2.00			2.00	0.00	2.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	4.25	0.00	0.00	4.25	0.00	4.25
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$841.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$841.50	0.00	\$841.50

## Ralph Prahl 7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

### INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: 29
Invoice Date: June 30, 2022
OEI Project #: 7465

\$742.50

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description		Amount			
Services Performed 06/01/22 throu	gh 06/30/22				
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 3.75 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$742.50 \$0.00		
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form	for details.)		\$0.00		

**TOTAL DUE** 

## Ralph Prahl Services performed 06/01/22 through 06/30/22

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
6/8/2022	C&I check-in call + prep		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
6/13/2022	brainstorm applicability of recently completed MA studies to RI		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
6/14/2022	brainstorm applicability of recently completed MA studies to RI		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	C&I ltg report		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
6/29/2022	C&I Itg AML study		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	3.75	0.00	0.00	3.75	0.00	3.75
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$742.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$742.50	\$0.00	\$742.50

## Rachel Sholly Energy Consulting 48 Hudson St. Providence, RI 02909

INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: 54
Invoice Date: June 30, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of S	Services		Amount
Services Performed 06/01/22 through	6/30/22		
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Admin Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 44.25 2.50 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$155.00 \$80.00 \$77.50	Amount Due \$6,858.75 \$200.00 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for	details.)		\$0.00

TOTAL DUE \$7,058.75

#### Rachel Sholly Energy Consulting Services Performed 06/01/22 through 6/30/22

Date	Description of Services	006-03 Education Initiative	009-01 Meeting Attendance	009-02 Develop Materials	009-03 Other Council Responsibilities	010 - Research, Analysis & Council Support	011 - Admin	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Sub- Total Admin Hrs.	Total Hours
	Reviewed annual report edits & OER feedback; Incorporated											
	annual report edits & updated 2021 numbers; C-Team working											
	session re: Councilor orientation & Council mtg prep; Check-in											
06/13/22	w/C. Johnson (C-team) re: annual report			1.00	4.75				5.75		0.00	5.75
	Prepared third draft of annual report				5.00				5.00		0.00	5.00
	C-Team working session re: Council mtg prep; Emails re:											
06/15/22	education budget, edu mtg location, CEA mtg location	0.25		0.50			0.25		0.75		0.25	1.00
	EERMC mtg - presented final annual report; Drafted edu mtg											
06/16/22		0.50	0.75						1.25		0.00	1.25
	Drafted CEA mtg agenda, circulated internally; CHP mtg											
	coordination; Updated council member contact list; Updated											
	council member order on website; C-Team working session re:											
	CEA mtg planning; CEA mtg planning		2.00		0.75		0.25		2.75		0.25	3.00
	Edu mtg prep - communications w/GBRI, D&S, OER, C-team;											
	Finalized & sent edu agenda & materials; CEA mtg logistics; CHP											
	mtg coordination; Edu mtg prep - communications w/GBRI, D&S,											
	OER, C-team; Finalized & sent edu agenda & materials; Edu											
	mtg prep - communications w/GBRI, D&S, OER, C-team;											
06/20/22	Finalized & sent edu agenda & materials	3.00	0.75		0.75				4.50		0.00	4.50
06/21/22	CHP mtg coordination				0.25				0.25		0.00	0.25
	Edu mtg prep; Edu mtg; CHP Annual Stakeholder Mtg; CEA mtg											
06/22/22	prep - C-team discussion, finalized agenda	2.75	1.25		1.50				5.50		0.00	5.50
	CEA mtg logistics - facility site visit & mtg w/events coordinator;											
	Created 2023 EERMC budget survey; Emails w/GBRI & MET											
06/23/22	School re: K-12 workshops	1.50	0.75						2.25		0.00	2.25
	C-Team working session re: 2023 budget survey; C-Team											
	working session re: CEA mtg planning; Edu mtg location; CEA											
	mtg prep - drafted slides, emails w/P. Gill Case re: facilitation		2.75	0.75			0.25		3.50		0.25	3.75
	Edu mtg follow-ups; Reviewed Councilor handbook, flagged						0.20		0.00		0.20	5.7 5
	updates, emailed C-Team; CEA mtg planning		0.50			1.50			2.00		0.00	2.00
	Reviewed, summarized & created slides on website analytics									1		
	(admin); C-Team working session re: CEA mtg planning; CEA											
	mtg planning - emails w/P. Gill Case (Councilor) re: facilitation; C-											
	Team working session re: CEA mtg planning; CEA mtg prep -								I			
	finalized & sent slides to c-team; CEA mtg prep - logistics, drafted								I			
	directions & email to Councilors (admin)		3.25				1.50		3.25		1.50	4.75
	C-Team working session re: CEA mtg prep; CEA mtg prep -		0.20				1.50		0.20		1.00	7.75
	drafted talking pts; Compiled CHP attendee list, sent to RIIB;								I			
	Sent CHP slides to attendees; Posted CHP slides to mtg page								I			
06/29/22	, 01 0		1.50		0.50		0.25		2.00		0.25	2.25
	CEA mtg prep, facilitation, follow-up conversation		5.50		0.00		0.20		5.50	<del>                                     </del>	0.20	5.50
33,30,22		0.00		2.05	42.50	4.50	0.50	0.00		0.00		
	Total Hours	8.00	19.00	2.25	13.50	1.50	2.50		44.25		2.50	46.75
	Total Amount	\$1,240.00	\$2,945.00	\$348.75	\$2,092.50	\$232.50	\$200.00	\$0.00	\$6,858.75	\$0.00	\$200.00	\$7,058.75

6,858.75

#### INVOICE Federal Tax ID# 03-0351557



Remit checks to: Optimal Energy, Inc. PO Box 74008680 Chicago, IL 60674-8680

#### Remit ACH transfer to: ABA Routing Number 063100277 Account Number 898052466590

Email ACH/Wire remittance details to RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com

Remit Wire Transfers to: ABA Routing Number 026009593 Account Number 898052466590 Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N

July 31, 2022

Rhode Island Energy Project No: 863221-0007465.00 Efficiency & Resource Invoice No: 000000291079 Management Council

Professional Services from July 1, 2022 to July 31, 2022 Phase **EERMC Intern Additional Fees** Monthly Intern Fee (July 2022) 3,000.00 **Total Additional Fees** 3,000.00 3,000.00 **Total this Phase** \$3,000.00 \_\_\_\_\_EE Program Planning & Implementation Task 01 Council Representation **Professional Personnel** Hours Rate **Amount** Caesar, Adrian 1.50 202.50 135.00 186.00 Johnson, Craig 2.75 511.50 **Totals** 4.25 714.00 **Total Labor** 714.00 **Total this Task** \$714.00 02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Develop Task **Professional Personnel** Hours Rate **Amount** Belliveau, Eric .25 212.00 53.00 Caesar, Adrian 61.75 135.00 8,336.25 Johnson, Craig 59.00 10,974.00 186.00 Keating, Griffith 2.75 135.00 371.25 Ross, Samuel 45.50 198.00 9,009.00 Socks, Matthew 7.50 198.00 1,485.00 **Totals** 176.75 30,228.50 **Total Labor** 30,228.50 **Consultants** 

Core Energy Insights Inc. 1,116.00 Energy Futures Group, Inc. 6,682.50 Jennifer Chiodo 2,425.50 Ralph Prahl 1,732.50 **Total Consultants** 11,956.50 11,956.50

Project	863221-0007465.0	O Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	00000029103
				Total th	is Task	\$42,185.00
– – – – - Task		Education Initiatives	. – – – -			
Profession	al Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar,	, Adrian		1.25	135.00	168.75	
	Totals		1.25		168.75	
	Total Labo	r				168.75
				Total th	is Task	\$168.75
				Total this	s Phase	\$43,067.75
– – – – Phase	009	Council Sponsored Meeti	· <b>— — — -</b> ngs & Materia	<b></b> als		
<b>– – – –</b> Task	01	Meeting Attendance				
	nal Personnel					
	-		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar.	, Adrian		2.25	135.00	303.75	
Ross, S			4.25	198.00	841.50	
,	Totals		6.50		1,145.25	
	Total Labo	r			•	1,145.25
				Total th	is Task	\$1,145.25
<b>– – – –</b> Task	_ <b></b>	Develop Technical Materi				
	nal Personnel	Develop Technical Materi	ais			
1016331011	idi r ersonner		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Bellivea	au Fric		.25	212.00	53.00	
	, Adrian		.23 17.50	135.00	2,362.50	
	n, Craig		13.25	186.00	2,464.50	
Ross, S			27.00	198.00	5,346.00	
11000, 0	Totals		58.00	150.00	10,226.00	
	Total Labo	r				10,226.00
				Total th	is Task	\$10,226.00
		Other County Description				
Task Profession	03 nal Personnel	Other Council Responsibi	iiues			
riviession	iai PEISUIIIEI		U	D-4-	A	
lobno-	n Craig		Hours	<b>Rate</b> 186.00	<b>Amount</b> 46.50	
JUNISO	n, Craig Totals		.25 .25	100.00	46.50 46.50	
	Total Labo		.25		40.50	46 E0
	lotai Labo	1				46.50
				Total th	is Task	\$46.50

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island	EERMC - 2022		Invoice	000000291079
Profession	al Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar,	, Adrian		10.00	135.00	1,350.00	
Johnson, Craig			8.00	186.00	1,488.00	
Mosent	Mosenthal, Philip			212.00	53.00	
Ross, S	Ross, Samuel		6.75	198.00	1,336.50	
	Totals		25.00		4,227.50	
	Total Labor					4,227.50
				Total this	s Phase	\$4,227.50
- <b>– – –</b> Phase	011	Administrative				
Profession	al Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar,	, Adrian		1.00	135.00	135.00	
Johnson	n, Craig		.75	186.00	139.50	
	Totals		1.75		274.50	
	Total Labor					274.50
				Total this	s Phase	\$274.50
Billing Lim	nits		Current	Prior	To-Date	
Total B	illings		61,987.50	260,254.00	322,241.50	
Lim	nit				952,976.00	
Rei	maining				630,734.50	
				Total this I	Invoice	\$61,987.50
Billings To	Date					
		Current	Prior	Total		
Labor		47,031.00	199,291.25	246,322.25		
Consult		11,956.50	48,962.75	60,919.25		
Add-on		3,000.00	12,000.00	15,000.00		
Totals		61,987.50	260,254.00	322,241.50		

Project 863221-0007465.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2022 Invoice 000000291079

## Billing Backup

DIIIIII	ј васкир					
NV5, Inc.				Invoice	000000291079 Dat	red 7/31/2022
Phase	006	EE Program Planning	& Implementation	on		
Task	01	Council Representation	n — — — — -			
Profession	nal Personnel	·				
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Ad	rian	7/6/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	RI EWG marketin	g/outreach subgroup meetin	g;			
Caesar, Ad	rian	7/8/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
	="	eam call notes review and fol	low-ups			
Johnson, C	_	7/8/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
		n meeting with OER.				
Johnson, C	_	7/12/2022	.50 -	186.00	93.00	
Johnson O	•	n meeting with OER and RI I		106.00	222.50	
Johnson, C	_	7/15/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
	Equity Working G Totals	Toup Meeting.	4.25		714.00	
	Total L	abor	1.23		711.00	714.00
				Total thi	ic Tack	
				10tai tn		\$714.00 
Task	02	Implementation Overs	ight & Plan Dev	elop		
Profession	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Belliveau, E	ric	7/15/2022	.25	212.00	53.00	
		eliverables, plan files and rev	iew timelines			
Caesar, Ad		7/1/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
	research on EERN tracker updates a inputs and july El	ief, EERMC 2023 budget plan IC areas of interest for poter Ind coordination w/RI Energy IM&V meetings; monthly RI dagenda correspondence w RI	ntial exploration; re: 2023 first data reporting re	; EM&V Iraft EMV		
Caesar, Ad		7/5/2022	.25	135.00	33.75	
	proposed improve	eam agenda update, correspo ements to C&I NC program, l eduling August C&I sector te	BAP program de			
Caesar, Ad		7/6/2022	1.75	135.00	236.25	
		//coordination - RICE1819 Fu NV, updated RIE Study track ways review				
Caesar, Ad	· ·	7/7/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
	July C&I Sector to disaggregation;	eam prep/call; RI data report	: IES Wx measu	re		
Caesar, Ad		7/12/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
	construction path	iew first draft coordination; F way redesign planning, C&I Implementation and Oversigl	workforce devel			
Caesar, Ad	rian	7/13/2022	3.25	135.00	438.75	
	subcontractors; C and training subg	t draft review process and co &I Workforce development s roup meeting; EM&V study t ighting market charz study p	survey review; E racker update a	WG WFD nd		

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	000000291079
Caesar, Adı		7/14/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
	Cross-jurisdictional equand 2023 plan question	uity metrics and PIM asses n tracker distribution	ssment; 2023	BC model		
aesar, Adı		7/15/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	2023 EE Plan main tex Energy	t review and markup - cor	mments/quest	tions for RI		
aesar, Adı		7/18/2022	2.25	135.00	303.75	
	and analysis - YoY Plan	Attachment 2, 8, 9 review, n/Actual data comps, mea elopment; 2022 C&I Custo	sure-level cos	sts and		
aesar, Adı	rian	7/19/2022	9.50	135.00	1,282.50	
	review and analysis - \ and savings workbook	Attachment 1, 2, 8, 9 revie 'oY Plan/Actual data comp development; 2022 C&I C TRM DB, BCR Model, and easure mapping	s, measure-le Custom Elec ir	evel costs npact eval		
aesar, Adı	rian	7/20/2022	4.50	135.00	607.50	
	measure-level costs ar	ew and analysis - YoY Plan nd savings workbook deve R model review; RI Energy	lopment, cost	delta		
aesar, Adı	rian	7/21/2022	4.50	135.00	607.50	
	reporting, C&I New Co 2023 Plan BCR model	I data report developmen nstruction program redesi analysis - program and po arisons 2022-2023; Measi	gn walkthrou rtfolio level co	gh; updated omps;		
aesar, Adı	rian	7/22/2022	3.50	135.00	472.50	
	study results, C&I sect	king Group - presentation or highlights; preliminary I baseline study workplan	Q2 data repo	rt review		
aesar, Adı	rian	7/25/2022	6.75	135.00	911.25	
	use-level cost to achie RI Energy re: major fir assumptions; prelimina	del measure mapping to 2 ve and 2022 YE fund balar st draft plan concerns - fu ary Q2 data review - C&I s enda development for cros	nce analysis; and balance a sector; EM&V	Check-in w nd cost ' study		
aesar, Adı	rian	7/26/2022	5.50	135.00	742.50	
	Plan markup and C-Te EM&V, Cross Program Energy - GHG account visuals development; e	pping - C&I electric and g am comments consolidatic attachments; EE plan dis ing and reporting; 2023 Pi and use and program level	on - Pilots and cussion w/ Of rogram level of CTA analysis	I Demos. ER and RI comps and ;;		
aesar, Adı		7/27/2022	5.25	135.00	708.75	
	Sector EM&V call - students DB and BCR Model mareview/analysis; RI Engles	ents consolidation for RI E dy tracker review, MA stud pping; updated YE fund b ergy follow up discussion of MC mtg. prep; EM&V mtg. ng and distribution	dies applicable alance projec coordination r	e to RI, TRM tion re: EE plan		
aesar, Adı		7/28/2022	2.00	135.00	270.00	
acsai, Au				22. A		
aesai, Au		e analysis and follow-up d ents, and markup consolid d demos, Cross program a	lation - Plan a			

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	000000291079
	2023 Annual EE Plan rev attachments on Res/C&I program attachment; Ca study coordination - site	programs, EM&V, pilots Innabis ISP draft report	s and demos, review; CustE	Cross		
ohnson, Cr		7/5/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
·	Res Sector Team - Revie prep for Thursday secto		slide deck su	mmary in		
ohnson, Cr	aig	7/6/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
	Review updates to imple sharing live version duri			prep for		
ohnson, Cr	aig	7/7/2022	2.25	186.00	418.50	
	Res Sector Team - Revie slide deck. July sector to			•		
ohnson, Cr	aig	7/8/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
	Implementation and Overversion. Coordinate with sharepoint.					
ohnson, Cr	aig Sector Teams - Make fin tracker and prepare to p sector team meeting not review delivery and com reminders to c-team me	ost to sector team Shar es and distribute follow ment deadlines for 2023	ePoint. Reviev -up items. 202	v residential 23 Plan -	372.00	
ohnson, Cr	aig	7/12/2022	.75	186.00	139.50	
	Initial prep for handling implementation and ove Steve on informing sectors	rsight tracker to ShareP	oint and coord			
lohnson, Cr	aig	7/13/2022	2.75	186.00	511.50	
	2023 Annual Plan - Quic plan. Draft and send e-n draft review. Check-in m timeline, and deliverable Send update on follow-u notice that implementati the RI Energy team.	nail to subs outlining pla neeting with Adrian and is for first draft plan revi ips from July sector tear	in and timeling Sam to discus iew. Sector Te m meeting, ind	e for first s process, am Work - cluding		
ohnson, Cr	aig	7/14/2022	4.50	186.00	837.00	
	2023 Annual Plan - Revireview of key electric and 2023 Plan main text and	d gas measures. Begin	comprehensive			
ohnson, Cr	aig	7/15/2022	3.75	186.00	697.50	
	2023 Annual Plan - Cont text and residential attac residential BC Models.					
ohnson, Cr	aig	7/18/2022	8.00	186.00	1,488.00	
	2023 Plan Review - coor comprehensive review o comments throughout a stakeholder feedback ar compare electric prograi regarding increased acq 2022 Implementation O	f residential attachment s well as reviewing for r d council priorities. Revi n BCRs to 2022 plan, co uisition costs.	, including pro esponsiveness iew BC Models onversation wi	oviding s to s and th Sam		
	expectations for RI Ener	gy Q2 report out on equ	uity commitme	ents update.		
ohnson, Cr	aig	7/19/2022	10.00	186.00	1,860.00	

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMO	C - 2022		Invoice	000000291079
Johnson, Ci	2023 Plan Review - Dishighlighted so far and pwith Matt and Griff re: numbers in BC models Second pass through rethat we'd like to flag for discuss their high-level concerns on residential review - map residential 2022 plans. Develop cocost-to-achieve tables by further investigation. Ir electric HVAC program.	plan for continued revie QA of BC Model inputs are flowing through to esidential attachment to the Council. Meeting with findings, and work to council. (I programs for Council. (I and income eligible programs of electric constructions)	w this week. Di with TRM DB ar plan documents of pull out major with Margie and compile list of al Comprehensive rograms and most, benefits, RI and ID key pro	scussion and ensuring scorrectly. concerns I Richard to Il key BC model easures with test, and ograms for	1,534.50	
	2023 Plan Review - Cor Benefit, RI Test, and co Review and discussion and Adrian. Investigate EWSF program. Investi	nprehensive BC Model I st-to-achieve comparis application of inflation t drivers of increased cu gate drivers of decrease	ons with Sam a table in BC mod istomer costs in ed savings in M	Review Cost, and Adrian. lel with Sam a electric F program.		
Johnson, Cr	raig  2023 Plan Review - Revelectric BC Model, as we work with Adrian and Seview changes in updacompleted to date. Investigation on residentia	ell as responses to other am to draft responses ated BC Model, and inconstigate drivers of key of ligible programs. Devel	er immediate plate to various comporporate into ar changes for mul	an concerns. conents. nalyses ltifamily,	1,441.50	
Johnson, Ci	raig  2003 Plan Review - Cor comparisons of gas cos between 2022 and 202. Further investigation in income eligible, energy bc model questions on Glenn, Richard, and Ma attachements. Review of Model questions docum agenda and send updat team meeting.	t, benefits, RI test, and B and ID key programs to significant changes in wise SF and MF gas progresidential programs. Rrgie's comments on the cross-program summanent. Residential Sector	cost-to-achieve for further inventor costs and savingrams. Developeview and merge residential and y attachment. For Team - Draft merce for further than the cost of the cost o	e tables estigation. ings for p list of gas ge together d main text inalize BC neeting	1,209.00	
Keating, Gr	iffith Intro meeting on topic Deep dive into compari discrepancies and deter	son between data table	2.25 es and BCR mod	135.00 dels - finding	303.75	
Keating, Gr	•	7/26/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
Ross, Samu	iel initial work to scope ou	7/5/2022 t research questions fo	.75 r Councilor Case	198.00 e	148.50	
Ross, Samu	research re: various Qs collect necessary mater comments on appliance	ials for Councilor Oakle	y; review C-Tea		445.50	
Ross, Samu	compile materials for C			198.00	247.50	
Ross, Samu	el Equity & PIM resource : Annual Plan review time			198.00 nate EE	148.50	
Ross, Samu		7/14/2022 main text in prep for o	.75 detailed redlinin	198.00 g; assess	148.50	

	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	00000029
Ross, Samu	el	7/15/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
		of Main Text of Plan; cor	resp. w/B Feld	man re:		
Poss Camu	Equity Commitments i		6.25	198.00	1 227 50	
Ross, Samu		7/18/2022 ew of main text 2023 EE I			1,237.50	
		re: C-team member com		. comments		
Ross, Samu		7/19/2022	6.75	198.00	1,336.50	
		of main text for commer nts with team internally, pribute email re: same				
Ross, Samu	el	7/20/2022	5.50	198.00	1,089.00	
	centralized initial findi inflation, and other ov	esize wide-ranging comm ngs, draft wording re: eque rerarching concerns, corre or of initial findings re: sect	uity, carbon ac esp w/B Feldm	ccounting, an and team		
Ross, Samu		7/22/2022	4.00	198.00	792.00	
	accounting, inflation, corresp re: scheduling	during EE TWG incl. equal large 2022 C&I elec YE bu gorn; follow up meeting and s group; corresp re: initial finding underBois	udget surplus i haring detailed	forecast,etc.; d finding re:		
Ross, Samu	el	7/25/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
	and GHG emissions re	am re: fund balance, TRC porting, analysis and talk ed for further touch points measure mapping	ing point prep	and follow		
Ross, Samu	el	7/26/2022	7.00	198.00	1,386.00	
	spreadsheet to illustra with Adrian re: appen call with, and follow-u review findings and in up call with RI Energy inflation, TRC costs; fi	d assessment of fund balante latter; divide remaining dices as well as other Coups from 1-on-1 with Courput; Check in call with RI and OER re: GHG reportinal review of Attachment	g analytical rev uncil materials; ncilor Gill Case Energy and O ing, fund balar	view work ; prep for, re: Plan PER; follow		
Ross, Samu		7/29/2022	5.75	198.00	1,138.50	
	Review, consolidate, f 2023 EE Annual Plan f	inalize, and distribute con irst draft	nments to RI E	nergy on		
		7/19/2022	4.25	198.00	841.50	
Socks, Matt	Reviewing RT TRM dat	tabase and submitted 202	•			
Socks, Matt	consistency; developin measure discrepancies		, assessinent	0. 0.0000		
Socks, Matt Socks, Matt	consistency; developing measure discrepancies		3.25	198.00	643.50	
	consistency; developing measure discrepancies hew  Continued review of Remodels for consistency to determine potentia	S	3.25 mitted 2023 platric measure degorizing discr	198.00 an BCR iscrepancies	643.50	
·	consistency; developing measure discrepancies hew  Continued review of Remodels for consistency to determine potentians.	7/20/2022 I TRM database and subry; detailed review of elect	3.25 mitted 2023 pl tric measure d	198.00 an BCR iscrepancies	643.50 30,228.50	
·	consistency; developing measure discrepancies hew  Continued review of Remodels for consistency to determine potentia	7/20/2022 I TRM database and subry; detailed review of elect	3.25 mitted 2023 platric measure degorizing discr	198.00 an BCR iscrepancies		30,228.50

Task 03 Education Initiatives

Project	863221-0007465	5.00 Rhode Island EERM	C - 2022		Invoice	000000291079
Professio	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Ad	Irian	7/14/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
		check-in w/OER - education EERMC OMA compliance; So				
	Totals		1.25		168.75	
	Total La	bor				168.75
				Total th	is Task	<b>\$168.75</b>
				Total this	s Phase	\$43,067.75
Phase	009	Council Sponsored Me	etings & Materia	— — — — — als		
Task	01	Meeting Attendance				
	nal Personnel	m.g				
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Ad	Irian	7/28/2022	2.25	135.00	303.75	
,	July 28 EERMC Me		-			
Ross, Sam	uel	7/28/2022	4.25	198.00	841.50	
	Totals <b>Total La</b>	bor	6.50		1,145.25	1,145.25
				Total th	is Task	\$1,145.25
		Davida Takaisal Mal	. — — — — .			
Task	02	Develop Technical Mat	teriais			
Professio	nal Personnel		Цания	Data	Amount	
Belliveau, I	Fric	7/15/2022	<b>Hours</b> .25	<b>Rate</b> 212.00	53.00	
Jeniveau, 1		/28 EERMC meeting	.23	212.00	55.00	
Caesar, Ad		7/20/2022	2.50	135.00	337.50	
•	2023 Plan first dra	off presentation developmen ination with C-Team slides	t; RI energy pre	esentation		
Caesar, Ad	Irian	7/21/2022	3.75	135.00	506.25	
		naterials development - 2023 am Q2 activities report, 2023				
Caesar, Ad		7/22/2022	3.75	135.00	506.25	
	July EERMC Mtg. r Q2 CTeam activition	materials development - 202 es report	23 First Draft Pre	esentation,		
Caesar, Ad		7/26/2022	3.50	135.00	472.50	
		ials Development - 2023 Pre or savings. budget, and CTA				
Caesar, Ad		7/27/2022	2.50	135.00	337.50	
	CTeam 2023 EE P	lan first draft presentation dolio and sector level data, C8	evelopment - de	etailed	337.133	

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC -	- 2022		Invoice	000000291079
Caesar, Adı	rian	7/28/2022	1.50	135.00	202.50	
	EERMC July Mtg materia presentation	ls finalization - 2023 EE	Annual Plan f	irst draft		
ohnson, C	•	7/7/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
·	Draft 2023 Council Budg Adrian, and Rachel, wor for RFI on 3rd Party Imp	k on drafting write-up a				
ohnson, C	raig	7/8/2022	2.00	186.00	372.00	
	July Council Materials - 1 implementation RFI for Sam, Adrian and Rachel	Council budget considerate regarding all write ups.		in with		
ohnson, C	=	7/12/2022	1.75	186.00	325.50	
	July Council Materials - I discussion write-ups for Cost of 3YR Plan Year. F based solutions and nate Review and merge Rach communications develop campaign.	3rd Party Implementation Review and merge Adrian Fural gas pruning studies el write-ups on EERMC I	on RFI and Ing n write-ups or into main doo brand and	cremental n market cument.		
lohnson, C	· =	7/14/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
	July Council Materials - a budget categories memo	_	s and work to	finalize		
Johnson, C	= =	7/18/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
	July Council materials -	set up template for EE/S	SRP TWG upda	ate memo.		
ohnson, C	raig	7/19/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
ŕ	Develop materials for Ju OER's feedback on budg	ly Council meeting - Rev		ond to		
ohnson, C	raig	7/20/2022	2.75	186.00	511.50	
	July Council Materials - ( materials for July meeting and plane for assembling Assemble slide content f	ng, including a discussion g the 2023 First Draft Pl or 2023 First Draft Plan	n to workshop an review pre	the outline sentation.		
Iohnson, C	=	7/21/2022	3.75	186.00	697.50	
	July Council Materials - I merge Sam and Adrian s Working sessions with S strategize on which poin Adrian to discuss develo	sections and send early a am and Adrian to works ts to emphasize. Workir	draft preview hop slide con ng session wit	to OER. tent and		
Iohnson, C	raig	7/22/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
	July Council Materials - 1	final pass through 2023	plan review sl	ides.		
Ross, Samu		7/1/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	research to support Mar materials for Adrian to in					
Ross, Samı		7/8/2022	2.25	198.00	445.50	
	review, provide commer ups incl. cost estimates; incl. budget approval pro timing, and other items	C-Team check in with C	DER re: Jul Co	uncil mtg,		
Ross, Samu	ıel	7/12/2022	3.25	198.00	643.50	
	review, edit, comment a RI Energy Check In Call; heat pump program cha	scheduling Councilor O				
Ross, Samu		7/13/2022	1.75	198.00	346.50	
	detailed review and com ups; share same with te	ment on consolidated, f am for finalization, incl.				
) occ ( C====	amounts and sources us		1 75	100.00	246 50	
Ross, Samu	ובו	7/14/2022	1.75	198.00	346.50	

						7.0.00
				Total th	is Task	\$46.50
	i Otai Lai					70100
	Total Lal	bor	.23		13.30	46.50
	Totals		.25		46.50	
	annual report.	from Rachel re: potential u	puates for next	year S		
Johnson, Cı	-	7/7/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
		7/7/0655	Hours	Rate	Amount	
Profession	nal Personnel					
Task	03	Other Council Respons	sibilities			
				Total th	is Task	\$10,226.00
	i otai Lai	UUI				10,226.00
	Totals <b>Total Lal</b>	hor	58.00		10,226.00	10 226 00
	with EWG2021 rep	ort for posting	E0 00		10 226 00	
		riew appendices, TWG mem	o, distribute sar	me along		
Ross, Samu	iel	7/28/2022	1.75	198.00	346.50	
	other council mater	rials shifting to Aug mtg (e. /Subcontractors re: quant r	g. Q2 C-Team a	ctivities		
-	Draft TWG memo,	assess and confirm plan re	: Appendix deve	elopment,		
Ross, Samu	-	7/27/2022	2.25	198.00	445.50	
	points all conveyed		C113016 1/63 360	cor taiking		
voss, saiilu		7/26/2022 call for Margie to orient and			33.00	
Ross, Samu	re-sorting and final takeaways, etc.; sa initial 2023 EE Plan	w, revisions (incl. updating tweaks for formatting and aving as PDF and distributin findings. 7/26/2022	polish, emphas	izing key	99.00	
Ross, Samu		7/22/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
Dage Com	review and assignn slide deck review a appendices vs. mai presentation conte	nents re: additional C-team nd revisions, incl. initial wo in body and prioritize updat nt	meeting materi rk to parse cont es & consolidati	ials; detailed cent into ion of main	F04.00	
	disc. re: timing of o	council presentation re: EE				
Ross, Samu		7/21/2022	6.50	198.00	1,287.00	
	and Adrian; incorpo draft materials re:	n presentation outline; revie prate high-level findings; re budget review and vote pro ; distrib budget write-ups to unding section	view and commocess for Counci	ent on OER I @ jul mtg		
Ross, Samu		7/20/2022	2.75	198.00	544.50	
		ncil meeting with Councilor	AnderBois			
Ross, Samu	responsibilities - in in addition to Plan	cl. Q2 C-Team activities repreview materials and budge 7/18/2022	ort and TWG up		49.50	
Ross, Samu		7/15/2022 council materials for Jul 28	.50	198.00	99.00	
Doca Camu	orchestrate feedba	lget write-ups to S. Chybow ck reqeust from Educ WG a	is well	• •	00.00	
		o recuback, imblement rem	iaii iii lu Ci iai lues.	, ililalize aliu		
	review responses to	o feedback; implement rem	naining changes	finalize and		

Project	863221-0007465.	00 Rhode Island EERMC	C - 2022		Invoice	000000291079
Phase	010	Research, Analysis & O	th Council Sup	port		_
Profession	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Ad	rian	7/5/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	2022 EE Plan proce	osal and Council information eding summary for PGC - A n and Plan corrections				
Caesar, Ad	•	7/6/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
	EERMC budget prop 2022 EE Plan proced Plan/Provisional Pla	oosal and Council information eding summary for PGC - A n and Plan corrections, 202 research and policy recom	on request deve Iternative Base 2 EE plan proc	elopment; eedings; EE	2000	
Caesar, Ad	rian	7/7/2022	2.00	135.00	270.00	
	program administra pruning; EE and clir	t proposal research and de tion, Market based solutior nate change research and p /first draft finalization	ns and Gas infr	astructure		
Caesar, Ad	rian	7/8/2022	3.00	135.00	405.00	
	Natural gas pruning	t planning proposals - mark , EERMC branding and awa ration; new heat pump pro	reness, assess			
Caesar, Ad		7/12/2022	2.00	135.00	270.00	
		t proposal development - N nd Market based solutions	latural gas			
Caesar, Ad	rian	7/14/2022	.75	135.00	101.25	
		t proposal finalization - Nat olutions	ural gas decon	nmissioning		
Johnson, C	raig	7/5/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
	related to EERMC be	for Councilor Case on numl udget and share of plan he o for C-Team comment on ( document.	arings spent or	Council		
Johnson, C	raig	7/6/2022	1.75	186.00	325.50	
	upcoming conversal discovery requests a spent on Council bu proposed appliance final version with Sa	n and Adrian re: talking pointion with PUC Commissione related to EERMC budget and dget. Finalize memo from 0 standards guidance documents.	r. Finalize talki nd share of pla C-Team comme ient. Review ar to OER.	ng points on n hearings ent on OER nd discuss		
Johnson, C	=	7/7/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
		ation in local stakeholder di sibility for integrating into R		ETs		
Johnson, C	_	7/18/2022	3.25	186.00	604.50	
	onboarding with no same. Onboarding r	g - update onboarding slid n-voting members. Coordin neeting with Brett, Kate, ar g and distribute meeting ma	ation with Sam nd John. Debrie	regarding ef on		
Mosenthal,	•	7/25/2022	.25	212.00	53.00	
		effectiveness, budgets				
Ross, Samu		7/1/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
		s Councilors, incl. detailed ecific requests from Chair C		up email		
Ross, Samu		7/6/2022	.25	198.00	49.50	
	call with Councilor (	Case				

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	00000029107
Ross, Samu	ıel	7/7/2022	2.25	198.00	445.50	
	Debrief call with Council Council history, climate a Desautel re: several Cou	and EE, and other topics				
Ross, Samu	ıel	7/8/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	cont. discussion with Co	uncilor Oakley building t	rom prior day			
Ross, Samu	ıel	7/18/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	new councilor orientation	n for non-voting membe	ers			
Ross, Samu	ıel	7/27/2022	1.25	198.00	247.50	
	draft key talking points f discussions	or Councilor Case to inf	orm Jul EERM	C mtg		
Ross, Samu	ıel	7/28/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	Meet with Chair Oakley to meeting after time off.	to assist in rapidly gettir	ng up to speed	l for Council		
	Totals		25.00		4,227.50	
	Total Labor					4,227.50
				Total this	Phase	\$4,227.50
	011					
Phase	-	Administrative				
Professior	nal Personnel			_	_	
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adr		7/27/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	Q2 C-Team Activities Re Group, EM&V, Annual Pl			y Working		
Johnson, Cı	raig	7/18/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
	Review draft updated fo		date.			
Johnson, C	=	7/22/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
	Develop content for C-T	eam Q2 summary of act	•			
	Totals		1.75		274.50	
	Total Labor					274.50
				Total this	Phase	\$274.50
				Total this I	Project	\$58,987.50

Energy Futures Group, Inc. PO Box 587 Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: 5322
Invoice Date: July 31, 2022
OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description	of Services		Amount
Services Performed 7/1/22 through	7/31/22		
	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours	33.75	\$198.00	\$6,682.50
LABOR - Travel Hours	0.00	\$99.00	\$0.00

Travel Expenses \$0.00

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

TOTAL DUE \$6,682.50

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
7/6/2022	Follow up on EERMC comments on RI state appliance standards		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
7/6/2022	RI labeling PPT out		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
7/7/2022	Res sector team meeting, labeling RFI presentation RI C&I sector call		1.75 1.00			1.75	0.00	1.00
	Email coordination with Adrian		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
	Initial review of 2023 Plan Update Evaluation text and question to Optimal re: fuel switching in RI		0.25			0.25 0.25	0.00	0.25 0.25
			0.25			0.25		
	RI email correspondence; plan documents		0.50			1.50		
	2023 plan review		1.50			1.00	0.00	
	Plan review and comments  Questions re: inclusion of RI in MA HP metering study		1.00 0.50			0.50		
	Plan review		2.00			2.00	0.00	
	Review RI 2023 plan and BCR		2.00			2.25	0.00	
	Plan review and check in with Craig and Margie		2.75			2.75	0.00	2.75
	Initial review and comments to Richard on RI Plan Update: Res. Sector text Review and comment on 2023 Plan Update EM&V and intro text.		1.75 2.25			1.75 2.25	0.00	
	EE Plan Review		3.25			3.25	0.00	
7/20/2022	Follow up on MA gas heating equipment incentives		0.25			0.25	0.00	
	Plan review; check-in with Adrian and Jen		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
7/21/2022	New construction redesign call		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
7/22/2022	Final 2023 Evaluation Plan text review and mark up		1.00			1.00	0.00	
7/22/2022	Plan review edits and comments to Craig		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
7/25/2022	Initial review of BCR pivot tables		0.25			0.25	0.00	
7/25/2022	BCR model discuss with G. Reed		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
7/26/2022	2023 C&I plan text review		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
7/27/2022	Review MA HPWH PPT with G. Reed, sharing plans with RI, follow up.		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
	Call w/Richard re: applying MA HPWH research and recommendations to RI		0.50			0.50	0.00	
	RI HPWH coordination with G. Reed		0.50			0.50 0.25		
	Sharing MA HPWH update recommendations 2023 plan review		0.25 3.50			3.50	0.00	
1/29/2022	2025 pian review		3.50			0.00		
	Total Hours	0.00	33.75	0.00	0.00	33.75		
	Total Amount	\$0.00			\$0.00			\$6,682.50

# Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc. 4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

### **INVOICE**

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: CEI RI 7-2022
Invoice Date: July 31, 2022
OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description	Amount		
Services Performed 07/01/2022 thi			
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 6.00 0.00	Hourly Rate \$186.00 \$93.00	Amount Due \$1,116.00 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form	for details.)		\$0.00

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$1,116.00

### Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc. Services Performed 07/01/2022 through 07/31/2022

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
	Reviewed March data report; prepared for and participated in Res							
7/7/22	Sector Team meeting		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
	Conducted initial review of 2023 Res and IES draft plan materials		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
	Met w/other Res C-Team members to discuss initial findings from							
7/19/2022	plan review		1.00	·		1.00	0.00	1.00
7/21/2022	Finished comments on 2023 plan draft		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
7/26/2022	Prepared for 7.28 EERMC meeting		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
7/28/2022	Presented 2023 plan res initial findings at EERMC meeting		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	6.00	0.00	0.00	6.00	0.00	6.00
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$1,116.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,116.00	0.00	\$1,116.00

### Ralph Prahl 7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

### **INVOICE**

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: 30
Invoice Date: July 31, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of	Amount		
Services Performed 07/01/22 through			
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 8.75 0.00	Hourly Rate \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$1,732.50 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form fo	\$0.00		

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$1,732.50

#### Ralph Prahl

#### Services performed 07/01/22 through 07/31/22

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
7/7/2022	C&I custom electric impact eval		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
7/13/2022	2023 plan; NRNC baseline res plan; latest study tracker		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
7/15/2022	NRNC baseline res plan; Custom electric sampling plan		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
7/16/2022	C&I custom impact sampling plan, annual EM&V plan		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
7/17/2022	2023 EM&V plan		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
7/18/2022	2023 plan		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
7/19/2022	annual plan		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
7/22/2022	annual plan		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
7/26/2022	2023 EM&V plan; mtg prep		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
7/27/2022	study tracker; check-in call		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	8.75	0.00	0.00	8.75		8.75
	Total Amount	\$1,732.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,732.50	0.00	\$1,732.50

Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo

JLC Consulting, LLC 52 Bent Creek Road Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: R-22.04
Invoice Date: July 31, 2022
OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Servi	Amount		
Services Performed 7/1/22 through 7/31/2			
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 12.25 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$2,425.50 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for details)	tails.)		\$0.00

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$2,425.50

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
7/6/22	Review materials, prep for monthly call		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
7/7/2022	Monthly C&I call		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
7/14/2022	2023 Plan review		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
7/18/2022	2023 Plan Review and comments to OEI		2.00			2.00	0.00	2.00
7/18/2022	2023 Plan and BCR Review and comments to OEI		3.75			3.75	0.00	3.75
7/25/2022	Data and annual plan rvw		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
7/26/2022	2023 Plan review and comments		3.25			3.25	0.00	3.25
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	12.25	0.00	0.00	12.25	0.00	12.25
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$2,425.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,425.50	0.00	\$2,425.50

# Rachel Sholly Energy Consulting 48 Hudson St. Providence, RI 02909

**INVOICE** 

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461

Invoice Number: Invoice Date:

55 July 31, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for National Grid USA Service Company

Description of	Amount		
Services Performed 07/01/22 through			
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Admin Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 20.50 4.00 0.00	Hourly Rate \$155.00 \$80.00 \$77.50	Amount Due \$3,177.50 \$320.00 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form f	for details.)		\$0.00

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$3,497.50

Date	Description of Services	006-03 Education Initiative	009-01 Meeting Attendance	009-02 Develop Materials	009-03 Other Council Responsibilitie s	010 - Research, Analysis & Council Support	011 - Admin	Travel	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Sub-Total Admin Hrs.	Total Hours
07/01/22	CEA mtg follow-up - responded to Councilor H. Oakley email		0.25						0.25		0.00	0.25
07/05/22	Final Annual Report readthrough & typo clean-up, sent to OER; Posted final Annual Report to all locations on website; updated homepage sliders, updated about page, updated education content; Reviewed K-12 RFPs & contract and summarized costs to inform 2023 budget; Emailed D&S re: videos timeline; Emailed S. Chybowski (OER) re: edu proposals received	1.00			2.00		2.00		3.00		2.00	5.00
	Annual Report printing quotes; Researching event locations for	1.00			2.00	<u>'</u>	2.00		0.00		2.00	0.00
	Public Forum & fall CEA mtg; Researched & drafted 2023 edu budget item descriptions	2.50			0.75	5			3.25		0.00	3.25
	2023 budget descriptions, CEA follow-ups; CEA mtg notes -											
	Reviewed, cleaned up, pulled out follow-ups, sent to C-team	0.25	1.00						1.25		0.00	1.25
07/08/22	2023 budget descriptions	1.00							1.00		0.00	1.00
07/12/22	Reviewed proposals & process, communications w/S. Chybowski (OER); Updated 2023 edu budget descriptions; Correspondence w/D&S re: video storyboards; Correspondence w/GBRI & RIC re: workshop logistics; Updated 2023 edu budget descriptions 2023 budget descriptions; Check in w/S. Chybowski (OER) & A. Caesar (C-Team) re: edu efforts; Drafted & sent july edu mtg	3.00							3.00		0.00	3.00
07/14/22	agenda for internal review; Emailed edu group re: scheduling; Sent draft 2023 budget descriptions to edu group; Correspondence w/RIC re: event space Updated C-Team quarterly activities reporting format & included	2.75							2.75		0.00	2.75
07/15/22	Q2 updates						2.00		0.00		2.00	2.00
	Reviewed OER's June edu minutes; Correspondence w/OER & C- Team re: prep for council & edu mtgs	0.50					2.00		0.50		0.00	0.50
07/19/22	Edu mtg prep - finalized agenda, drafted email to group, correspondence w/OER	0.50							0.50		0.00	0.50
	Edu mtg prep	0.50							0.50		0.00	0.50
07/21/22	CEA follow-ups; Edu mtg prep, correspondence w/S. Chybowski (OER); Mtg w/D&S re: videos	2.25	0.25						2.50		0.00	2.50
07/22/22	Edu mtg, incl prep	2.00							2.00		0.00	2.00
	Total Hours	16.25	1.50	0.00	2.75	0.00	4.00	0.00	20.50	0.00	4.00	24.50
	Total Amount	\$2,518.75	\$232.50	\$0.00	\$426.25	\$0.00	\$320.00	\$0.00	\$3,177.50	\$0.00	\$320.00	\$3,497.50

REGINE PRINTING CO., INC 208 LAUREL HILL AVENUE PROVIDENCE, RI 02909 401-943-3404 Fax 401-944-1228

# Invoice

Date	Invoice No.
08/18/22	34217

Bill To:
RI EERMC
c/o Steven Chybowski
RI Office of Energy Resources
One Capitol Hill
Providence RI 02908

Ship To		

P.O. Number	Ship Via	Terms	Our job #
		Net 15	34217

Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Amount
100	Annual Reports		1,695.00
	Exempt		0.00
		Total	\$1,695.00

#### INVOICE Federal Tax ID# 03-0351557



Remit checks to: Optimal Energy, Inc. PO Box 74008680 Chicago, IL 60674-8680

# Remit ACH transfer to: ABA Routing Number 063100277 Account Number 898052466590 Email ACH/Wire remittance details to RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com

Remit Wire Transfers to: ABA Routing Number 026009593 Account Number 898052466590 Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N

August 31, 2022

Project No:

863221-0007465.00

Invoice No:

000000294118

Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources

Professional Services from August 1, 2022 to August 31, 2022

**Total Additional Fees** 

Phase 005 EERMC Intern

**Additional Fees** 

Steven Chybowski

Monthly Intern Fee (Aug 2022)

3,000.00

3,000.00 3,000.00

**Total this Phase** 

\$3,000.00

Phase 006 EE Program Planning & Implementation

Task 01 Council Representation

**Professional Personnel** 

	Hours	Rate	Amount
Johnson, Craig	2.25	186.00	418.50
Ross, Samuel	1.25	198.00	247.50
Totals	3.50		666.00

Total Labor 666.00

Total this Task \$666.00

Task 02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Develop

**Professional Personnel** 

	Hours	Rate	Amount
Caesar, Adrian	62.00	135.00	8,370.00
Johnson, Craig	57.75	186.00	10,741.50
McDonald, Clifford	17.25	198.00	3,415.50
Ross, Samuel	24.75	198.00	4,900.50
Totals	161.75		27,427.50

Total Labor 27,427.50

**Consultants** 

Core Energy Insights Inc.372.00EcoMetric Consulting, LLC1,576.50Energy Futures Group, Inc.3,217.50Ralph Prahl2,574.00

Total Consultants 7,740.00 7,740.00

**Total this Task** 

\$35,167.50

				Total this	Phase	\$11,513.25
				Total th	is Task	\$930.00
Rachel S		nsultants			930.00 <b>930.00</b>	930.00
Task <b>Consultants</b>	03 <b>s</b>	Other Council Responsib	oilities			
				Total th 	is Task 	\$9,213.75 -
	Total Cor	nsultants			232.50	232.50
Rachel S	•				232.50	
Consultants	s					
		OUT				8,981.25
	Totals <b>Total Lab</b>	or	52.50		8,981.25	8,981.25
Ross, Sa			12.25 52.50	198.00	2,425.50 8 081 35	
Johnson,	· -		22.00	186.00	4,092.00	
Caesar,			18.25	135.00	2,463.75	
C	۸ مارینی		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Professiona	al Personnel					
Task	02	Develop Technical Mate	rials			
				Total th		\$1,369.50
raciici 3	Total Cor	nsultants			<b>232.50</b>	232.50
Rachel S					232.50	
Consultants						,
	Total Lab	or	0.50		1,107.00	1,137.00
. 1000, 00	Totals		6.50	150.00	1,137.00	
Ross, Sa	· -		2.50	198.00	495.00	
Johnson			2.00	186.00	372.00	
Caesar, i	Adrian		2.00	135.00	<b>Amount</b> 270.00	
rrotessiona	al Personnel		Hours	Rate	Amarint	
Task Drofossions	01	Meeting Attendance				
			95 & Flatell			
<b></b> Phase	009	Council Sponsored Meet	ings & Materia	– – – – – als		
				rotal tills	i iiase	φ <del>-1</del> 1,031.00
				Total this	Phase	\$41,631.00
				Total th	•	\$5,797.50
. acrici o	Total Cor	nsultants			<b>5,696.25</b>	5,696.25
Rachel S					5,696.25	
Consultants	s					
	Total Lab	or	-/ -		<b></b>	101.25
Sucsui, I	Totals		.75	100.00	101.25	
Caesar, A	Adrian		.75	135.00	101.25	
1 1 01 C33 O I I I	ai r Gi 30iiiiCl		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Task <b>Professiona</b>	al Personnel	Education Initiatives				
Tack	03	Education Initiatives				
エー・レ	00	The second section of the first section of				

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island	EERMC - 2022		Invoice	000000294118
<del></del> Phase	010	Research, Analy	sis & Oth Council S	upport		
Profession	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar	, Adrian		.25	135.00	33.75	
Johnso	n, Craig		2.50	186.00	465.00	
Ross, S	Samuel		.50	198.00	99.00	
	Totals		3.25		597.75	
	Total Labor					597.75
Consultan	ts					
Rachel	Sholly				1,240.00	
	Total Consu	ltants			1,240.00	1,240.00
				Total th	is Phase	\$1,837.75
<b>– – – –</b> Phase	011	Administrative				
Profession	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
	, Adrian		.50		67.50	
Johnso	n, Craig		.50		93.00	
	Totals		1.00		160.50	
	Total Labor					160.50
Consultan	ts					
Rachel	Sholly				320.00	
	Total Consu	ltants			320.00	320.00
				Total th	is Phase	\$480.50
Billing Lim	nits		Current	Prior	To-Date	
Total B			58,462.50	322,241.50	380,704.00	
Lin	-			,	952,976.00	
Re	maining				572,272.00	
				Total this	Invoice	\$58,462.50
Billings To	Date					
		Current	Prior	Total		
Labor		39,071.25	246,322.25	285,393.50		
Consul		16,391.25	60,919.25	77,310.50		
Add-on		3,000.00	15,000.00	18,000.00		
Totals		58,462.50	322,241.50	380,704.00		

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	000000294118
Billing	Backup				Sunday, Oc	tober 9, 2022
NV5, Inc.	'	Invoice 00	00000294118 [	Dated 8/31/2022	•	9:11:12 PM
			T			
Phase — — — — —	006	EE Program Planning &	Implementation	on -		
Task	01	Council Representation				
Professiona	al Personnel		Harrina	Data	A	
Johnson, Cra	aia	8/23/2022	<b>Hours</b> 1.25	<b>Rate</b> 186.00	<b>Amount</b> 232.50	
John John, Cre	=	n OER and RI Energy. De			232.30	
	items for meeting prep		1.00	105.00	106.00	
Johnson, Cra	aig Attend EE TWG meetin	8/25/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
Ross, Samue		9. 8/1/2022	1.25	198.00	247.50	
•	Check in call with OER	re: plan review progress a; prep & follow ups re:	s, initial flags, n			
	Totals		3.50		666.00	446.55
	Total Labor					666.00
				Total this	s Task	\$666.00
<b></b> Task	02	Implementation Oversig	 ght & Plan Dev	_ <b></b> elop		
Professiona	al Personnel			•		
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adri		8/2/2022	3.50	135.00	472.50	
	lighting and controls Af	n call, prep, and notetak ML inquiry; 2023 Plan da to 2022 BCR model, cost	ta analysis and	l questions -		
Caesar, Adria		8/3/2022	3.00	135.00	405.00	
	comps for occupancy significant comps for occupancy significan	ls AML inquiry - lighting ensors and NLCs; 2023 F re mapping to 2022 BCR s-jurisdictional measure ersight tracker review - 0	Plan data analy model, cost in TRC analysis; u	sis and creases and updated		
Caesar, Adri		8/4/2022	5.25	135.00	708.75	
	2023 Plan data analysis	Is AML - lighting controls and questions - C&I me ses and CTA assumption	easure mappin	g to 2022		
Caesar, Adria	•	8/5/2022	6.50	135.00	877.50	
	BCR model, cost increa characterization report	s and questions - C&I me ses and CTA assumption review for inclusion in 20 d NTG measure level cor opment	ns; C&I lighting 023 Plan; EM&	market V study		
Caesar, Adri		8/8/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	C&I Lighting Market ch program performance of	aracterization full report data review C&I sector	and results rev	view; Q2		

accar Adri		Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	000000294118
aesar, Adri	ian	8/9/2022	3.75	135.00	506.25	
	RI Energy Q2 Report and analysis - measure and & RI Energy Equity commi- mtg. agenda developme	end use/program cost co tments updates and com	mparisons an	d modeling;		
aesar, Adri	ian	8/10/2022	4.00	135.00	540.00	
	Cross-sector EMV call - 7 - MA and RI BCM comps development and update review; 2023 Plan BCR N cost comparisons and m	for cost benchmarking, es; RI Energy Q2 Report lodel analysis - measure odeling	2023 plan inp and quarterly	out data		
aesar, Adri		8/15/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	RI Equity Working Group	=	_			
aesar, Adri		8/16/2022	5.50	135.00	742.50	
	July Res/C&I RI data repreport review, RICG PY2 study tracker updates					
aesar, Adri	ian	8/17/2022	1.50	135.00	202.50	
	Updated C&I Lighting Manual AML results review and ISP comments finalization RR results adjustment	ecommendations for 202	23 Plan input;	Cannabis		
aesar, Adri		8/18/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
	Detailed C&I Q2/July dameasures, custom lighting					
aesar, Adri	ian	8/19/2022	2.75	135.00	371.25	
	cross jurisdictional comp customer economics, RI program comments, 202 documentation; Lighting C&I Lighting Call - lightin data, 2023 Planning, NL assumptions and comps	Energy deep dive on cos 3 Plan comments and co Market characterization ng control measure lives, C program highlights fror	sts follow up; orresponding a study discuss performance m IL; Incentiv	OER HP analysis sion; August lighting		
aesar, Adri	ian	8/22/2022	1.75	135.00	236.25	
	August EM&V call agend comps to historical meas		rofit TRC anal	•		
aesar, Adri	ian Cross Sector C&I call and evaluation - full report re Energy equity commitme based on EWG recomme	eview; August full EWG nents and updates, new ed	neeting - revi	ew of RI	236.25	
aesar, Adri		8/25/2022	5.25	135.00	708.75	
	August Technical Workir database and measure li analysis - planned and a 2023 Plan cost analysis; tool development; Septe development	fe/NTG/RR inputs; updat ctual measure costs; RI I C&I measure mapping a	ted 2023 Plan Energy inflation nd NTG/CTA	cost on adjusted analysis		
aesar, Adri	ian	8/26/2022	4.00	135.00	540.00	
	2022 YTD program savir 2021 actuals and 2023 p sector team meeting age HVAC, and envelope dat	lan; C&I sector team cod	ordination - S rmance lighti	eptember ng, SBS		
	assumptions correspond					

Project	863221-0007465.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 202	22		Invoice	000000294118
	MA 2022-2024 C&I Non-energy impact values for po 2023 Plan; 2023 Plan cost assumptions/analysis - SN NC; PY2020 CustGas impact evaluation - final results	ИВ, Gas r	etrofit, C&I		
Caesar, Ad	Irian 8/30/2022	1.50	135.00	202.50	
	2023 Plan second draft prep - cost assumptions and Team Plan data and narrative questions; follow-up of program costs and supporting analysis;				
Caesar, Ad	Irian 8/31/2022	5.25	135.00	708.75	
	2023 Plan BCR model to actual data mapping; C&I d workbook development - measure category list and measures - SBS, Ret, NC programs; OER HHPP prog 2023 YTD C&I data review - program performance, installed measures review, updated InDemand meas program	mapping ram desig top savin	to installed gn review; g projects,		
Johnson, C	Craig 8/1/2022	2.00	186.00	372.00	
	Continue review of residential and income eligible prinputs, and work on finalizing list of quantitative que				
Johnson, C		3.50	186.00	651.00	
	Check-in with Sam on annual plan review - discussed for next week, including quantitative review on cost GECA and Acadia Center comments on first draft of submitted comments on first draft of plan.	assumpti	ons. Review		
Johnson, C	Craig 8/3/2022	2.25	186.00	418.50	
	2023 Plan Review - review changes in non-incentive identify large deviations for C&I electric and gas pro related questions. Review TRM and BC Model compa inconsistencies.	grams. D	evelop	697.50	
Johnson, (	August Res Sector Team Call - Prep for meeting, inc data report and commitments tracker. Lead meeting which was largely focused on program updates thro Discussion with Sam and Adrian re: quantitative data compiling of questions to submit to RI Energy. Revie and questions on first draft of plan.	luding rev with stalugh Q2. A review a	view of June keholders, Annual Plan - and		
Johnson, C	Craig 8/5/2022	3.75	186.00	697.50	
	2023 Plan Review - Finish residential sector quantita and address Sam comments re: quantitative questio measure input sheets in electric BC model, compare and develop questions on variations identified.	ns. Revie	w non-		
Johnson, C	Craig 8/8/2022	2.50	186.00	465.00	
	2023 Plan Review - Analysis on weatherization cost a incresase in income eligible cost assumptions.	assumptio	ons and		
Johnson, C		4.50	186.00	837.00	
	Review RI Energy Q2 Report. Review included review and setting up a review memo that also included pri determination of success. Develop comments on equ Plan Review - Analysis on income eligible multifamily project and gas HVAC counterfactual.	or activiti uity updat	es as well as tes. 2023		
Johnson, C	<del>-</del>	4.00	186.00	744.00	
	Review and provide detailed comments on 2022 equ report. Analysis on res HVAC counterfactuals to infor content for August council meeting. Analysis on non-spending to inform presentation content.	rm preser	ntation		
Johnson, C	Craig 8/11/2022	4.50	186.00	837.00	
	Annual Plan - Review RI vs MA TRC comps for select Develop new analytical charts for quarterly program savings and spending to goal by program. Used to h Q2 update presentation to Council.	updates	that tracks		

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC - 2	2022		Invoice	000000294118
lohnson, C	raig	8/12/2022	2.00	186.00	372.00	
	Q2 program data review and forecast charts, and					
lohnson, C	raig	8/15/2022	2.25	186.00	418.50	
	Sector team - coordination check-in. Review Q2 reports commitments tracker for	ort and conduct cross-che residential commitments	eck analysis	with		
lohnson, C	=	8/18/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
	Annual Plan Review - Dis benchmarking analysis ir	prep for second draft pl		ns for		
Iohnson, C	raig	8/19/2022	2.50	186.00	465.00	
	Call with Sam and Adriar over next couple weeks. how they are/aren't addr customer economics for water equipment. Review brainstorming new/addit data presentation.	Discussed document to t ressed in next iteration of incentivizing gas vs. elect v notes from Council mee	rack our con plan, analys ric heating a ting, and be	nments and sis on and hot egin		
lohnson, C		8/22/2022	2.50	186.00	465.00	
	Monthly check-in with Ma				103.00	
	upcoming sector team m from Councilor Case with Review - begin analysis of heating and hot water ed	data on costs from RI E of customer economics fo	nergy. Annu	al Plan		
Iohnson, C	raig	8/23/2022	3.75	186.00	697.50	
	Sector Team - Review Ju draft review prep - work aid in final draft plan rev	on setting up tracker of				
lohnson, C	raig	8/24/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
	Sector Team - Continue	review July residential pro	ogram data.			
lohnson, C		8/25/2022	5.25	186.00	976.50	
	Debrief TWG meeting wi reporting and cost assum - review cost data provid Continued review and an portfolio and comparison and actuals to help inform with RI Energy. Sector T topics and materials for S	nptions review of 2023 Pled by RI Energy on weat alysis on measure level of of non-incentive costs am talking points for Counceam Work - begin developement of the country of the counce of the country o	an. Annual Pherization consts in the recrease prior pilor Case disping meeting	Plan Analysis osts. esidential lan year scussion g agenda		
lohnson, C	raig	8/29/2022	2.00	186.00	372.00	
	Res Sector Team - Continuity distribute residential sector brainstorming potential review - check-in with Control responses from RI Energy Adrian.	or team agenda for Sept neeting topics for meetin liff on rate and bill impac	ember meet gs in Q4. An t model revi	ing. Begin nual Plan ew. Review		
lohnson, C	raig	8/30/2022	1.75	186.00	325.50	
<b>, -</b>	Annual Plan - review Clift models review. Finalize a session with Adrian to re discuss second draft revi re: time to check-in and	s summary of findings find distribute memo to R view C&I cost updates fro ew prep. Sector Teams -	rom rate and I Energy tea om RI Energ Coordinate	d bill impact m. Working ly, and with Richard		
lohnson, C		8/31/2022	3.25	186.00	604.50	
	·· ~9	3,31,2022	3.23	100.00	00 1.50	

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	000000294118
		ed measure mapping for (				
		eing available in the BC I				
		ork - monthly check-in w				
		or team meeting, update at will be needed to strat				
		of the potentially available				
		notes from check-in wit				
		ollow up responses relate				
		odate on a proposed fuel				
		ponses to C-Team BC mo a follow-up item on resp				
		equity commitment upda		iciloi Oakiey		
1cDonald,	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	8/17/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
,		te and bill impact analysis				
1cDonald,		8/18/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
ice oriala,	rate and bill impact mod		1.50	150.00	237100	
1cDonald,	•	8/23/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
,	Initial look at rate and b		2.00	200.00	250.00	
1cDonald,		8/24/2022	4.00	198.00	792.00	
		nalysis - review tool logic			, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	
	years to-do lists	, 5.5 TOTICH COOL TO GIC	, shook again	promodo		
1cDonald,	•	8/25/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
,		ite and bill impacts, sum				
	fuels	, ,				
1cDonald,	Clifford	8/29/2022	4.00	198.00	792.00	
	Rate and bill impact ana	lysis, write up, send out				
1cDonald,	Clifford	8/30/2022	3.25	198.00	643.50	
	Comparison for total bill	impacts				
loss, Samı	uel	8/1/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	SRP check in corresp.					
loss, Samı	uel	8/2/2022	2.25	198.00	445.50	
		In re: plan review, next s				
		; download w/C Johnson				
		s on plan review for week r final by Fri 8/5; MPS Qu				
occ Sami	<u> </u>	8/4/2022	1.50	198.00	207.00	
loss, Samı		-, , -			297.00	
		ext steps confirmation, re cus areas, incl. measure/r				
	leveraging mapping; SRI		ricusure ieve	a d'elles		
loss, Samı		8/5/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
		quant checks; review che				
		e comments re: same; di				
	review updated quant Q	list, finalize and submit	to RIE			
loss, Samı	uel	8/9/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
		rt w/focus on equity; RIE				
		r expected developments	s btwn now a	and final		
	draft plan	0/10/2022	2.00	100.00	205.00	
Ross, Samı		8/10/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
		report, assessment of fur	nd balance u	paate;		
) occ   Car	docket prep call and pre		4.00	100.00	702.00	
Ross, Samı		8/11/2022	4.00	198.00	792.00	
		comments on equity com				
	(completed 9 of 14 com	text comments and add n mitments)	ny own pers	DECTIVE		
) C		8/12/2022	4.00	198.00	792.00	
tass Sami	a Ci	0/ 12/ 2022			, ,2.00	
Ross, Samı	continued detailed review	w and comments on equi	ty commitme	ents memo		

Project						
	863221-000746	5.00 Rhode Island EERMO	C - 2022		Invoice	00000029411
Ross, Samu		8/17/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
		all, preparation re: same incl.		alking		
Ross, Samu	•	eview of RIE council materials 8/18/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
NUSS, Saiilu		6/16/2022 th, follow up on 1-on-1 with (		190.00	297.00	
Ross, Samu		8/19/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
555, 5amu		ERMC meeting; framing out a			550.00	
	workstreams over	r coming weeks before final d				
	w/Councilor Case	re: same				
	Totals		161.75		27,427.50	
	Total La	abor				27,427.50
				Total th	is Task	\$35,167.50
<b>– – – –</b> Task	 03	– – – – – – – – Education Initiatives				
	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adr	ian	8/24/2022	.75	135.00	101.25	
/		development/updates and re				
	Totals		.75		101.25	
	Total La	abor				101.25
				Total th	is Task	\$5,797.50
				Total this	s Phase	\$41,631.00
Phase	009	Council Sponsored Mee	etings & Materia	als		
		Council Sponsored Mee Meeting Attendance	etings & Materia	als		
Task			etings & Materia	als		
Task	01		etings & Materia	als	Amount	
Task Profession	01 nal Personnel				<b>Amount</b> 270.00	
Task Profession	01 nal Personnel	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022	Hours			
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Me	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022	Hours			
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr	01  nal Personnel  ian  August EERMC Maraig  Attend and preser	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for A	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting.	270.00 372.00	
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr	01  nal Personnel  ian  August EERMC Maraig  Attend and presentel	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50	Rate 135.00 186.00	270.00	
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review ma	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for A	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting.	270.00 372.00 495.00	
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review ma	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022 eterials prior to Aug EERMC n	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting.	270.00 372.00	1 127 00
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review ma	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022 eterials prior to Aug EERMC n	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting.	270.00 372.00 495.00	1,137.00
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review ma	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022 eterials prior to Aug EERMC n	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting. 198.00	270.00 372.00 495.00 1,137.00	·
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review ma	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022 eterials prior to Aug EERMC n	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting.	270.00 372.00 495.00 1,137.00	1,137.00
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr  Ross, Samu	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review ma	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022 eterials prior to Aug EERMC n	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50 atg 6.50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting. 198.00	270.00 372.00 495.00 1,137.00	·
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr  Ross, Samu	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review ma Totals Total La	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022 aterials prior to Aug EERMC n	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50 atg 6.50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting. 198.00	270.00 372.00 495.00 1,137.00	·
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr  Ross, Samu	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review ma Totals Total La	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022 aterials prior to Aug EERMC n	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50 atg 6.50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting. 198.00	270.00 372.00 495.00 1,137.00	·
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr  Ross, Samu  Task  Profession	o1 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review ma Totals Total La	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting  8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022 aterials prior to Aug EERMC n	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50 atg 6.50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting. 198.00	270.00  372.00  495.00  1,137.00	·
Task  Profession  Caesar, Adr  Johnson, Cr  Ross, Samu  Task  Profession	olinal Personnel  rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and presentel attend, review maratends Totals Total La	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting 8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for A 8/18/2022 aterials prior to Aug EERMC n  abor  Develop Technical Mat  8/4/2022 tg. materials development - E	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50 ntg 6.50  erials  Hours .75 EERMC branding	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting. 198.00  Total th Rate 135.00	270.00  372.00  495.00  1,137.00  iis Task  ——————	·
Caesar, Adr Johnson, Cr Ross, Samu	01 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and preservel attend, review marated attend, review marated attend atten	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting 8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for A 8/18/2022 aterials prior to Aug EERMC n  abor  Develop Technical Mat	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50 ntg 6.50  erials  Hours .75 EERMC branding	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting. 198.00  Total th Rate 135.00	270.00  372.00  495.00  1,137.00  iis Task  ——————	·
Task Profession Caesar, Adr Johnson, Cr Ross, Samu  Task Profession Caesar, Adr	o1 nal Personnel rian August EERMC Meraig Attend and preservel attend, review maratend Totals Total La  O2 nal Personnel rian August EERMC meropy presentation	Meeting Attendance  8/18/2022 eeting 8/18/2022 nt on technical materials for / 8/18/2022 aterials prior to Aug EERMC n  abor  Develop Technical Mat  8/4/2022 tg. materials development - Eation, BCR model and Plan up	Hours 2.00 2.00 August Council 2.50 atg 6.50  Hours .75 EERMC branding dates .50	Rate 135.00 186.00 meeting. 198.00  Total th  Rate 135.00 g proposal, 135.00	270.00  372.00  495.00  1,137.00  iis Task  ——————  Amount  101.25	·

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	000000294118
Caesar, Adri	an	8/9/2022	1.75	135.00	236.25	
	2023 Plan update preser development	ntation development; Q2	2022 present	ation		
aesar, Adri	an	8/10/2022	3.00	135.00	405.00	
	2023 Plan update preser development	ntation development; Q2	2022 present	ation		
aesar, Adri	an	8/11/2022	6.50	135.00	877.50	
		ntation development; Q2 mmitments and enhance				
aesar, Adri	an	8/12/2022	2.75	135.00	371.25	
		ntation finalization; Q2 20 mitments and enhanceme				
aesar, Adri	an	8/17/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
		ation and materials prep n, C-Team Equity commit				
Caesar, Adri	an	8/18/2022	1.75	135.00	236.25	
	Plan update presentation	ation and meeting prep - n, C-Team Equity commit n efforts and handbook u	ments and up			
ohnson, Cr	aig	8/4/2022	.75	186.00	139.50	
ohnson, Cra	topics and meeting mate presentation and coordinates	team about August coun erials development. Brain nate with RI Energy re: c 8/5/2022	storm outline	for Q2	325.50	
omison, cr	Begin outlining content	or 2023 First Draft Plan   3 First Draft Plan update	oresentation.	Work on	323.30	
ohnson, Cra	aig	8/8/2022	2.25	186.00	418.50	
	developing content for r weatherization cost assu	ials for 2023 Plan presen esidential programs revie imptions, increases in inc dditional content for coul	w, including of ome eligible of	content on cost		
ohnson, Cra	aig	8/9/2022	3.25	186.00	604.50	
	2023 plan presentation. presentation. Focus on o	r August Council meeting Develop technical materi developing content for ind d gas HVAC counterfactu	als for 2023 F come eligible	Plan		
ohnson, Cr	aig	8/10/2022	2.25	186.00	418.50	
	Working sessions to revi plan and 2022 Q2 updat	am and Jesse on council rew and iterate on developes. Develop content for 2 content, and portfolio cordatabase review.	ped content f 2023 Plan dec	or 2023 k, focused		
ohnson, Cr	_	8/11/2022	2.75	186.00	511.50	
	portfolio slides based on	Plan update presentation. feedback received durin rian to develop slide cont	g working ses	sion.		
	aig	8/12/2022	3.00	186.00	558.00	
ohnson, Cra						
ohnson, Cra		s, including 2023 Plan up o on C-Team comments o eview and polish of both	n RI Energy 6	equity		

Project	863221-0007465	.00 Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	00000029
		gh August council materials wi				
		materials to OER for distributi nitment update, provide comn				
	Sam for review.	memoric apacto, provide comi	nenes ana rec	aback to		
Johnson, Cra	aig	8/16/2022	.75	186.00	139.50	
	Council meeting pr	ep, including finalizing equity	commitment	update		
		more minor updates to the e	equity update	memo		
	·	same for final review.				
Johnson, Cra	_	8/17/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
	Review and discuss	e for presentation assignment s RIE 2023 plan update prese		meeting.		
Johnson, Cra	_	8/18/2022	3.00	186.00	558.00	
	Energy presentation training and public memos, 2022 tenta allocation plan pro	eting prep - review technical r n on 2023 plan development, education events and outread ative meeting topics calendar, posal. Prepare talking points f	2022 K-12 cu ch recommend and OER RG	ırriculum dation GI 2022-B		
Pocc Camur	plan update preser		1 00	100 00	100.00	
Ross, Samue		8/5/2022 da, confirm assignments and t	1.00	198.00 cific C-Team	198.00	
	responsibilities, sha	are same w/Team incl. leverage hnical presentation on EE Plai	ging quant rev			
Ross, Samue		8/9/2022	.75	198.00	148.50	
		levelopment/task assignments E, equity commitments review				
Ross, Samue	=	8/10/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
		ncil materials, slide dev/review tual analysis, and guidance or				
Ross, Samue	el	8/12/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
	deck and 2023 dec	review and refine slides, gam k, w/focus on incorporating e slides re: same, final walk thr	quity content	after review		
Ross, Samue	el	8/16/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
·		nalization of Council materials	, review same	e; assign		
Ross, Samue	el	8/17/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
-		ilors Case and AnderBois, prep				
Ross, Samue	el	8/18/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
		, share with Councilors Case a	and AnderBois	s; finalize		
	equity memo, ensu	ire posting				
	Totals	_	52.50		8,981.25	
	Total La	bor				8,981.25
				Total thi	s Task	\$9,213.75
Task	03	Other Council Responsib	ilities			
				Total thi	s Task	\$930.00
				Total this	Phase	\$11,513.25
<b></b> Phase	010	Research, Analysis & Oth	 n Council Sun			
		, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	- · P1			

Project 8	863221-0007465.	00 Rhode Island EERM	C - 2022		Invoice	00000029411
Professional P	ersonnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adrian		8/25/2022	.25	135.00	33.75	
	otes for PGC on C alysis	&I retrofit actual-plan mea	sure mapping a	nd inflation		
Johnson, Craig	,	8/23/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
Re	view draft EERM	C 2023 Budget, coordinate	with Steve re:	same.		
Johnson, Craig		8/25/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
		ormation re: updates to Encor certain HVAC measures.	ergy Star and D	OE		
Johnson, Craig		8/31/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
COI		R's proposed HHHP progra ian's comments. Compile c				
Ross, Samuel		8/11/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
Co	uncil handbook f	ollow up & update corresp.	w/RSholly			
	Totals		3.25		597.75	
	Total Lab	or				597.75
				Total this	Phase	\$1,837.75
Phase	011	Administrative				
Professional P	ersonnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adrian		8/10/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
СТ	eam Q2 activities	report development				
Johnson, Craig		8/30/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
	eck-in meeting w RI Energy Fellow	vith Jesse regarding update position.	es to his ability t	o continue		
	Totals		1.00		160.50	
	Total Lab	oor				160.50
				Total this	Phase	\$480.50
				Total this I	Project	\$55,462.50
				Total this	Report	\$55,462.50

# Rachel Sholly Energy Consulting 48 Hudson St. Providence, RI 02909

**INVOICE** 

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461

Invoice Number: Invoice Date:

55 July 31, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for National Grid USA Service Company

Description of	Amount						
Services Performed 07/01/22 through 7/31/22							
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Admin Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 20.50 4.00 0.00	Hourly Rate \$155.00 \$80.00 \$77.50	Amount Due \$3,177.50 \$320.00 \$0.00				
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form f	for details.)		\$0.00				

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$3,497.50

Date	Description of Services	006-03 Education Initiative	009-01 Meeting Attendance	009-02 Develop Materials	009-03 Other Council Responsibilitie s	010 - Research, Analysis & Council Support	011 - Admin	Travel	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Sub-Total Admin Hrs.	Total Hours
07/01/22	CEA mtg follow-up - responded to Councilor H. Oakley email		0.25						0.25		0.00	0.25
07/05/22	Final Annual Report readthrough & typo clean-up, sent to OER; Posted final Annual Report to all locations on website; updated homepage sliders, updated about page, updated education content; Reviewed K-12 RFPs & contract and summarized costs to inform 2023 budget; Emailed D&S re: videos timeline; Emailed S. Chybowski (OER) re: edu proposals received	1.00			2.00		2.00		3.00		2.00	5.00
	Annual Report printing quotes; Researching event locations for	1.00			2.00	<u>'</u>	2.00		0.00		2.00	0.00
	Public Forum & fall CEA mtg; Researched & drafted 2023 edu budget item descriptions	2.50			0.75	5			3.25		0.00	3.25
	2023 budget descriptions, CEA follow-ups; CEA mtg notes -											
	Reviewed, cleaned up, pulled out follow-ups, sent to C-team	0.25	1.00						1.25		0.00	1.25
07/08/22	2023 budget descriptions	1.00							1.00		0.00	1.00
07/12/22	Reviewed proposals & process, communications w/S. Chybowski (OER); Updated 2023 edu budget descriptions; Correspondence w/D&S re: video storyboards; Correspondence w/GBRI & RIC re: workshop logistics; Updated 2023 edu budget descriptions 2023 budget descriptions; Check in w/S. Chybowski (OER) & A. Caesar (C-Team) re: edu efforts; Drafted & sent july edu mtg	3.00							3.00		0.00	3.00
07/14/22	agenda for internal review; Emailed edu group re: scheduling; Sent draft 2023 budget descriptions to edu group; Correspondence w/RIC re: event space Updated C-Team quarterly activities reporting format & included	2.75							2.75		0.00	2.75
07/15/22	Q2 updates						2.00		0.00		2.00	2.00
	Reviewed OER's June edu minutes; Correspondence w/OER & C- Team re: prep for council & edu mtgs	0.50					2.00		0.50		0.00	0.50
07/19/22	Edu mtg prep - finalized agenda, drafted email to group, correspondence w/OER	0.50							0.50		0.00	0.50
	Edu mtg prep	0.50							0.50		0.00	0.50
07/21/22	CEA follow-ups; Edu mtg prep, correspondence w/S. Chybowski (OER); Mtg w/D&S re: videos	2.25	0.25						2.50		0.00	2.50
07/22/22	Edu mtg, incl prep	2.00							2.00		0.00	2.00
	Total Hours	16.25	1.50	0.00	2.75	0.00	4.00	0.00	20.50	0.00	4.00	24.50
	Total Amount	\$2,518.75	\$232.50	\$0.00	\$426.25	\$0.00	\$320.00	\$0.00	\$3,177.50	\$0.00	\$320.00	\$3,497.50

# Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc. 4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

**INVOICE** 

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number:
Invoice Date:

CEI RI 8-2022 August 31, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description	Amount		
Services Performed 08/01/2022 three			
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 2.00 0.00	Hourly Rate \$186.00 \$93.00	Amount Due \$372.00 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form	for details.)		\$0.00

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$372.00

### Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc. Services Performed 08/01/2022 through 08/31/2022

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
	Reviewed June Data Report; participated in Res Sector Team							
8/4/22	meeting		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
8/22/22	Met w/C. Johnson to discuss plans for final 2022 plan review		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	2.00	0.00	0.00	2.00	0.00	2.00
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$372.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$372.00	0.00	\$372.00



EcoMetric Consulting, LLC 555 Exton Cms Exton, PA 19341 610.400.8600 admin@ecometricconsulting.com

### **INVOICE**

**BILLED TO** 

Sam Ross Optimal Energy - NV5 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 **TOTAL DUE** 

\$1,576.50

Project Name RI EEMRC Consultant

Project # 7465

Invoice # 1029-P8-22

Billing Period 05/28/2022 - 09/02/2022

Invoice Date 08/31/2022

Due Date 09/30/2022

Payment Terms Net 30

Task Number	Description	Amount
Task 1	EM&V Oversight	\$1,576.50
Task 2	Program Design & Policy	\$0.00

Subtotal \$1,576.50

Invoice Total \$1,576.50

Invoice Number 1029-P8-22

Period 05/28/2022 - 09/02/2022

Project	Task	Person	Title	Month	Hours	Rate	Amou	nt
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Salil Gogte	Partner	2022-08	3	\$ 212.00	\$	636.00
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Michael Frischmann	Partner	2022-08	C	\$ 212.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Michael Honeychuck	Managing Consultant	2022-08	4.75	\$ 198.00	\$	940.50
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Bitul Sinha	Sr Engineer	2022-08	C	\$ 160.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Cory Read	Data Scientist	2022-08	C	\$ 198.00	\$	-
Total					7.75		\$	1,576.50

Project	Task	Person	Title	Month	Hours	Rate	Amount	
RI EEMRC Consultant	Program Design & Policy	Salil Gogte	Partner	2022-08		0 \$ 212.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	Program Design & Policy	Michael Frischmann	Partner	2022-08		0 \$ 212.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	Program Design & Policy	Michael Honeychuck	Managing Consultant	2022-08		0 \$ 198.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	Program Design & Policy	Bitul Sinha	Sr Engineer	2022-08		0 \$ 160.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	Program Design & Policy			2022-08		0	\$	-
Total					-		\$	-

fname	Iname	local_date	hours	task	notes
Salil	Gogte	6/16/2022	0.5	EM&V Oversight	Monthly call with Optimal/NV5
Salil	Gogte	6/22/2022	0.5	EM&V Oversight	Emails with Optimal/NV5
Salil	Gogte	6/29/2022	0.5	EM&V Oversight	Emails with Adrian.
Salil	Gogte	8/23/2022	0.5	EM&V Oversight	Chat with Mike about RI work coming up.
Salil	Gogte	8/25/2022	1	EM&V Oversight	Call with Optimal/NV5, prep, follow up.
Michael	Honeychuck	6/1/2022	1	EM&V Oversight	Invoice, discussions, emails
Michael	Honeychuck	6/16/2022	0.5	EM&V Oversight	Monthly check-in with Adrian
					Invoice discussions
Michael	Honeychuck	7/6/2022	0.5	EM&V Oversight	Emails
Michael	Honeychuck	7/28/2022	0.5	EM&V Oversight	Monthly check-in with Adrian
Michael	Honeychuck	8/10/2022	0.75	EM&V Oversight	Monthly C&I EM&V check-in call
Michael	Honeychuck	8/25/2022	0.5	EM&V Oversight	Monthly check-in with Optimal/NV5
Michael	Honeychuck	9/1/2022	1	EM&V Oversight	Emails with Adrian about RICE2020 reports

Energy Futures Group, Inc. PO Box 587 Hinesburg, VT 05461

**INVOICE** 

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Invoice Number:

5361

Invoice Date:

August 31, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of S	Services		Amount
Services Performed 8/1/22 through 8/3	31/22		
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 16.25 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$3,217.50 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for	details.)		\$0.00

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$3,217.50

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
8/1/2022	Review OER heat pump RFP		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
8/1/2022	Initial review of OER HE HP Program solicitation		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	CT HP and municipal building webinars, outreach to C-Team prior							
	to meeting w/D. Lis		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
8/3/2022	Respond to Adrian re: control measure lives		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
8/4/2022	Prep then RI res sector team meeting		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
8/4/2022	Agenda prep		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
8/4/2022	Review of HPWH resources from D. Lis of NEEP		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	Meeting w/D. Lis of NEEP to discuss HPs and HPWH acitivities							
	(time also billed to MA and CT projects and to internal business							
8/4/2022	development)		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	Review of OER HE Heat Pump Program; develop estimates of							
8/8/2022	program activity with Incentive and Enhanced Incentives		2.50			2.50	0.00	2.50
8/10/2022	Review OER heat pump RFP with G. Reed		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
	·							
8/10/2022	Call w/Richard on OER HE HP Program review and comments		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
8/15/2022	Prep for lighting call on Friday		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
8/15/2022	Review and comment on draft High Performance HP Program.		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
	Scheduling		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
8/17/2022	Comments on HEHP Program to Optimal		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	Agenda and scheduling; review Q2 data; emails with RI Energy		1.25			1.25	0.00	
	RI lighting subgroup meeting and follow-ups		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
	Review of Residential HP specs - NEEP, ENERGY STAR, MA -							
	and changing metrics for 2023, outreach to NEEP		0.50			0.50		
8/22/2022	Review supply chain research results from Josh		0.75			0.75		0.75
8/24/2022	Revised HP metrics		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
	HP metrics and outreach to NEEP		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
8/31/2022	RI lighting and HVAC call w/Richard		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
8/31/2022	Check in with Craig. Lighting plans for 2023 review with G. Reed.		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	16.25	0.00	0.00	16.25	0.00	16.25
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$3,217.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$3,217.50	0.00	\$3,217.50

### Ralph Prahl 7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

### **INVOICE**

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number:
Invoice Date: Aug

31 August 31, 2022

OEI Project #:

7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description	Amount		
Services Performed 08/01/22 throu	ıgh 08/31/22		
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 13.00 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$2,574.00 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form	for details.)		\$0.00

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$2,574.00

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
	Annual plan		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
8/4/2022	query from Adrian on Itg controls; C&I Itg market report		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
8/5/2022	C&I Itg market report		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
8/9/2022	C&I Itg market report; mtg prep		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	C&I studies check-in call; custom impact report		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
	cannabis report		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
8/12/2022	cannabis report, custom gas impact report		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
8/13/2022	cust gas impact rep		2.00			2.00	0.00	2.00
8/16/2022	cannabis report		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
8/17/2022	Cannabis report		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
8/19/2022	lighting controls AML issue; C&I Itg report		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
	Itg AML report		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	Itg AML report		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
	C&I Itg report		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	check-in call + prep; custom elec impact report		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
	cust gas imp rep		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
8/29/2022	Adrian query on C&I NEIs; custom gas report		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	T-4-111	2.22	40.00	0.00	0.00			
	Total Hours	0.00	13.00	0.00	0.00	13.00	0.00	13.00
	Total Amount	\$2,574.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,574.00	0.00	\$2,574.00

# Rachel Sholly Energy Consulting 48 Hudson St. Providence, RI 02909

INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461

Invoice Number: Invoice Date:

56 August 31, 2022

7465 OEI Project #:

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Se	Amount						
Services Performed 08/01/22 through 8/31/22							
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Admin Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 33.25 0.00 0.00	Hourly Rate \$155.00 \$80.00 \$77.50	Amount Due \$5,153.75 \$0.00 \$0.00				
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for o	details.)		\$0.00				

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$5,153.75

Date	Description of Services	006-03 Education Initiative	009-01 Meeting Attendance	009-02 Develop Materials	009-03 Other Council Responsibilitie s	010 - Research, Analysis & Council Support	011 - Admin	Travel	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Sub-Total Admin Hrs.	Total Hours
	Annual Report printing quotes, coordination, proof review,											
	councilor communication; Emails re: education activities; Call										1	i l
	w/Councilor P. Case re: videos	0.75			0.50				1.25		0.00	1.25
	July Council mtg debrief, August Council mtg prep; Annual report										1	i l
	formatting edits; Emails re: education activities	1.00		0.50	1.00				2.50		0.00	2.50
08/05/22	Education check-in w/S. Chybowski (OER)	0.50							0.50		0.00	0.50
08/07/22	Updates to Council Member Handbook					3.50			3.50		0.00	3.50
08/08/22	Updates to Council Member Handbook					2.00			2.00		0.00	2.00
08/09/22	Updates to Council Member Handbook					2.50			2.50		0.00	2.50
	Final annual report formatting for printing, sent final to printer;											i
	Reviewed D&S video shot list & related correspondence;										1 '	1
	Reviewed, responded to & forwarded flyer for K-12 workshops;										1 '	1
08/10/22	Drafted & sent notes for RFP review committee	1.75			1.50				3.25		0.00	3.25
	Reviewed prior OMA materials & correspondence from M.											i
	Desautel (EERMC legal counsel), Drafted questions to guide OMA										1 '	1
08/11/22	presentation	1.00		1.00	)				2.00		0.00	2.00
08/15/22	Prep for edu & full council mtgs	1.00							1.00		0.00	1.00
	Updated edu agenda, related emails; Sent draft scripts for videos											
08/16/22	#4-10 to edu group	1.00							1.00		0.00	1.00
	Full Council mtg prep; Attended Council mtg - discussion on edu											
08/18/22	RFPs	1.00							1.00		0.00	1.00
	Sent edu mtg materials; Correspondence re: annual report printing											
08/19/22	invoice	0.25			0.25				0.50		0.00	0.50
08/22/22	Edu mtg prep	1.00							1.00		0.00	1.00
	Correspondence re: upcoming K-12 workshops; Video strategy											
08/24/22	update	2.25							2.25		0.00	2.25
08/25/22	Compiled annual report distribution list & strategy	2.00							2.00		0.00	2.00
	Video strategy update & related correspondence; Correspondence											
08/29/22	re: K-12 workshops & invoicing	3.75							3.75		0.00	3.75
	Video scripts editing; Reviewed vendor invoices; Correspondence											
	re: videos, annual report, K-12 training; Phone check-in w/S.										1 '	í l
	Chybowski (OER) re: videos mtg	3.25							3.25		0.00	3.25
	Total Hours	20.50	0.00	1.50	3.25	8.00	0.00	0.00	33.25	0.00	0.00	33.25
	Total Amount	\$3,177.50	\$0.00	\$232.50	\$503.75	\$1,240.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$5,153.75	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$5,153.75

## **INVOICE**

DESAUTEL LAW

Invoice # 949 Date: 09/15/2022 Due On: 10/15/2022

38 BELLEVUE AVE, UNIT H NEWPORT, RI 02840

RI Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council EERMC and Rhode Island Energy PURCHASE ORDER #3200171172

#### 15-00012

## Legal Counsel to EERMC.

Туре	Date	Notes	Quantity	Rate	Total
Service	08/12/2022	File Management: Review RI PUC website for anything more than Notice of Commencement of Docket on Docket No. 22-01-NG - Investigation Into the Future of the Regulated Bas Distribution Business in Rhode Island in Light of the Act on Climate (06.09.2022); printed out Commencement of Docket; emailed Luly Massaro asking that she add Marisa Desautel and myself to Service List on behalf of EERMC.	0.30	\$225.00	\$67.50
Service	08/15/2022	Review of documents: Receipt, review, and filing of The Narragansett Electric Company d/b/a Rhode Island Energy's redacted electronic version of the Company's Complete Set of Responses to R.I. Division 's First Set of Data Requests.	0.20	\$225.00	\$45.00
Service	08/15/2022	Review of documents: Receipt, review, and filing of Division's Eighth Set of Data Requests.	0.20	\$225.00	\$45.00
Service	08/15/2022	Correspondences: OER, team re: EERMC meeting.	0.60	\$275.00	\$165.00
Service	08/16/2022	Presentation slides for council meeting.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	08/17/2022	Attention to EE Docket prep call. Attend same.	0.50	\$275.00	\$137.50
Service	08/18/2022	Review of documents: Receipt, review, and filing of The Narragansett Electric Company d/b/a Rhode Island Energy ("Company") redacted electronic version of Company's first batch of responses to the Rhode Island Division's Fifth Set of Data Requests (Division Set 5).	0.20	\$225.00	\$45.00
Service	08/18/2022	Review of documents: Receipt, review, and filing of The Narragansett Electric Company d/b/a Rhode Island Energy ("Company") redacted electronic version of the	0.20	\$225.00	\$45.00

		Company's responses to the Rhode Island Division's Sixth Set of Data Requests (Division Set 6).			
Service	08/18/2022	Appearance: Monthly meeting to present on OMA.	3.00	\$275.00	\$825.00
Service	08/22/2022	Review of documents: Receipt, review, and filing of Rhode Island Energy's Response to the PUC's First Set of Data Requests.	0.10	\$225.00	\$22.50
Service	08/31/2022	Meeting: Virtual re: EE Docket.	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00
Service	09/01/2022	Review of documents: Receipt, review, and filing of The Narragansett Electric Company, d/b/a Rhode Island Energy's redacted electronic version of Rhode Island Energy's response to Division Post-Decisional Data Requests 5 - 7.	0.20	\$225.00	\$45.00
Service	09/07/2022	Emails: Client re: contract review. Begin reviewing same.	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00
Service	09/09/2022	Emails: OER re: educational videos.	0.50	\$275.00	\$137.50

**Subtotal** \$2,020.00

#### 15-00018

# **EERMC** Client Trust Funds management.

Type	Date	Notes	Quantity	Rate	Total
Service	08/11/2022	Emails: OER re: RI Energy request. Attention to materials from former MM account.	0.60	\$275.00	\$165.00
			Subt	Subtotal	
			T	otal	\$2,185.00

#### **Detailed Statement of Account**

#### **Current Invoice**

Invoice Number	Due On	Amount Due	Payments Received	Balance Due
949	10/15/2022	\$2,185.00	\$0.00	\$2,185.00
			Outstanding Balance	\$2,185.00

#### Total Amount Outstanding \$2,185.00

Please make all amounts payable to: DESAUTEL LAW

Please pay within 30 days.

# Accounting Office Rhode Island College 600 Mount Pleasant Avenue, Bldg # 5 Providence RI 02908 (401) 456-8076 / (401) 456-4659

#### Invoice

Group	Invoice Number:	E15013		
BILLING: Steven Chybowski	Invoice Date:	9/26/2022		
RI Office of Energy Resources	Due Date:	10/26/2022		
1 Capitol Hill, 4th floor	Event Name:	RI EERMC Coun	cilor Training	]
Providence, RI 02908	Reservation No.:	148081		
USA	Phone:	401-574-9117		
	Fax:			
	Event Type:	Meeting		
	Customer Number:	672		
	Approver:	Paolucci, Mark		
Bookings / Details		Quantity	Price	Amount

Please include invoice number on all correspondence. Make checks payable to Rhode Island College. For online credit card payments go to www.ric.edu/ARpayments. For Billing questions please use the phone/fax numbers above.

#### Thursday, June 30, 2022

:00 PM - 4:00 PM RI EERMC Councilor Training (Confirmed) SU Student Un	1	\$150.00	\$150.00
Room Charge: (\$150.00 per Half Day)	1	Ψ150.00	-\$99.00
Less 66% Discount			-Ф99.00
Dining Services Catering:			
12:30 PM - 4:00 PM Delivery for 20	_		
Coffee Regular (Gallon) (serves 15)	2	\$18.00	\$36.00
Bottled Water (16.9 oz) (serves 1)	10	\$2.25	\$22.50
Apple Juice 10 oz Bottle (serves 1)	4	\$1.95	\$7.80
Additional items not available in Catering Guide	20	\$1.50	\$30.00
Kind Bar (serves 1)	10	\$2.50	\$25.00
Granola Bars (serves 1)	10	\$1.50	\$15.00
Muffins Mini - Corn and Blueberry (serves 12)	2	\$6.00	\$12.00
Fresh Fruit Whole (serves 10)	1	\$15.00	\$15.00
Pepsi Cola 12oz. (serves 1)	4	\$1.50	\$6.00
Diet Pepsi 12 oz. (serves 1)	4	\$1.50	\$6.00
Schweppes Ginger Ale 12 oz. (serves 1)	2	\$1.50	\$3.00
AV Equipment:			
Lectern/Podium/AV Cart access	1		
Student Union Equipment:			
Chairs	20	\$2.00	\$40.00
Less 100% Discount			-\$40.00
Table, Rectangular, 6'-0"	9	\$14.00	\$126.00
Less 100% Discount			-\$126.00
Table, Rectangular, 6'-0"	1	\$14.00	\$14.00
Less 100% Discount			-\$14.00
Reservation Notes:			
Coucilor Training For RI Energy Efficiency and Resource Management Council			

Page 1 of 2

Invoice Number:

E15013

Bookings / Details

Quantity

Price

Amount

(EERMC)

Open Square set-up for 20, 2 food tables

use of AV, group will bring their own Logitech Group Video Conferencing System to facilitate a hybrid meeting

snacks will be served

AV Equipment	\$0.00
Dining Services Catering	\$178.30
Room Charge	\$51.00
Student Union Equipment	\$0.00
Subtotal	\$229.30
Grand Total	\$229.30

Payment Terms: Net 30

## **INVOICE**

Invoice # 968 Date: 10/13/2022 Due On: 11/12/2022



38 BELLEVUE AVE, UNIT H NEWPORT, RI 02840

RI Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council EERMC and Rhode Island Energy PURCHASE ORDER #3200171172

#### 15-00012

## Legal Counsel to EERMC.

Туре	Date	Notes	Quantity	Rate	Total
Service	09/09/2022	File Management: Obtain documents from Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission for Docket No. 22-01-NG; file all documents; open file; email Attorney Desautel re Motion to Intervene.	0.50	\$225.00	\$112.50
Service	09/15/2022	Meeting: Virtual with OER, client rep re: contract issues.	0.50	\$275.00	\$137.50
Service	09/19/2022	Meeting: Virtual re: video contract. Follow up emails.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	09/21/2022	Emails: Client re: full council meeting topics.	0.30	\$275.00	\$82.50
Service	09/22/2022	Attention to issues/questions for council meeting. Virtual attendance.	0.50	\$275.00	\$137.50
Service	09/23/2022	Meeting: Virtual with client, vendor re: video contracts.	0.50	\$275.00	\$137.50
Service	09/25/2022	Emails: Client, OER re: video vendor issues. OER re: 9/29 meeting.	0.50	\$275.00	\$137.50
Service	09/26/2022	File Management: Receipt, review, and filing of Docket No. 22-05-EE Response to Division's Post-Decisional Data Request 6-9.	0.30	\$225.00	\$67.50
Service	09/26/2022	Correspondences: Expert re: options for vote and RFPs. Follow up review and response.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	09/27/2022	Emails: S. Ross re: questions about RFP.	0.60	\$275.00	\$165.00
Service	09/29/2022	Correspondences: Client, OER re: vendor contract options. Attention to meeting materials. Client re: council meeting.	1.20	\$275.00	\$330.00

Service	09/29/2022	Meeting: Council meeting.	4.00	\$275.00	\$1,100.00
Service	09/30/2022	Correspondences: RI Energy, C-Team re: settling party status. Review draft from RI Energy.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	10/04/2022	Emails: Attention to materials for contract review.	0.30	\$275.00	\$82.50
Service	10/05/2022	Attention to contract with video vendor.	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00
Service	10/07/2022	Attention to video contract and educational contract. Review, revise, forward same.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	10/11/2022	Correspondences: Drafting correspondence to John Harrington at PUC re EERMC budget on multi-year contracts clarification; finalize and mail and email correspondence to John Harrington.	0.50	\$225.00	\$112.50
Service	10/11/2022	Emails with Team re: contract language. Revise contract to reflect new payment terms. Attention to D&S contract and CE Report. Emails from PUC re: docket procedure.	2.00	\$275.00	\$550.00
Expense	10/11/2022	Postage: Postage.	1.00	\$0.60	\$0.60
Expense	10/12/2022	Postage: Postage - Mailing of original plus nine (9) copies of EERMC's Cost-Effectiveness Report: Rhode Island Energy's 2023 Energy Efficiency Plan.	1.00	\$7.62	\$7.62
Service	10/12/2022	Correspondences: PUC staff, C-Team re: EE docket and questions regarding budget. Attention to 2021 EE docket procedure. Client re: budget.	0.90	\$275.00	\$247.50
Service	10/12/2022	Filing of Documents: Preparation of final document to include printing of nine (9) copies for filing with original; prepare cover letter to Luly Massaro enclosing updated Service List of 10.12.2022, EERMC's Cost-Effectiveness Report: Rhode Island Energy's 2023 Energy Efficiency Plan, and cover letter; email to Luly Massaro; file original and nine (9) copies via USPS mail.	1.20	\$225.00	\$270.00
Service	10/13/2022	Correspondences: Client re: questions.	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00
Service	10/13/2022	Emails: Receipt, review, and respond to email from Luly Massaro looking for Mr. Ross' full name; prepared email providing the information requested.	0.10	\$225.00	\$22.50

Total \$4,965.72

#### **Detailed Statement of Account**

#### **Other Invoices**

Invoice Number	Due On	Amount Due	Payments Received	Balance Due
949	10/15/2022	\$2,185.00	\$0.00	\$2,185.00

#### **Current Invoice**

Invoice Number	Due On	Amount Due	Payments Received	Balance Due
968	11/12/2022	\$4,965.72	\$0.00	\$4,965.72
			Outstanding Balance	\$7,150.72
			Total Amount Outstanding	\$7,150.72

Please make all amounts payable to: DESAUTEL LAW

Please pay within 30 days.

#### **INVOICE** Federal Tax ID# 03-0351557



Remit checks to: Optimal Energy, Inc. PO Box 74008680 Chicago, IL 60674-8680

# Remit ACH transfer to: ABA Routing Number 063100277 Account Number 898052466590 Email ACH/Wire remittance details to RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com

Remit Wire Transfers to: ABA Routing Number 026009593 Account Number 898052466590 Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N

September 30, 2022

Steven Chybov Rhode Island C	vski Office of Energy Res	sources		Project No: Invoice No:		21-0007465.00 00297114
Professional	Services from Se	ptember 1, 2022 to Septe	ember 30, 2	022		
Phase	006	EE Program Planning & I	mplementation	on		
Task	01	Council Representation				
Professional	Personnel	·				
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Johnson, (	Craig		2.00	186.00	372.00	
	Totals		2.00		372.00	
	Total Lab	or				372.00
				Total this	Task	\$372.00
<b> T</b> ask	02	Implementation Oversigh	- <b>– – –</b> . nt & Plan Dev	<b>– – – – – –</b> relop		
Professional	Personnel			•		
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Ad	drian		85.25	135.00	11,508.75	
Johnson, (	Craig		75.50	186.00	14,043.00	
Keller, Mic			2.25	198.00	445.50	
Ross, Sam	nuel		51.50	198.00	10,197.00	
	Totals		214.50		36,194.25	
	Total Lab	or				36,194.25
Consultants						
Core Energ	gy Insights Inc.				372.00	
EcoMetric	Consulting, LLC				1,683.00	
Energy Fu	tures Group, Inc.				3,811.50	
Ralph Pral					1,287.00	
	Total Con	sultants			7,153.50	7,153.50
				Total this	Task	\$43,347.75
<b></b> Task	03					
Professional						
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Ad	drian		3.50	135.00	472.50	
Johnson, (	Craig		2.00	186.00	372.00	
	Totals		5.50		844.50	
	Total Lab	or				844.50

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC - 2022		Invoice	000000297114
Consultan					
Rachel	•			3,797.50	
	Total Consu	iltants		3,797.50	3,797.50
			Total th	nis Task	\$4,642.00
			Total this	s Phase	\$48,361.75
<b></b> Phase	008	Regulatory Proceedings		. – – – – -	
<b>– – – –</b> Task	02	Develop Technical Materials			
Profession	al Personnel				
		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Johnso	n, Craig	6.50	186.00	1,209.00	
Ross, S	Samuel	.50	198.00	99.00	
	Totals	7.00		1,308.00	
	Total Labor				1,308.00
			Total th	nis Task	\$1,308.00
			Total this	s Phase	\$1,308.00
<b></b> Phase	009	Council Sponsored Meetings & Mater	<b></b> ials		
Task	01	Meeting Attendance			
	al Personnel	<b>3</b>			
		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar,	, Adrian	4.25	135.00	573.75	
Johnso	n, Craig	4.25	186.00	790.50	
Ross, S	Samuel	4.25	198.00	841.50	
	Totals	12.75		2,205.75	
	Total Labor				2,205.75
			Total th	nis Task	\$2,205.75
<b>– – – –</b> Task	02	Develop Technical Materials		. – – – – -	
	al Personnel	·			
		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar,	, Adrian	25.00	135.00	3,375.00	
Johnso	n, Craig	20.75	186.00	3,859.50	
Ross, S		19.75	198.00	3,910.50	
	Totals	65.50		11,145.00	
	Total Labor				11,145.00
			Total th	nis Task	\$11,145.00
<b>– – – –</b> Task	03	Other Council Responsibilities			
Profession	al Personnel				
		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Ross, S	Samuel	3.00	198.00	594.00	
	Totals	3.00		594.00	
	Total Labor				594.00

Project	86322	1-0007465.00	Rhode Island	EERMC - 2022		Invoice	000000297114
Consultant							
Rachel S	Sholly					77.50	
		Total Consu	ltants			77.50	77.50
					Total thi	s Task	\$671.50
					Total this	Phase	\$14,022.25
<b></b> Phase		 10		-			
Profession	al Person	nel					
				Hours	Rate	Amount	
Mosenth	hal, Philip			.25	212.00	53.00	
		Totals		.25		53.00	
		Total Labor					53.00
Consultant	_						
Rachel S	Sholly					116.25	444.5
		Total Consu	iltants			116.25	116.25
					Total this	Phase	\$169.25
<b>– – – –</b> Phase		<b>– – – – -</b> 11	Administrative				
Pnase Professiona			Administrative				
Pioression	ai Peisoii	illei		Hours	Rate	Amount	
Johnson	o Craig			nours .50	186.00	<b>Amount</b> 93.00	
301111501	i, Claig	Totals		.50	100.00	93.00	
		Total Labor		.50		33.00	93.00
Consultant	ts						
Rachel S						80.00	
	J. 15,	Total Consu	Itants			80.00	80.00
					Total this	Phase	\$173.00
					i otai tilis	riiase	<b>\$175.00</b>
Billing Limi	its			Current	Prior	To-Date	
Total Bi	illings			64,034.25	380,704.00	444,738.25	
Lim	nit					952,976.00	
Ren	maining					508,237.75	
					Total this I	nvoice	\$64,034.25
Billings To	Date						
	Jace		Current	Prior	Total		
J95 . 0			52,809.50	285,393.50	338,203.00		
_			52,005.50	200,000.00	330,203.00		
Labor	ant			77,310,50	88,535.25		
_			11,224.75 0.00	77,310.50 18,000.00	88,535.25 18,000.00		

863221-0007465.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2022 Project Invoice 000000297114 Billing Backup Thursday, October 27, 2022 NV5, Inc. Invoice 000000297114 Dated 9/30/2022 Phase 006 EE Program Planning & Implementation 01 Council Representation Task **Professional Personnel** Hours Rate **Amount** 9/6/2022 186.00 186.00 Johnson, Craig 1.00 Bi-weekly meeting with RI Energy and OER. 1.00 186.00 186.00 Johnson, Craig 9/20/2022 Bi-weekly check-in meeting with OER and RIE **Totals** 2.00 372.00 **Total Labor** 372.00 **Total this Task** \$372.00 Task 02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Develop **Professional Personnel Amount** Hours Rate Caesar, Adrian 9/1/2022 4.75 135.00 641.25 2022 July C&I data report review; 2023 Plan cost assumptions analysis -2015-2021 end use costs and inflation adjustments; September C&I Sector team call - August meeting follow ups, 2023 Plan updates, updated measure cost assumptions and supporting analysis, program performance forecasts, project pipeline updates; updated C&I Lighting AML results; RICE 2020 Impact Evaluation report and updated realization rate results review; RICE PY2020 site report review - RICEN002, N006, N032 9/2/2022 168.75 Caesar, Adrian 1.25 135.00 C&I BCR model to actual data mapping - New Construction/Retrofit; C&I data report measure category development for revised reporting infrastructure Caesar, Adrian 9/6/2022 3.50 135.00 472.50 Updated PY2020 RICE impact evaluation report, RICE site report review -N036, N041, N047, N068, N070, N076, S009 1.75 135.00 236.25 Caesar, Adrian C&I Electric retrofit historical gross and inflation adjusted TRC CTA comparisons; 2023 Plan analysis workbook development for second draft BCR models - program level savings and spending comps, net/gross and TRC analysis, end use-level savings 9/8/2022 4.00 540.00 Caesar, Adrian 135.00 2023 Plan analysis - performance incentive counterfactual, cross jurisdictional cost comparisons, updated Plan narrative review, status of C-Team questions/comments on first draft 2023 Plan text; proposed final Cannabis ISP study review, C-Team comments on PY2020 Elec impact evaluation and site reports; Caesar, Adrian 9/9/2022 8.00 135.00 1,080.00 2023 Annual Plan second draft text review - attachments 2, 3, 8, and 9; sector-level savings, spending, and cost to achieve analysis; 2023 Annual Plan Electric and Gas second draft BCR model analysis; Elec/Gas evaluation inputs, impact factors, NTG ratio, and measure life review/comps

Project 863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	000000297114
Caesar, Adrian	9/12/2022	3.75	135.00	506.25	
attachments 2, 3, 8, an achieve analysis; 2023 model analysis; Elec/Ga	d draft data analysis and d 9; sector-level savings Annual Plan Electric and as evaluation inputs, imp v/comps; RI/MA C&I pro	, spending, an Gas second dr act factors, NT	d cost to raft BCR G ratio,		
Caesar, Adrian	9/13/2022	7.25	135.00	978.75	
attachments 2, 3, 8, an achieve analysis; 2023 model analysis; Elec/Ga and measure life review	d draft data analysis and d 9; sector-level savings Annual Plan Electric and as evaluation inputs, impu/comps; measure-level (2023 measure mapping analysis	, spending, an Gas second dr act factors, NT deltas across 2	d cost to raft BCR G ratio, 2022 and		
Caesar, Adrian	9/14/2022	7.00	135.00	945.00	
Plan Check-in and revie review; RI 2023 EE Plan attachments 2, 3, 8, an achieve analysis; 2023 model analysis; Elec/Ga and measure life review 2023 Plan drafts, 2022/	enda development and ca ew discussion; updated E in second draft data analy d 9; sector-level savings Annual Plan Electric and as evaluation inputs, impu/comps; measure-level of 2023 measure mapping analysis; 2023 plan deve	M&V study tra vsis and narrat , spending, an Gas second dr act factors, NT deltas across 2 and TRC comp	cker cive review - d cost to raft BCR G ratio, 2022 and os; LCI		
Caesar, Adrian	9/15/2022	4.75	135.00	641.25	
attachments 2, 3, 8, an analysis; 2023 Annual F analysis; Elec/Gas evalu measure life review/cor MA-RI 2023 measure m	d draft data analysis and d 9; C&I savings, spendid 9; C&I savings, spendid Plan Electric and Gas sect ation inputs, impact factory; measure-level deltanapping and TRC comps; MA/RI C&I program offer	ng, and cost to ond draft BCR cors, NTG ratio s across 2023 LCI retrofit fu	o achieve model o, and Plan drafts, el cell		
Caesar, Adrian	9/16/2022	3.75	135.00	506.25	
attachments 2, 3, 8, an analysis; 2023 Annual F analysis; Elec/Gas evalu measure life review/cor MA-RI 2023 measure m	d draft data analysis and d 9; C&I savings, spendid Plan Electric and Gas sect ation inputs, impact factory; measure-level deltanapping and TRC comps; view of responses to C-1	ng, and cost to ond draft BCR cors, NTG rations s across 2023 updated C&I	o achieve model o, and Plan drafts, retrofit TRC		
Caesar, Adrian	9/19/2022	3.75	135.00	506.25	
customer contributions	Electric BCR model TRC and incentive coverage, to updated 2023 BCR m w	C&I retrofit TI	RC cost		
Caesar, Adrian	9/20/2022	7.50	135.00	1,012.50	
	Electric BCR model TRC and incentive coverage,	C&I retrofit TI	RC cost		
analysis and application to 2022, historical actua	n to updated 2023 BCR mals, 2023 first draft, and I Energy; MPS/targets-20	MA 2022-2024	l Plan data;		

Project	863221-0007465.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2022	Invoice	000000297114
Caesar, Adr	2023 EE Plan analysis - Electric BCR model TRC cost assumptions, customer contributions and incentive coverage, ; 2023 Plan comps to 2022, historical actuals, 2023 first draft, and MA 2022-2024 Plan data; YoY acquisition cost delta analysis; August C&I and Residential program performance data review and data report development/analysis ian 9/22/2022 4.25 135.00	573.75	
Caesai, Aui	2023 EERMC plan presentation prep; August C&I Data report review; Measure-level cost delta analysis for RI Energy reference - 2022 plan/2023 first draft comps; EE plan evaluation impact changes - cust elec measure lives, Lighting AML adjustments, cust gas realization rates and measure life updates;	3/3./3	
Caesar, Adr	ian 9/23/2022 2.50 135.00  Federal and state equipment efficiency standards review for potential inclusion in 2023 Plan; EM&V check in w RI Energy - updated federal and state HVAC/ food service equipment standards, baseline equipment assumptions; Connected Solutions program data review and cost/capacity savings analysis; review of updated C&I electric and gas retrofit costs, savings, ML, and NTG analysis for use in 2023 Plan update	337.50	
Caesar, Adr	ian 9/26/2022 2.75 135.00 2023 Plan updated second draft review - electric and gas retrofit cost analysis, 2023 plan draft savings/spending and EMV input deltas, sector/portfolio/program level plan data updates; 2023 Plan BCR model evaluation input and impact factor review	371.25	
Caesar, Adr	ian 9/27/2022 2.25 135.00 2023 plan development process - quantification of impact of plan draft changes; program and end use incentive acquisition cost plan draft/YoY changes summary;	303.75	
Caesar, Adr	Updated 2023 BCR model analysis - program comps and chart development, fuel cell project impact analysis, measure and end-use level plan draft deltas	877.50	
Caesar, Adr	Updated 2023 BCR model analysis - program comps and chart development, fuel cell project impact analysis, measure and end-use level plan draft deltas; YTD August data review and CTA analysis	236.25	
Caesar, Adr	ian 9/30/2022 1.50 135.00  Sep. EERMC mtg debrief - next steps for Plan review, filing process, and EERMC pre filed testimony; 2023 Plan BCR model review - measure-level inputs and model QA/QC; Sept C&I sector team rescheduling and august data report review/distribution	202.50	
Johnson, Cr	·	930.00	
Johnson, Cr		418.50	
Johnson, Cr		883.50	

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	000000297114
Johnson, (	Craig	9/8/2022	3.50	186.00	651.00	
	Prep for 2023 second dicatalog from first draft	with Sam and Adrian. Re	eview stakehol	der		
lohnson (	comments on first draft		_	186.00	02.00	
Johnson, (	2023 Plan Review - revi		-contractors,	om RI and	93.00	
Johnson, (	Craig	9/12/2022	8.25	186.00	1,534.50	
	residential team. Review and second draft for the comparisons of savings, areas to investigate furt	e residential and income costs, and cost-to-achi- ther at a more granular availability of redline w m quantitative question ain text and residential ans and distribute those t , EnergyWise, and Multi	isons between eligible sector eve. Drafted plevel. Coordinavith comment research C&I attach o res and C&I family sections	first draft rs. Reviewed unchlist of ation with RI responses d receive ments, review s of		
Johnson, (		9/13/2022	9.75	186.00	1,813.50	
Johnson, (	updates on review item Richard to review reside related questions from a plan to work to identify review of residential and measure inputs between Craig	ential attachment progra first draft of plan, compa which issues have been d income eligible electrion n plans, flag new areas 9/14/2022	ion with Margion review. Revare with second addressed. Be programs to of concern. 7.50	e and view data d draft of C Model compare 186.00	1,395.00	
	comparisons to first dra and income eligible gas plans, flag new areas of to review and synthesiz	programs to compare not concern. Working session of findings on cost issues to date. Conges in savings and budges in savings and budges.	odel review of neasure inputs ion with Sam a s to date. Mee ontinue investig gets at prograr	residential between and Adrian ting with gation into n level for		
Johnson, (	-	9/16/2022	3.50	186.00	651.00	
ŕ	2023 Plan Review - Con 2023 Plan bc models ar savings and cost change	tinue reviewing savings d investigation into driv	and costs ass ers behind pro			
Johnson, (	Craig	9/19/2022	7.25	186.00	1,348.50	
	2023 Plan Review - Ana costs where year-over-y specific questions to core Sam and Adrian to revied develop cost assumption meeting with RI Energy C&I programs CTA with assessment of implied in on incentive totals in BC of concern. Review resp BC model review to iden	rear increases are still of mmunicate to RI Energy ew and discuss concerns are for C&I programs, and on that analysis. This are and without the fuel cencentive coverage for C&I model with cost-tables conses to first draft data	f concern and v. Working sess over analysis of prep for upoulso included and lill project, as v. &I measures. (s in plan, ID and questions. And working was to be seen and the concern and program of the concern and the concern and program of the concern and the concern a	draft list of sion with used to coming nalysis on well as an Comparison d flag areas lalysis and		
	are new for discussion v					
Johnson, (	Craig	9/20/2022	5.50	186.00	1,023.00	

	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	000000297114
	thoughts on determining council priorities for the savings mix in 2023 Plaresponses and edits in	view narrative of second of glevel of responsiveness at 2023 plan. Review Adrian compared to mix in MF residential attachment of ighlight in Council presen	to each of the n analysis on S. Review RI second draft	ne six end-use E comment		
Johnson, Cr	· ·	9/21/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
ornison, en	_	rking session with RIE to			100.00	
Johnson, Cra		9/22/2022	3.50	186.00	651.00	
·	Annual Plan Review - R quantitative topics at C points. Second pass on	evisit analysis on residen ouncil meeting to aid in c residential attachment a C-Team quantitative que	levelopment on comment of the commen	of talking		
Johnson, Cra		9/26/2022	2.25	186.00	418.50	
	2023 Plan Review - Re RI Energy. Meeting wit	view electric MF 2021 act h RI Energy to review and eling. Comparison of map el	d discuss wor	kbook and		
Johnson, Cra	aig	9/28/2022	7.50	186.00	1,395.00	
	Energy. Review and co income eligible prograr	view updated/third draft I mpare measure inputs/ouns with second draft to II ompare non-incentive cos	itputs for resi Dand flag any	dential and notable		
ohnson, Cr	aig	9/29/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
		view BC model updates in Irivers of changes betwee				
Johnson, Cra	aig	9/30/2022	3.00	186.00	558.00	
	meeting. Identify next ratios, and driver of hig was ID'd at Council me of other programs to e accounted for. Review	Adrian to debrief Council steps in post-council-vote plots for Home Energy eting as an area for furth a sure other potential BC and a segment for remessage to residential segments.	e plan review. Report Gas pr er investigation model errors a sidential prog	Review BCR rogram that on. Review are rams, send		
Keller, Miche	elle	9/15/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	_	Energy to review MA offer	ings			
Keller, Miche	elle Comments for RI Draft	9/20/2022 2023 C&I PLan	.50	198.00	99.00	
Keller, Miche	elle Comments for RI Draft	9/23/2022 2023 C&I Plan	.75	198.00	148.50	
Ross, Samue	el	9/5/2022	2.25	198.00	445.50	
	Review corresp. & key discussions from prior	updates regarding plan re wo weeks	eview and dat	ta .		
Ross, Samue	el	9/6/2022	1.75	198.00	346.50	
	Updates from Craig and OER/RIE check in call;	d Adrian re: cost data upo OER/RIE check in call	lates and pre	p for		
Ross, Samue	el	9/7/2022	2.25	198.00	445.50	
<b>,</b>				nact two		
,	Review of analysis mat weeks; planning out ar	erials re: costs and other nd prioritizing final draft p		j past two		
Ross, Samue	weeks; planning out ar			198.00	544.50	
	weeks; planning out ar el coordinating review do	d prioritizing final draft p	lan review 2.75 er, and other	198.00 prep for	544.50	

Project	863221-000746	5.00 Rhode Island EERMO	C - 2022		Invoice	0000002971
	initial skim of sec deliverables from	ond draft main text; corresp RIE	re: remaining s	econd draft		
Ross, Samu	iel	9/12/2022	4.50	198.00	891.00	
		an review - main text read-th nitial flags from team review	nrough, high-lev	el quant		
Ross, Samu		9/13/2022	5.25	198.00	1,039.50	
,		n quant review initial flags, c			•	
Ross, Samu	-	9/14/2022	6.00	198.00	1,188.00	
•	cont. refinement	of initial items to raise with S v team quant flags; mtgs w/0		edline	·	
Ross, Samu	iel	9/15/2022	3.75	198.00	742.50	
	cont. cost method	dology review and analysis				
Ross, Samu		9/16/2022	5.25	198.00	1,039.50	
•	Review top-line B	CA comps, deep dive on histon assemble detailed question		sis from		
Ross, Samu	•	9/19/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
Ross, Samu		9/20/2022	4.50	198.00	891.00	
. 1003, Juille		sessions re: upcoming calls v			051.00	
Ross, Samu		9/21/2022	2.50	198.00	495.00	
•	prep for, Res revi					
Ross, Samu		9/26/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
-		//Councilors Anderbois and G				
Ross, Samu		9/27/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
-	MPS RFP call with					
Ross, Samu	iel	9/28/2022	4.50	198.00	891.00	
	Fuel cell proj & ot	o and disc. re: timing, update ther updates; EE Docket prep review of interim BC models ges, etc.	call w/S. Chyb	owski and		
Ross, Samu	iel	9/29/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	review and disc c	urrent status of final data sha	aring for EE Plai	n		
Ross, Samu	iel	9/30/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	TWG; TWG and E	ERMC mtg debrief and next	steps			
	Totals		214.50		36,194.25	
	Total La	abor				36,194.25
				Total th	is Task	\$43,347.75
<b></b> Task	03	Education Initiatives				
Profession	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adı	ian	9/1/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
		nal video script and workplar				
Caesar, Adı		9/7/2022	.75	135.00	101.25	
,	EERMC public edu	ucational video script review a carbonization/Electrification	_			
Caesar, Adr	-	9/8/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
•		nandbook updates, Public edu	ucational video			

Project	863221-000746	5.00 Rhode Island EERMO	C - 2022		Invoice	00000029711
Caesar, Adı	rian	9/12/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
,		deo script revisions - Vid 4/5				
Caesar, Adı	rian	9/14/2022	.75	135.00	101.25	
	Updated Education	nal Vid #1-5 script review				
Johnson, C	_	9/8/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
	Review and provide	de comments and edits on El	ERMC Handbool	k updates.		
Johnson, C	_	9/14/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
		al video script for demand re	esponse topic. P	rovide		
	feedback to Rache	el.	F F0		044.50	
	Totals	.h	5.50		844.50	044 50
	Total La	ador				844.50
				Total th	is Task	\$4,642.00
				Total this	Phase	\$48,361.75
<b></b> Phase		Regulatory Proceeding				
Task	02	Develop Technical Mat	erials			
Profession	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
lohnson, C	raig	9/26/2022	3.50	186.00	651.00	
		and plan documents to dev				
Johnson, C	effectiveness and report based on 2 raig Review Sam's feed	s and plan documents to dev cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mo 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide	lating graphics a odels. 3.00 memo and slide	and tables in 186.00 deck.	558.00	
	effectiveness and report based on 2 raig Review Sam's feed Updates to and fir memo.	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mo 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide	lating graphics a odels. 3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-e	186.00 deck. ffectiveness		
	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and fir memo.	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in nalization of memo and slide 9/14/2022	lating graphics a odels. 3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-e	186.00 deck. ffectiveness	558.00 99.00	
	effectiveness and report based on 2 raig Review Sam's feed Updates to and fir memo. uel call with Councilor	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mo 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide	lating graphics a odels. 3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-ei .50 e: PUC docket p	186.00 deck. ffectiveness	99.00	
	effectiveness and report based on 2 traig Review Sam's feed Updates to and fir memo.  uel call with Councilor Totals	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mo 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in nalization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re	lating graphics a odels. 3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-e	186.00 deck. ffectiveness		1 200 00
	effectiveness and report based on 2 raig Review Sam's feed Updates to and fir memo. uel call with Councilor	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mo 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in nalization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re	lating graphics a odels. 3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-ei .50 e: PUC docket p	186.00 deck. ffectiveness 198.00 rep	99.00 1,308.00	1,308.00
Johnson, Ci Ross, Samu	effectiveness and report based on 2 traig Review Sam's feed Updates to and fir memo.  uel call with Councilor Totals	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mo 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in nalization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re	lating graphics a odels. 3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-ei .50 e: PUC docket p	186.00 deck. ffectiveness	99.00 1,308.00	1,308.00 \$1,308.00
	effectiveness and report based on 2 traig Review Sam's feed Updates to and fir memo.  uel call with Councilor Totals	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mo 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in nalization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re	lating graphics a odels. 3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-ei .50 e: PUC docket p	186.00 deck. ffectiveness 198.00 rep	99.00 1,308.00 is Task	•
Ross, Samu	effectiveness and report based on 2 traig Review Sam's feed Updates to and fir memo.  uel call with Councilor Totals	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mo 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in nalization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-electric decket processes 7.00	186.00 deck. ffectiveness 198.00 rep  Total this	99.00 1,308.00 is Task	\$1,308.00
	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feet Updates to and fir memo.  Luel call with Councilor Totals Total La	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski reserved.	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-electric decket processes 7.00	186.00 deck. ffectiveness 198.00 rep  Total this	99.00 1,308.00 is Task	\$1,308.00
Ross, Samu	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Luel call with Councilor Totals Total La	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re  abor  Council Sponsored Mee	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-electric decket processes 7.00	186.00 deck. ffectiveness 198.00 rep  Total this	99.00 1,308.00 is Task	\$1,308.00
Ross, Samu Phase	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Luel call with Councilor Totals Total La	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re  abor  Council Sponsored Mee	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-eight cost-eigh	186.00 deck. ffectiveness 198.00 rep  Total this Total this	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase	\$1,308.00
Ross, Samu Phase Task	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feet Updates to and fir memo.  uel call with Councilor Totals Total La	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re  abor  Council Sponsored Mee Meeting Attendance	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-electory.  .50 e: PUC docket p 7.00  etings & Materia	186.00 deck. ffectiveness 198.00 rep  Total this Total this	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase	\$1,308.00
Ross, Samu Phase Task	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Luel call with Councilor Totals Total La  009 01  nal Personnel	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re  abor  Council Sponsored Mee Meeting Attendance	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-eight cost-eigh	186.00 deck. ffectiveness 198.00 rep  Total this Total this	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase	\$1,308.00
Phase Fask Profession Caesar, Add	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Luel call with Councilor Totals Total Late	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 COakley and S. Chybowski re abor  Council Sponsored Mee Meeting Attendance  9/22/2022 RMC meeting	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-ei .50 e: PUC docket p 7.00  Hours 2.25	and tables in  186.00 deck. ffectiveness  198.00 rep  Total this  Total this  Rate  135.00	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase ————————————————————————————————————	\$1,308.00
Phase Fask Profession Caesar, Add	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Luel call with Councilor Totals Total La  009 01  nal Personnel  rian September 22 EEF rian	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 COakley and S. Chybowski re  abor  Council Sponsored Mee Meeting Attendance  9/22/2022 RMC meeting 9/29/2022	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-electory.  .50 e: PUC docket p 7.00  etings & Materia	186.00 deck. ffectiveness 198.00 rep  Total this Total this	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase	\$1,308.00
Ross, Samu Phase Task Profession Caesar, Adi	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Luel call with Councilor Totals Total La  009 01  nal Personnel  rian September 22 EEF rian Sep 29 EERMC me	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 COakley and S. Chybowski re  abor  Council Sponsored Mee Meeting Attendance  9/22/2022 RMC meeting 9/29/2022	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-ei .50 e: PUC docket p 7.00  Hours 2.25	and tables in  186.00 deck. ffectiveness  198.00 rep  Total this  Total this  Rate  135.00	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase ————————————————————————————————————	\$1,308.00
Ross, Samu Phase Task Profession Caesar, Adi	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Luel call with Councilor Totals Total La  O09 01  nal Personnel  rian September 22 EEF rian Sep 29 EERMC meteralg	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski research  abor  Council Sponsored Mee Meeting Attendance  9/22/2022 RMC meeting 9/29/2022 eeting	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-either cost-eith	and tables in  186.00 deck. ffectiveness  198.00 rep  Total this  Total this  Rate  135.00  135.00  186.00	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase ————————————————————————————————————	\$1,308.00
Phase Task Profession Caesar, Adi	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Lel call with Councilor Totals Total Late Total	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re  abor  Council Sponsored Mee Meeting Attendance  9/22/2022 RMC meeting 9/29/2022 eeting 9/22/2022	lating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-either cost-eith	and tables in  186.00 deck. ffectiveness  198.00 rep  Total this  Total this  Rate  135.00  135.00  186.00	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase ————————————————————————————————————	\$1,308.00
Ross, Samu Phase	effectiveness and report based on 2 fraig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Luel call with Councilor Totals Total La  O09  01  nal Personnel  rian September 22 EEF rian Sep 29 EERMC metariag Attend and preservations	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 Coakley and S. Chybowski re  abor  Council Sponsored Memoral Meeting Attendance  9/22/2022 RMC meeting 9/29/2022 eeting 9/22/2022 at on technical materials at Comparison of the comparison of the comparison of the control of the comparison of the compariso	ating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-ei .50 e: PUC docket p 7.00  Hours 2.25 2.00 2.25 Council meeting. 2.00	and tables in  186.00 deck. ffectiveness  198.00 rep  Total this  Total this  Rate 135.00  135.00  186.00	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase —————— Amount 303.75 270.00 418.50	\$1,308.00
Phase Task Profession Caesar, Adi	effectiveness and report based on 2 craig Review Sam's feed Updates to and firmemo.  Juel Call with Councilor Totals Total La  O09 O1  Inal Personnel  rian September 22 EEF rian Sep 29 EERMC metaraig Attend and preserviraig Attend and preserviraig Attend and preserviraig	cost of supply. Work on upd 023 plan second draft BC Mc 9/27/2022 dback on cost-effectiveness in alization of memo and slide 9/14/2022 COakley and S. Chybowski re  abor  Council Sponsored Mee Meeting Attendance  9/22/2022 RMC meeting 9/29/2022 eeting 9/22/2022 nt on technical materials at C 9/29/2022	ating graphics and odels.  3.00 memo and slide deck for cost-ei .50 e: PUC docket p 7.00  Hours 2.25 2.00 2.25 Council meeting. 2.00	and tables in  186.00 deck. ffectiveness  198.00 rep  Total this  Total this  Rate 135.00  135.00  186.00	99.00 1,308.00 is Task Phase —————— Amount 303.75 270.00 418.50	\$1,308.00

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	000000297114
Ross, Samue		9/29/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
	attend, present at, facili	tatediscussion during EE	RMC mtg			
	Totals		12.75		2,205.75	
	Total Labor					2,205.75
				Total th	is Task	\$2,205.75
	. – – – – – – –					
Task		Develop Technical Mater	ials			
Profession	al Personnel					
C		0/6/2022	Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adri		9/6/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
Caocar Adri		tember EERMC mtg. mat 9/15/2022	eriais develop .50	135.00	67.50	
Caesar, Adri		aft presentation develop		135.00	07.50	
Caesar, Adri		9/16/2022	3.50	135.00	472.50	
cacsar, Aarr		aft presentation develop		155.00	172.50	
Caesar, Adri		9/20/2022	2.50	135.00	337.50	
,		aft presentation develop				
Caesar, Adri		9/21/2022	2.25	135.00	303.75	
		raft presentation develop	ment; additio	nal 2023		
Caesar, Adri	Plan presentation appen	9/23/2022	1.75	135.00	236.25	
Caesar, Auri		ntg materials developmer			250.25	
Caesar, Adri		9/26/2022	3.00	135.00	405.00	
	second draft presentation	ntg. materials developme on, 2023 Plan developme ERMC vote options mem	nt process an	d		
Caesar, Adri	an	9/27/2022	4.00	135.00	540.00	
	second draft presentation	ntg. materials developme on, 2023 Plan developme ERMC vote options mem	nt process an	d		
Caesar, Adri	an	9/28/2022	5.00	135.00	675.00	
	second draft presentation	ntg. materials developme on, 2023 Plan developme ERMC vote options mem	nt process an			
Caesar, Adri	an	9/29/2022	2.00	135.00	270.00	
	September 29 EERMC m second draft presentation	ntg. materials developme on	nt - 2023 Plai	n updated		
Johnson, Cra	_	9/8/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
		erials - Review materials ar and begin updating sl v.				
Johnson, Cra	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	9/14/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
		Development - Begin wor presentation, this includi ent.				
Johnson, Cra		9/16/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
	September 22 Material I Adrian to develop slide of	Development - working s content.	ession with S	am and		

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	000000297114
Johnson, C	Craig	9/20/2022	3.25	186.00	604.50	
	September 22 material					
	residential and income					
	Adrian re: sector conter	t. Discussion with Sam	and Adrian re:	Fuel Cell		
1-1 (	project.	0/24/2022	2.25	100.00	604 50	
Johnson, C	=	9/21/2022	3.25	186.00	604.50	
	September 22 material comments on res conte					
	clean up and prepare fo					
Johnson, C	Craig	9/22/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
	September 22 material meeting presentation or		talking points f	or Council		
Johnson, C	= :	9/26/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
	September 29 Materials					
	including cost-effectiver vote presentation and n	ess report and present				
Johnson, C		9/27/2022	3.00	186.00	558.00	
, -	September 29 Materials					
	consideration memo, as					
	planning outcomes and					
	Working sessions with S	Sam and Adrian on slide	, memo, and re	eport		
lahna (	development.	0/20/2022	F 00	106.00	020.00	
lohnson, C	=	9/28/2022	5.00	186.00	930.00	
	September 29 Materials review and generating penergy. Draft updated s	new content based on u				
Johnson, C	Craig	9/29/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
	September 29 Materials 2023 plan review slide of finalize materials.					
Ross, Sam		9/8/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
,	Council material coord,		ncil attendance			
	presenters; initial plann timing					
Ross, Sam	uel	9/13/2022	.75	198.00	148.50	
,	cont. planning for 9/22					
Ross, Sam		9/19/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
,	RI Council Materials	. ,				
Ross, Sam		9/20/2022	4.00	198.00	792.00	
,	Slides development; rev comment on AC and CJ	riew of Council priority r				
Ross, Sam		9/22/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	final prep of talking point for call with Councilor C	nts, review of materials			250.00	
Ross, Sam		9/23/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
.500, 00111	Council mtg debrief, pla				220.00	
Ross, Sam	= : :	9/26/2022	1.75	198.00	346.50	
1333, 34iii	Mtg materials planning		1.75	150.00	5 10.50	
Ross, Sam		9/27/2022	4.25	198.00	841.50	
waa, aan	complete draft meeting EE Plan deck, work on l	materials, incl. CE repo	rt and presenta	ation, 2023	071.30	
Daga Carr	materials	0/20/2022	2.75	100.00	E44 E0	
Ross, Sam		9/28/2022	2.75	198.00	544.50	
	cont. refinement of Cou them to in fact prepare early documentation for	materials for COuncil m	itg; cont refine	ment of		

Project 863221-0007465.00 Rhode Island EERM	1C - 2022		Invoice	00000029711
Ross, Samuel 9/29/2022	2.25	198.00	445.50	
plan out, finalize, review final council materia		points	11 145 00	
Totals <b>Total Labo</b> r	65.50		11,145.00	11,145.00
rotal Eubor		Takal Ma	io Tools	-
		Total th	IS TASK	\$11,145.00
Task 03 Other Council Respon	– – – – – - nsibilities			
Professional Personnel				
	Hours	Rate	Amount	
Ross, Samuel 9/19/2022	.25	198.00	49.50	
coordinating Councilor briefings later in wk				
Ross, Samuel 9/20/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
check in with Councilor Case				
Ross, Samuel 9/22/2022	.75	198.00	148.50	
Check in with Councilor Oakley to prep for Co	ouncil mtg			
Ross, Samuel 9/29/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
COuncil meeting prep call with Councilors Cas				
Totals	3.00		594.00	
Total Labor				594.00
				+674 70
		Total th	is Task	\$671.50
		Total this	Phase	\$14,022.25
Phase 010 Research, Analysis &	Oth Council Sup	port		
Professional Personnel				
	Hours	Rate	Amount	
Mosenthal, Philip 9/15/2022	.25	212.00		
emails and research re fuel cells			22.00	
			53.00	
Totals	.25			
	.25		53.00	53.00
Totals Total Labor	.25			53.00
	.25			53.00
	.25	Total this	53.00	53.00 \$169.25
Total Labor	.25	Total this 	53.00	
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative	.25 	Total this 	53.00	
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative			53.00 s <b>Phase</b>	
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative  Professional Personnel	 Hours		53.00  S Phase  — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —	
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative  Professional Personnel  Johnson, Craig 9/6/2022			53.00 s <b>Phase</b>	
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative  Professional Personnel  Johnson, Craig 9/6/2022  Meeting with Jesse to close out internship.	<b>Hours</b> .50		53.00  5 Phase  — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —	
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative  Professional Personnel  ohnson, Craig 9/6/2022  Meeting with Jesse to close out internship.  Totals	 Hours		53.00  S Phase  — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —	\$169.25 - — — — —
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative  Professional Personnel  Johnson, Craig 9/6/2022  Meeting with Jesse to close out internship.	<b>Hours</b> .50		53.00  5 Phase  — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — — —	
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative  Professional Personnel  Johnson, Craig 9/6/2022  Meeting with Jesse to close out internship.  Totals	<b>Hours</b> .50		53.00  S Phase  Amount 93.00 93.00	\$169.25 - — — — —
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative  Professional Personnel  Johnson, Craig 9/6/2022  Meeting with Jesse to close out internship.  Totals	<b>Hours</b> .50	Rate 186.00	53.00  S Phase  Amount 93.00 93.00	\$169.25 
Total Labor  Phase 011 Administrative  Professional Personnel  Johnson, Craig 9/6/2022  Meeting with Jesse to close out internship.  Totals	<b>Hours</b> .50	<b>Rate</b> 186.00	53.00  S Phase  Amount 93.00 93.00  S Phase  Project	\$169.25 

# Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc. 4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: CEI RI 9-2022
Invoice Date: September 30, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Se	Amount		
Services Performed 09/01/2022 throug			
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 2.00 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$186.00 \$93.00	Amount Due \$372.00 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for	details.)		\$0.00

TOTAL DUE \$372.00

# Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc. Services Performed 09/01/2022 through 09/30/2022

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
9/12/22	Conducted initial review of revised 2023 plan		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
	Continued review of 2023 plan; discussed same w/other C-team							
9/13/22	members		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	2.00	0.00	0.00	2.00	0.00	2.00
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$372.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$372.00	0.00	\$372.00



**EcoMetric Consulting, LLC** 555 Exton Cms Exton, PA 19341 610.400.8600 admin@ecometricconsulting.com

# **INVOICE**

**BILLED TO** 

Sam Ross Optimal Energy - NV5 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461

TOTAL DUE

\$1,683.00

Project Name RI EEMRC Consultant

7465

Billing Period

Project #

Invoice #

1029-P9-22

Invoice Date 10/04/2022

Due Date 11/03/2022

Payment Terms Net 30

09/03/2022 - 09/30/2022

Task Number	Description	Amount
Task 1	EM&V Oversight	\$1,683.00
Task 2	Program Design & Policy	\$0.00

Subtotal \$1,683.00

\$1,683.00 **Invoice Total** 

Invoice Number 1029-P9-22

Period 09/03/2022 - 09/30/2022

Project	Task	Person	Title	Month	Hours	Rate	Amou	nt
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Salil Gogte	Partner	2022-09	0	\$ 212.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Michael Frischmann	Partner	2022-09	0	\$ 212.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Michael Honeychuck	Managing Consultant	2022-09	8.5	\$ 198.00	\$	1,683.00
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Bitul Sinha	Sr Engineer	2022-09	0	\$ 160.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Cory Read	Data Scientist	2022-09	0	\$ 198.00	\$	-
Total					8.50		\$	1,683.00

fname	Iname	local_date	hours task	notes
Michael	Honeychuck	9/5/2022	0.5 EM&V Oversight	Emails & planning
Michael	Honeychuck	9/6/2022	1 EM&V Oversight	RICE2020 program report reviews
				RICE2020 program report reviews
Michael	Honeychuck	9/7/2022	1.5 EM&V Oversight	Invoice & discussions
				RICE2020 program report reviews
Michael	Honeychuck	9/8/2022	1 EM&V Oversight	Emails
				2023 Plan review
Michael	Honeychuck	9/14/2022	3 EM&V Oversight	Monthly C&I call with C-Team & Company
Michael	Honeychuck	9/20/2022	1 EM&V Oversight	2023 Annual EE Plan review & comments
Michael	Honeychuck	9/28/2022	0.5 EM&V Oversight	Internal team meetings, progress updates, and workload discussions

Energy Futures Group, Inc. PO Box 587 Hinesburg, VT 05461

**INVOICE** 

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number: 5418

Invoice Date: September 30, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services	Description of Services					
Services Performed 9/1/22 through 9/30/22						
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 19.25 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$3,811.50 \$0.00			
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for detail	ls.)		\$0.00			

TOTAL DUE \$3,811.50

#### Energy Futures Group, Inc. Services Performed 9/1/22 through 9/30/22

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
9/1/2022	Review materials for C&I meeting; attend C&I meeting		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
9/1/2022			0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
	Res team meeting, followup, NEEP heat pump and HPWH specs, follow up							
9/1/2022			3.00			3.00	0.00	3.00
	Review July data report		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
	Heat pumps		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	Review RI plan materials; emails with CT		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
· ·	Review 2023 Plan		3.75			3.75	0.00	3.75
	Review RI Plan		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
	Review and comment on 2023 plan draft 2		2.75			2.75	0.00	2.75
	Review and comment of redlined EM&V section and Richard's Residential Plan							
	text comments		1.75			1.75	0.00	1.75
9/15/2022	Check in on RI plan with G. Reed		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
9/16/2022	Rhode Island email communications		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
9/16/2022	Scheduling		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
9/21/2022	Catch up on RI emails		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	Participate in regional Consultants call to discuss HP specifications and alignment with IRA. Tiem also billed to CT and MA		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
9/26/2022	NE consultant meeting		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
9/27/2022	Scheduling Plan review meetings		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
9/29/2022	Sharing/leveraging MA HPWH program design update		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	19.25	0.00	0.00	19.25	0.00	19.25
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$3,811.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$3,811.50	0.00	\$3,811.50

### Ralph Prahl 7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

#### **INVOICE**

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Travel Expenses

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

Invoice Number: 32

Invoice Date: September 30, 2022

Amount

\$0.00

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services

Services Performed 09/01/22 through 09/30/22								
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 6.50 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$1,287.00 \$0.00					

TOTAL DUE \$1,287.00

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
9/2/2022	cust elec report		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
9/3/2022	cust elec impact report		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
9/9/2022	heat pump metering study		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
9/12/2022	2023 eval plan		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
9/14/2022	check-in call; 2023 ev pl; Cannabis report		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
9/16/2022	cannabis report		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
9/19/2022	2023 ev pl		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
9/20/2022	HVAC/food service baseline query from Adrian		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
9/22/2022	query from Adrian on food service standards		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
9/30/2022	C&I custom sample design		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	6.50	0.00	0.00	6.50	0.00	6.50
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$1,287.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,287.00	0.00	\$1,287.00

#### Rachel Sholly Energy Consulting 48 Hudson St. Providence, RI 02909

INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461

Invoice Number:
Invoice Date: Septer

57 September 30, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of So	Amount		
Services Performed 09/01/22 through	9/30/22		
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Admin Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 25.75 1.00 0.00	Hourly Rate \$155.00 \$80.00 \$77.50	Amount Due \$3,991.25 \$80.00 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for	details.)		\$0.00

TOTAL DUE \$4,071.25

Date	Description of Services	006-03 Education Initiative	009-01 Meeting Attendance	009-02 Develop Materials	009-03 Other Council Responsibilitie s	010 - Research, Analysis & Council Support	011 - Admin	Travel	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Sub-Total Admin Hrs.	Total Hours
	C-team planning re: education activities; Videos mtg w/D&S,											
	follow-up; Reviewed edu mtg notes, provided feedback on draft											
	brand/comms RFP	3.75							3.75		0.00	3.75
09/02/22	Video scripts editing	2.00							2.00		0.00	2.00
00/07/00		0.05				0.50			0.75		0.00	0.75
	Reviewed C-team handbook edits; Emails re: education activities C-team planning re: Council mtg agenda, branding RFP,	0.25				0.50			0.75		0.00	0.75
	C-team planning re: Council mtg agenda, branding RFP,	0.25				0.25			0.50		0.00	0.50
09/06/22	папироок	0.25				0.25			0.50		0.00	0.50
:    - 	Drafted & sent LEAD mtg scheduling poll & email; Emails re: video script editing, video scope revisions, coordinating filming, K-12 inperson workshop; Drafted RISE solicitation message for video volunteer; Correspondence re: video SOW mtgs; Reviewed & incorporated video script edits from edu group; Call w/A. Caesar (Optimal) re: DR video; Edited video scripts 1-3 to respond to edu											
	group discussion and account for new filming strategy	4.00					0.50		4.00		0.50	4.50
	Attended & observed GBRI K-12 in-person training; Emails re:	1.00					0.00		1.00		0.00	1.00
	videos filming & SOW mtg, LEAD mtg invoice	2.75					0.25		2.75		0.25	3.00
09/14/22	Sent revised scripts #1-5 to edu group; Scheduling videos SOW mtg; Drafted & sent filming content outline for Malloy case study; Annual report distribution	1.75			0.25		0.25		2.00		0.25	2.25
	C-team planning re: education activities; Call re: videos contract											
	amendments	0.75							0.75		0.00	0.75
	Finalized & sent edu agenda & materials; Sent final video scripts 1-											
	5 to D&S, related emails; Sent agenda & mtg prep direction to											
09/16/22		1.25							1.25		0.00	1.25
	Emails re: video contract revisions; Call re: video contract w/OER,	0.05										
09/19/22	Edu mtg incl. prep & follow-up	0.25 1.75							0.25 1.75		0.00	0.25 1.75
	Edu mig incl. prep & lollow-up Emails re: OER data questions; EERMC mtg attendance (brand	1.75							1./5		0.00	1.75
	RFP, edu comm vote, RIBA presentation)	0.50			0.25				0.75		0.00	0.75
	Call w/D&S, OER & EERMC legal; Correspondence re: videos	3.30			0.23				0.73		0.00	0.13
	contract, budget & SOW revisions	1.25							1.25		0.00	1.25
	Correspondence re: videos contract, budget & SOW revisions	0.25							0.25		0.00	0.25
,	Call w/S. Chybowski (OER) re: videos contract/SOW; Call w/Councilor Teichert & S. Chybowski (OER) re: videos contract/SOW	0.75							0.75		0.00	0.75
09/29/22	C-team planning re: videos contract revisions, Council mtg prep; Emails re: videos contract/SOW; Call w/Councilor Case & S. Chybowski (OER) re: videos contract/SOW	1.50							1.50		0.00	1.50
	Reviewed original video proposals for reference, updated timeline, video shoot planning, related emails	1.50							1.50		0.00	1.50
	Total Hours	24.50	0.00	0.00	0.50	0.75	1.00	0.00	25.75	0.00	1.00	26.75
F	Total Amount	\$3,797.50	\$0.00	\$0.00				\$0.00				\$4,071.25



INVOICE

Date: November 20, 2022

**RI EERMC** 

One Capitol Hill, Providence, RI 02908 steven.chybowski@energy.ri.gov (401)574-9112

#### www.gbrionline.org

#### **GBRI** 1732 1st Ave 20278 New York, NY 10128 info@gbrionline.org (210)858-7783

Sl. No	Item	Hours	Amount
1	Project management- Refining scope, stakeholder management, creating and managing project schedule, communication plan, ongoing communications, organize and run meetings, set-Up Online Teacher's Community of Practice for 6-12 Months on GBRI Website,  Monthly progress reports, KPI reports, End-of-assignment evaluation and report back to the client on lessons learned and suggestions for moving forward.	9	\$606
2	Review current NEEDs curiculum (Energy, Climate and You) and update materials based on feedback from students.	5	\$493
3	Utilize newly prepared materials to deliver on-demand and online-live class room training x 4 Sessions ( Nov 17 2pm, Nov 17 6pm, Nov 19 10am, Nov 19 2pm) and train 163 Educators in Rhode Island	32	\$3,150
4	Develop and implement a marketing and outreach strategy for recruiting teachers to the proposed trainings, make changes reccomended by council, develop website page for registration, update course page, event page, email marketing, social media ads, etc.	32	\$2,800
5	Teacher GiftCards for 205 Teachers @ \$75 per teacher + \$50 per teacher x3	N/A	\$15,525
	Total		\$22,574

#### Thank you for your business!

Pay by check: 1732 1st Ave 20278 New York, NY 10128

Pay by credit card: https://www.paypal.com/invoice/p/#7MNXUD5QSMGHTYRW



10 Charles Street Providence, RI, 02904

401.274.0001 duffyshanley.com

#### Invoice

Rachel Sholly Rhode Island Energy Efficiency and Resource Management Council 460 Harris Avenue, Unit 101 Providence, RI 02909

Invoice Date:

Job: Jul-25-2022 Invoice: 63290A

RIEE-0001, Videos Planning and Management

66 Agency staff hours @\$150 MPA 479 Blended Rate Sept 2021 - July 2022

Represents RIEERMC share (60% of time and expenses for project)

Account service (37 hrs) - project management and planning, researching content and information to build copy and list of prospective visuals for videos 1-7; created deep content outlines for videos 1-3 and reviewed with council before writing scripts; ongoing agency and client communications time

Creative services (22 hrs) - Copywriting for videos 1-3; 2 rounds of edits; creative direction, working with videographer to design look, feel, approach of series, organizing gameplan for stock footage and shooting; creative time for agency team and client meeting/communications.

Production management (7 hrs) - planning production, sourcing videographer, scheduling agency time and resources

Total \$9,900.00

### INVOICE Federal Tax ID# 03-0351557



Remit checks to: Optimal Energy, Inc. PO Box 74008680 Chicago, IL 60674-8680

# Remit ACH transfer to: ABA Routing Number 063100277 Account Number 898052466590 Email ACH/Wire remittance details to RemittanceNotifications@nv5.com

Remit Wire Transfers to: ABA Routing Number 026009593 Account Number 898052466590 Swift Code INTL. BOFAUS3N

October 29, 2022 Project No: 863221-0007465.00 Steven Chybowski Invoice No: 000000300637 Rhode Island Office of Energy Resources Professional Services from October 1, 2022 to October 29, 2022 006 Phase EE Program Planning & Implementation Task 01 Council Representation **Professional Personnel Hours Rate Amount** Johnson, Craig 186.00 93.00 .50 **Totals** .50 93.00 **Total Labor** 93.00 \$93.00 **Total this Task** Task 02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Develop **Professional Personnel Hours** Rate **Amount** Belliveau, Eric .50 212.00 106.00 5,062.50 Caesar, Adrian 37.50 135.00 3,534.00 Johnson, Craig 19.00 186.00 McDonald, Clifford 5.50 198.00 1,089.00 Ross, Samuel 11.00 198.00 2,178.00 **Totals** 73.50 11,969.50 **Total Labor** 11,969.50 **Consultants** Core Energy Insights Inc. 186.00 EcoMetric Consulting, LLC 346.50 Energy Futures Group, Inc. 1.831.50 Jennifer Chiodo 297.00 Ralph Prahl 1,683.00 **Total Consultants** 4,344.00 4,344.00 **Total this Task** \$16,313.50 03 **Education Initiatives** Task **Consultants** Rachel Sholly 4,417.50 **Total Consultants** 4,417.50 4,417.50

Project	863221-0007465.0	00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2	2022		Invoice	000000300
				Total th	is Task	\$4,417.50
				Total this	Phase	\$20,824.00
Phase	008	Regulatory Proceedings				
- — — — — <sup>-</sup> ask	02	Develop Technical Materia	 Is			
Professiona	l Personnel	,				
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar,	Adrian		18.75	135.00	2,531.25	
Calcagni	, Gretchen		.50	198.00	99.00	
Johnson	, Craig		32.25	186.00	5,998.50	
Ross, Sa	muel		31.50	198.00	6,237.00	
	Totals		83.00		14,865.75	
	Total Lab	or				14,865.75
				Total th	is Task	\$14,865.75
				Total this	Phase	\$14,865.75
hase	009	Council Sponsored Meeting	<b>– – – –</b> gs & Materia	 als		
- <b>— — —</b> Гask	01	Meeting Attendance				
Professiona	l Personnel	J				
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar,	Adrian		2.00	135.00	270.00	
Johnson			1.00	186.00	186.00	
Ross, Sa	muel		3.50	198.00	693.00	
	Totals		6.50		1,149.00	
	Total Lab	or				1,149.00
Consultants	5					
Rachel S	•				232.50	
	Total Cor	nsultants			232.50	232.50
				Total th	is Task	\$1,381.50
ask	02	Develop Technical Materia	ls			
rofessiona	l Personnel			_	_	
_			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar,			5.50	135.00	742.50	
Johnson	_		3.25	186.00	604.50	
Ross, Sa			8.00	198.00	1,584.00	
	Totals	<b></b>	16.75		2,931.00	2 024 00
	Total Lab	UF				2,931.00
Consultants						
Rachel S	=				193.75	
	Total Cor	sultants			193.75	193.75
					is Task	\$3,124.75

Project	863221-0007465.0	0 Rhode Island	EERMC - 2022		Invoice	00000030063
Profession	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Ross, S	Samuel		3.50	198.00	693.00	
	Totals		3.50		693.00	
	Total Labo	r				693.00
				Total th	is Task	\$693.00
				Total this	Phase	\$5,199.25
<b></b> Phase	010	Research, Analy	sis & Oth Council Su	pport		
<b>Consultan</b> Rachel					232.50	
	Total Cons	sultants			232.50	232.50
				Total this	Phase	\$232.50
Phase <b>Professio</b> r	011 nal Personnel	Administrative				
Pioiessioi	iai reisoillei		Uarre	Data	A	
Caesar	· Adrian		Hours	Rate	Amount	
	, Adrian		.75	80.00	60.00	
	on, Craig		3.00	80.00	240.00	
Ross, S			.75	80.00	60.00	
	Totals <b>Total Labo</b>		4.50		360.00	360.00
		'1				300.00
Consultan	ts					
Rachel	=				200.00	
	Total Cons	sultants			200.00	200.00
				Total this	Phase	\$560.00
Billing Lin	nits		Current	Prior	To-Date	
Total E	Billings		41,681.50	444,738.25	486,419.75	
Lir	nit				952,976.00	
Re	emaining				466,556.25	
	_			Total this I	nvoice	\$41,681.50
Billings To	n Date					
gs IC	, <b>-</b> 400	Current	Prior	Total		
Labor		32,061.25	338,203.00	370,264.25		
Consul	tant	9,620.25	88,535.25	98,155.50		
Add-or		9,620.23	18,000.00	18,000.00		
Totals		<b>41,681.50</b>	444,738.25	486,419.75		
ioldis	•	41,001.50	444,/30.23	400,413./3		

863221-0007465.00 Rhode Island EERMC - 2022 Project Invoice 000000300637 Billing Backup Tuesday, November 15, 2022 NV5, Inc. Invoice 000000300637 Dated 10/29/2022 Phase 006 EE Program Planning & Implementation 01 Council Representation Task **Professional Personnel** Rate Hours **Amount** 10/19/2022 186.00 93.00 Johnson, Craig .50 Bi-weekly check-in meeting with OER and RI Energy. **Totals** .50 93.00 **Total Labor** 93.00 **Total this Task** \$93.00 02 Task Implementation Oversight & Plan Develop **Professional Personnel Hours** Rate **Amount** 106.00 Belliveau, Eric 10/17/2022 .50 212.00 call with SR on upcoming PUC proceedings, impacts for OEI reporting, discuss deliverables and final months of the year 202.50 Caesar, Adrian 10/3/2022 1.50 135.00 2023 EE Plan BCR model analysis - measure NEI and loadshape IDs OA: RI CustGas PY2021 sample design memo review; steam trap evaluation tool calibration methodology; Caesar, Adrian 10/4/2022 2.25 135.00 303.75 2023 EE plan filing review prep; Social vs. Marginal Abatement Cost of carbon values and sensitivity analysis; TRM database update process and C&I measure input inquiries to RI Energy 2.00 135.00 270.00 Caesar, Adrian 10/5/2022 RI C&I Sector Team call series updates; August C&I data report review and questions for RI energy Caesar, Adrian 10/6/2022 4.50 135.00 607.50 Filed 2023 EE Plan BCR Model review - plan draft deltas/YoY comparisons, measure level input changes; 2023 Cost Effectiveness report updates; Carbon accounting/cost of carbon sensitivity analysis for program cost-effectiveness Caesar, Adrian 10/7/2022 4.25 135.00 573.75 Filed 2023 EE Plan BCR Model review - plan draft deltas/YoY comparisons, measure level input changes; 2023 Cost Effectiveness report updates; Carbon accounting/cost of carbon sensitivity analysis for program cost-effectiveness; Cost of carbon sensitivity one pager for OER; EE program performance data reminders; C&I Sector Team call agenda development 10/11/2022 371.25 Caesar, Adrian 135.00 Proposed Cust Gas sample design and study methodology, PY2021 Custom Gas impact evaluation check in; 2023 Plan C&I BCR model input QA review; October 12 EM&V mtg agenda development Caesar, Adrian 10/12/2022 3.75 135.00 506.25 MA DPU 2022-2024 Plan order review and summary; EERMC pre-filed testimony outline development; Monthly Cross Sector EM&V Meeting; RI/MA BMS offerings and RI EM&V decision-making discussions; EM&V study tracker updates;

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC - 20	)22		Invoice	000000300637
Caesar, Ad	rian	10/13/2022	3.50	135.00	472.50	
		call, and notetaking ; updat 2 Workplan review; Filed E Y changes analysis				
Caesar, Ad	rian	10/14/2022	4.75	135.00	641.25	
	and NTG/measure life co CTA impact analysis; mo Residential data review; C&I market characteriza	testimony development; Fi omps; inquiry to RI Energy onthly C&I Lighting call; Pre Preliminary Q3 Res Data ro tion study workplan review	on EMV inpeliminary Queent develution	outs and 3 opment; 5		
Caesar, Ad		10/17/2022	1.25	135.00	168.75	
		ates; IRA/ARPA funding co docs review; preliminary Q				
Caesar, Ad	rian	10/18/2022	3.25	135.00	438.75	
	Preliminary Q3 data revi	ew and data report develop	oment/revi	ew;		
Caesar, Ad	rian	10/19/2022	.75	135.00	101.25	
	Detailed Q3 res data rep	orting review; preliminary	Q3 data re	port update		
Caesar, Ad		10/24/2022	.50	135.00	67.50	
	Preliminary Q3 data repo data updates	ort review and quarterly pro	ogram perf	ormance		
Caesar, Ad	rian	10/25/2022	1.50	135.00	202.50	
Cassar Ad	oversight tracker update PY2020 impact evaluation study updated workplan	onstration discussion; 2022 as - C&I data report question full program report revie and CT NRNC baseline res	ons; Custon w, C&I NC ults review	n Electric baseline	125.00	
Caesar, Ad		10/27/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00	
	evaluation studies	trap tool discussion for on	going Cust	Jas Impact		
Johnson, C	Craig	10/7/2022	4.00	186.00	744.00	
	final cost-effectiveness r ensure no changes in re- incentive costs. Res Sector Work - Revie	Review final numbers to be eport. Review final electric sidential/income eligible pro w meeting notes from last ort, and prep for developin	and gas boograms. Remonths me	eview non- eeting,		
Johnson, C	Craig	10/11/2022	.75	186.00	139.50	
	need to be completed or update presentation to (	scuss final review items wit n filed plan so findings can Council. Review language u C-Team understanding of	be incorpo pdates in f	rated into iled Plan to		
Johnson, C	•	10/12/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
•	Annual Plan Review - Re	view narrative of filed plan to unexpected changes we				
Johnson, C	Craig	10/13/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
•	Sector Team - Review for meeting. Prepare agend- with Margie and Richard	ollow-up items from last mo a and send to sector team re: C-Team follow-up item data report, and prepare o	attendees. Is from Sep	Follow-up tember		
Johnson, C		10/17/2022	3.00	186.00	558.00	

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	00000030063
	Residential Sector Team Energy. Meeting prep, ir follow-ups to September questions re: vendor contopics for upcoming sectofollow-ups.	ncluding review of mater r meeting, review month ntracts, and develop list	rials Richard d nly data report of potential n	listributed as t, prepare neeting		
Johnson, C	•	10/19/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
, or in 3011, C	Sector Team - initial rev				232.30	
Johnson, C		10/20/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	
,	Sector Team - Continue September.					
lohnson, C	raig	10/21/2022	.50	186.00	93.00	
	2023 Plan Review - Disc Energy's filed TRM with		e for reviewing	g RI		
Iohnson, C	raig	10/25/2022	2.25	186.00	418.50	
	Annual Plan Review - Be residential and income e preliminary Q3 residenti	eligible measures. Sector	, -	•		
Johnson, C	=	10/27/2022	2.00	186.00	372.00	
	Continue review of preli		•			
Johnson, C	=	10/28/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
	Continue review preliming items from October resident topics and agenda for N data report.	dential sector team mee	ting and draft	meeting		
McDonald,		10/3/2022	3.75	198.00	742.50	
	Rate and bill impact mod					
McDonald,		10/6/2022	1.75	198.00	346.50	
2 6	Rate and bill impact disc		4.50	100.00	207.00	
Ross, Samı	extnded check in with O PIM, upcoming workstre		1.50 frief, SCC, fina	198.00 al plan filing,	297.00	
Ross, Samı		10/4/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	Council materials planning w/AC					
Ross, Samı	iel	10/6/2022	4.00	198.00	792.00	
	rate and bill impacts mt model review from AC; i OER request					
Ross, Samı	•	10/7/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
	team task scoping leading reviewcarbon pricing me		comment, re-	-		
Ross, Samı	el	10/10/2022	.75	198.00	148.50	
	Final BC Model QA/revie	=	_			
Ross, Samı		10/11/2022	.75	198.00	148.50	
	Oversee, review findings	-	• •			
Ross, Samı		10/12/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
Door C	Oversee, review findings	_	-		100.00	
Ross, Samı		10/19/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	SRP TWG Totals		73.50		11,969.50	
	Total Labor		75.50		11,503.30	11,969.50
	i otai Labui					,
				Total thi	s Task	\$16,313.50
	03	Education Initiatives				
Task	03	Education Initiatives				

Proiect	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC - 2022	Invoice	000000300637
1 10 1000	003221 0007 103.00	TOTOGE ISIGNA ELIGINE ZOZZ	11140100	00000000000

				Total this Task		\$4,417.50	
				Total this	Phase	\$20,824.00	
Phase	008	Regulatory Proceedings					
Task	02	Develop Technical Material	<b></b> Is				
Profession	nal Personnel						
			Hours	Rate	Amount		
Caesar, Adı		10/18/2022	.75	135.00	101.25		
		stimony and pre-filed EE testimo					
Caesar, Adı		10/19/2022	.50	135.00	67.50		
	EERMC budget tes development	stimony analysis and pre-filed EE	testimony				
Caesar, Adı		10/20/2022	2.50	135.00	337.50		
		stimony analysis and pre-filed EE RMC budget development, EE pla pase,		ess, cost			
Caesar, Adı		10/21/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00		
	development - EE	stimony analysis and pre-filed EE RMC budget development, EE pla 1 database QA review		ess; filed			
Caesar, Adı	rian	10/24/2022	1.00	135.00	135.00		
		MC pre-filed testimony developm I database QA review, carbon be					
Caesar, Adı	rian	10/25/2022	4.00	135.00	540.00		
		MC pre-filed testimony developm I database QA review, carbon be					
Caesar, Adı	rian	10/26/2022	1.75	135.00	236.25		
		MC pre-filed testimony developm I database QA review, carbon be					
Caesar, Adı	rian	10/27/2022	3.75	135.00	506.25		
	assumptions, TRM	MC pre-filed testimony developm I database QA review, carbon be ESC 2021 supplemental study an eview	nefits calcu	lations, Plan			
Caesar, Adı	rian	10/28/2022	3.50	135.00	472.50		
	assumptions, TRM review process; A	MC pre-filed testimony developm 1 database QA review, carbon be ESC 2021 supplemental study an view; Cost of Carbon discussion	nefits calcu d MA DPU (	lations, Plan			
Calcagni, G		10/6/2022	.50	198.00	99.00		
		social cost of carbon					
Johnson, C	-	10/11/2022	.50	186.00	93.00		
		te 2023 EE Plan Cost-Effectivener to prepare document for filing.	ss report an				
Johnson, C	_	10/14/2022	2.00	186.00	372.00		
	meeting minutes to Council budget de materials to be inc	development - go back through for meetings held between March evelopment was discussed. Create cluded in pre-file testimony and a h material and how it is related t	n and July w e list of all r assemble br	/here elevant ief			

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC	- 2022		Invoice	000000300637
Johnson, C	Craig	10/18/2022	1.75	186.00	325.50	
·	Meeting with Sam, Pete and documentation. Rev filling out guidance docutestimony.	r, and Marisa to discuss riew guidance document	provided by I	PUC. Begin		
Johnson, C	•	10/19/2022	2.75	186.00	511.50	
ŕ	EERMC Budget developr filling out guidance docu Peter to review pre-file setting guidance docum	nent testimony developi iment from PUC. Meetin testimony strategy, and	ment - continu g with Sam, M	larisa, and		
Johnson, C	Craig	10/20/2022	4.75	186.00	883.50	
	Draft EERMC budget de on updated YTD and ye materials for and write u process for adjusting its pre-file testimony narrat budget.	ar-end forecast for Coun up pre-file testimony nar 2022 budget. Source m	icil legal servion rative on Cou aterials for an	ces. Source ncil's d write up		
Johnson, C	Craig	10/21/2022	6.25	186.00	1,162.50	
	Draft EERMC budget de file testimony on Council Council pre-file testimor between 2022 budget a increases and decreases description of new budg list. Discussions with Sa iterate draft. Finalize an review.	I's process for developin y for budget table, expl nd 2022 year-end foreca in 2023 budget compar et items in 2023. Finaliz m regarding same, inclu	g its 2023 bud anation of var ast, description red to 2022, a e initial draft of ding working	dget. Draft iances n of nd of exhibit session to		
Johnson, C		10/24/2022	4.50	186.00	837.00	
	FERMC budget developr from Marisa on initial dr session with Marisa and budget table based on F testimony and exhibits t	aft. Update testimony ac Sam to finalize testimor UC guidance document.	ccordingly. Wony. Develop ex Send update	orking khibit for		
Johnson, C	·	10/25/2022	1.50	186.00	279.00	
	EERMC budget developr and footnote references legal counsel for submis	are accurate and prepa				
Johnson, C	Craig	10/26/2022	5.75	186.00	1,069.50	
	Begin review and catalo second, and third sets of Initial review of question require re-examination of budget development. Reference testimony - Review mintestimony with Sam. Crefinto proper format. Development testimony. Send	f information requests in topics to ensure none of content in pre-file test eview and provide committee testimony. EERMC bor edits to EERMC budgeate cover page for pre-felop introduction and co	n 2023 EE Plan are related to timony for Cou nents on initial udget develop et developme file testimony. ncluding ques	n Docket. and would uncil 2023 draft of oment nt pre-file Merge Q&A tions for		
Johnson, C	•	10/27/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
	Working session with Ac comments of EERMC no res cost concern examp	Irian and Sam to review n-budget pre-file testim	initial draft ar	nd	_32.00	
Johnson, C		10/28/2022	1.25	186.00	232.50	
	Develop Non-Budget Pro and provide additional c residential cost increase	omments. Draft languag				
Ross, Samı		10/12/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
Ross, Samı	EE docket prep call, pre	p re: same 10/13/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
i Coo, ouill	uci	10/13/2022	2.00	170.00	330.00	

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC -	2022		Invoice	0000003006
		tand basis for EERMC budg calls w/EERMC Council and				
Ross, Samue	•	10/14/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	team discussion re: ne Council budgetary filir	ext steps, initial work to fra ng requirement	me out appro	oach to		
Ross, Samue		10/18/2022	2.00	198.00	396.00	
	prep for, call with Mar testimony	isa and Peter to affirm C-T	eam plan for	budget		
Ross, Samue		10/19/2022	5.00	198.00	990.00	
	C-Team; call w/ Councitems, forecasts, and	ining, workstream definitio cilor Oakley re: same; revie notes; call with OER & RIE nd Councilor Case re: same	ew initial tablere: same; wo	e of budget		
Ross, Samue	l	10/20/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
	disc to review initial of Oakley continuing con	utlines for non-budget test v. re: docket prep	imony; call w	/Councilor		
Ross, Samue		10/21/2022	3.25	198.00	643.50	
	review, edit, call to fin review	alize draft budget testimor	ny for distribu	ition for		
Ross, Samue		10/24/2022	1.25	198.00	247.50	
	same	w/M Desautel, meet and p	lan out next :	steps re:		
Ross, Samue		10/25/2022	2.50	198.00	495.00	
	budget testimony revi testimony	ew, frame out and assign p	oriorities for r	non-budget		
Ross, Samue		10/26/2022	5.75	198.00	1,138.50	
	formatting/framing, in	nd revisions to budget test tros, etc; detailed review, ; PUC docket call w/Steve				
Ross, Samue	el .	10/27/2022	2.50	198.00	495.00	
Daga Camura	= -	development and review v 10/28/2022		-	247 50	
Ross, Samue	review of updates to r	non-budget testimony, assi le verbal technical review o		198.00 otential cost	247.50	
Ross, Samue		10/29/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
·	Final review, edits, co	mments for Council review non-budget testimony	, questions fo	or legal		
	Totals		83.00		14,865.75	
	Total Labor	•				14,865.75
				Total th	is Task	\$14,865.75
				Total this	s Phase	\$14,865.75
Phase	009	Council Sponsored Meeti	ngs & Materia	 als 		
Task	01	Meeting Attendance				
Professiona	al Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Caesar, Adria	an	10/20/2022	2.00	135.00	270.00	
	OCtober EERMC Mtg.					
Johnson, Cra	nia.	10/20/2022	1.00	186.00	186.00	

863221-0007465.	00 Rhode Island EERMO	C - 2022		Invoice	000000300637
Attend technical por meeting virtually.	rtion of C-Team presentation	on at October C	ouncil		
iel OER/RIE check in ca	10/4/2022 all	.50	198.00	99.00	
		3.00	198.00	594.00	
Totals	5/ 1	6.50		1,149.00	
Total Lab	or				1,149.00
			Total th	is Task	<b>\$1,381.50</b>
			i otai tii	is rask	\$1,361.30
02	Develop Technical Mat	erials			
nal Personnel					
		Hours	Rate	Amount	
rian	10/6/2022	.25	135.00	33.75	
October EERMC mtg and presentation,	g. materials prep - updated	l cost effectiven	ess report		
rian	10/7/2022	1.75	135.00	236.25	
		- outline and			
rian	10/11/2022	.25	135.00	33.75	
October EERMC Mtg presentation	g. Materials Development -	2023 EE Plan fi	ling		
rian	10/12/2022	1.75	135.00	236.25	
		2023 EE Plan fi	ling		
rian	10/13/2022	1.50	135.00	202.50	
raig	10/11/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
not update is neede since not much has	ed. Decision to hold off on happened since last updat	update until No	vember		
-	10/12/2022	.25	186.00	46.50	
Mtg Materials - Wor	k on drafting list of outstar	nding concerns	for Council		
raig	10/13/2022	2.75	186.00	511.50	
polish of C-Team 20 session with Sam ar update presentation	023 filed plan update prese nd Adrian re: same. Packag n, Q3 activities report, Coul less report to OER for post	ntation and wo ge and send file ncil handbook u	rking d plan pdate, and		
ıel	10/7/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
iel	10/11/2022	.75	198.00	148.50	
	-				
iel	10/12/2022	2.25	198.00	445.50	
=		=			
iel	10/13/2022	3.00	198.00	594.00	
review and finalize s	slides, other council materi	als; coord. tean	n re:		
finalization and sub	mission of same 10/15/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	meeting virtually.  Itel  OER/RIE check in content  Attend ExCom, Count Totals  Total Lab  Total La	meeting virtually.  Itel 10/4/2022  OER/RIE check in call  Itel 10/20/2022  Attend ExCom, Council meeting, present and it Totals  Totals  Total Labor   Develop Technical Materials Prepsent and presentation, Totals and presentation, Total EEP Plan presentation development sector/program level data updates in 10/11/2022  October EERMC Mtg. Materials Development - presentation  Total Personnel  Develop Technical Materials Development and presentation, Total Personnel  Total Personnel  Develop Technical Materials prep - updated and presentation, Total Personnel  Total Personnel  Develop Technical Materials prep - updated and presentation development sector/program level data updates  Total Personnel  Develop Technical Materials prep - updated and presentation development sector/program level data updates  Total Personnel  Develop Technical Materials prep - updated and presentation development sector/program level data updates  Total Personnel  Develop Technical Materials prep - updated and presentation development sector/program level data updates  Total Personnel  Develop Technical Materials prep - updated sector/presentation development sector/program level data updates  Develop Technical Materials Development sector/program level data updates  Develop Technical Materials Development sector/presentation data updates  Develop Technical Materials Development sector/presentation and appendix updates, EERMC have presentation and appendix updates presentation and appendix updates presentation and appendix update presentation and appendix updates presentation and appendix update presentation and appendix updates presentation and appendix	meeting virtually.  Iel 10/4/2022 .50  OER/RIE check in call  Iel 10/20/2022 3.00  Attend ExCom, Council meeting, present and facilitate Council Totals 6.50  Total Labor  O2 Develop Technical Materials  Ial Personnel  Hours  Ian 10/6/2022 .25  October EERMC mtg. materials prep - updated cost effectiven and presentation, ian 10/7/2022 1.75  2023 Filed EE Plan presentation development - outline and sector/program level data updates  Ian 10/11/2022 .25  October EERMC Mtg. Materials Development - 2023 EE Plan fip presentation  Ian 10/12/2022 1.75  October EERMC Mtg. Materials Development - 2023 EE Plan fip presentation and appendix updates  Ian 10/13/2022 1.50  October EERMC Mtg. Materials Development - 2023 EE Plan filin presentation and appendix updates  Ian 10/13/2022 1.50  October EERMC Mtg. Materials finalization - 2023 EE Plan filin presentation and appendix updates, EERMC handbook update raig 10/11/2022 2.5  Mtg Materials - Review last TWG update memo and identify we not update is needed. Decision to hold off on update until No since not much has happened since last update memo. Prep in November meeting.  Iaig 10/12/2022 2.5  Mtg Materials - Work on drafting list of outstanding concerns to consider including in pre-file testimony.  Iaig 10/13/2022 2.75  Mtg Materials - Finalize meeting materials, including final revisue polish of C-Team 2023 filed plan update presentation and wor session with Sam and Adrian re: same. Package and send file update presentation, Q3 activities report, Council handbook update presentation, Q3 activities report, Council handbook update presentation, Q3 activities report, Council handbook update presentation, Q3 activities report, Council materials and L0/11/2022 1.00  Iaid 10/11/2022 1.00  Iaid 10/12/2022 2.25  Iaid and Iaid 10/12/2022 2	rel 10/4/2022 .50 198.00  OER/RIE check in call rel 10/20/2022 3.00 198.00  Attend Excom, Council meeting, present and facilitate Council discussion Totals 6.50  Total Labor  Total Labor  Total Labor  Total Personnel    Hours   Rate	meeting virtually.  In the content of the content o

	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERM	C - 2022		Invoice	000000300637
Ross, Samu		10/20/2022	.50	198.00	99.00	
	talking points prep & dis session agenda	scussion facilitation ap	proach for testii	mony, LEAD		
	Totals		16.75		2,931.00	
	Total Labor					2,931.00
				Total th	is Task	\$3,124.75
<b>– – – –</b> Task	03	Other Council Respons	. — — — — - sibilities			
Professior	nal Personnel					
			Hours	Rate	Amount	
Ross, Samu	iel	10/7/2022	1.00	198.00	198.00	
	debrief with Chair Oakle	y to catch him up on I	ast wk's council	l mtg		
Ross, Samu	iel	10/10/2022	.25	198.00	49.50	
	scheduling Councilor che					
Ross, Samu		10/11/2022	.75	198.00	148.50	
	MPS cost proposalreviev					
Ross, Samu		10/12/2022	1.50	198.00	297.00	
	prep for, 1-on-1 with Co	ouncilor Case	_			
	Totals		3.50		693.00	407.55
	Total Labor					693.00
				Total th	is Task	\$693.00
						+F 400 3F
				Total this	Phase	\$5,199.25
	010		oth Council Sun		Phase — — — — — —	\$5,199.25 
<b>_                                    </b>	010	Research, Analysis & C	. — — — — . Oth Council Sup			\$5,199.25  \$232.50
		Research, Analysis & C	Oth Council Sup	 port		
<b>– – – -</b> Phase	011		Oth Council Sup	 port		
— — — — — — Phase — — — — — — Phase Profession				 port		
 Phase <b>Professio</b> n		Administrative	Hours	port  Total this	Phase	
 Phase <b>Professio</b> n	011 / nal Personnel	Administrative		 port		
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr	011 nal Personnel rian Q3 CTeam activities rep	Administrative  10/11/2022 ort	<b>Hours</b> .25	port  Total this  Rate 80.00	Phase Amount 20.00	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr	011  nal Personnel  rian  Q3 CTeam activities repririan	Administrative  10/11/2022  ort  10/12/2022	Hours	port  Total this	Phase	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr	011  nal Personnel  rian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian	Administrative  10/11/2022  ort  10/12/2022	<b>Hours</b> .25	port  Total this  Rate 80.00	Phase Amount 20.00	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr	011  nal Personnel  rian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian	10/11/2022 ort 10/12/2022 ort 10/13/2022	Hours .25	Total this  Rate 80.00	Phase  Amount 20.00 20.00	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr	011  nal Personnel  rian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  C-Team Q3 activities reprian	10/11/2022 ort 10/12/2022 ort 10/13/2022	Hours .25	Total this  Rate 80.00	Phase  Amount 20.00 20.00	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr	011  nal Personnel  rian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  C-Team Q3 activities reprian	10/11/2022  ort 10/13/2022  ort 10/13/2022  oort 10/11/2022	Hours .25 .25 .25	Total this  Rate 80.00 80.00	Amount 20.00 20.00	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr	011  nal Personnel  rian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  C-Team Q3 activities reprian  Develop content for C-T	10/11/2022  ort 10/13/2022  ort 10/13/2022  oort 10/11/2022	Hours .25 .25 .25	Total this  Rate 80.00 80.00	Amount 20.00 20.00	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr	011  nal Personnel  rian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  C-Team Q3 activities reprian  Develop content for C-T	Administrative  10/11/2022 ort 10/12/2022 ort 10/13/2022 port 10/11/2022 feam Q3 Activities Rep 10/13/2022 d Rachel additions to 0	Hours .25 .25 .25 .25 .25 .25 .50 ort.	Total this  Total this  Rate 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00	Phase  Amount 20.00 20.00 20.00 200.00	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Johnson, Cr	o11  rian Q3 CTeam activities reprian Q3 CTeam activities reprian C-Team Q3 activities repraig Develop content for C-Traig Review Sam, Adrian, and content and finalize doc	Administrative  10/11/2022 ort 10/12/2022 ort 10/13/2022 port 10/11/2022 feam Q3 Activities Rep 10/13/2022 d Rachel additions to 0	Hours .25 .25 .25 .25 .25 .25 .50 ort.	Total this  Total this  Rate 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00	Phase  Amount 20.00 20.00 20.00 200.00	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Johnson, Cr	o11  rian Q3 CTeam activities reprian Q3 CTeam activities reprian C-Team Q3 activities repraig Develop content for C-Traig Review Sam, Adrian, and content and finalize doc	10/11/2022 ort 10/12/2022 ort 10/13/2022 oort 10/11/2022 feam Q3 Activities Rep 10/13/2022 d Rachel additions to 0 ument. 10/12/2022	Hours .25 .25 .25 .25 ort50 Q3 Activities Re	Rate 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 port, merge	Phase  Amount 20.00 20.00 20.00 40.00	
Phase Profession Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Caesar, Adr Johnson, Cr	011  nal Personnel  rian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  C-Team Q3 activities repriaig  Develop content for C-Traig  Review Sam, Adrian, and content and finalize docused	10/11/2022 ort 10/12/2022 ort 10/13/2022 oort 10/11/2022 feam Q3 Activities Rep 10/13/2022 d Rachel additions to 0 ument. 10/12/2022	Hours .25 .25 .25 .25 ort50 Q3 Activities Re	Rate 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 port, merge	Phase  Amount 20.00 20.00 20.00 40.00	
<b>– – – –</b> Phase	011  nal Personnel  rian  Q3 CTeam activities reprian  C-Team Q3 activities repraig  Develop content for C-Traig  Review Sam, Adrian, and content and finalize docted  adding content to quarter	10/11/2022 ort 10/12/2022 ort 10/13/2022 oort 10/11/2022 feam Q3 Activities Rep 10/13/2022 d Rachel additions to 0 ument. 10/12/2022	Hours .25 .25 .25 .25 .25 ort50 Q3 Activities Re	Rate 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 port, merge	Phase  Amount 20.00 20.00 20.00 40.00 60.00	

Project	863221-0007465.00	Rhode Island EERMC - 2022	Invoice	000000300637
			Total this Project	\$41,681.50
			Total this Report	\$41,681.50

### Margie Lynch/Core Energy Insights, Inc. 4445 E. Hoback River Road, Jackson, WY 83001

### **INVOICE**

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461

Invoice Number: Invoice Date:

CEI RI 10-2022 October 31, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy

Descrip	otion of Services	Amoun

Services Performed 10/01/2022 through 10/31/2022

	<u>Hours</u>	Hourly Rate	Amount Due
LABOR - Regular Hours	1.00	\$186.00	\$186.00
LABOR - Travel Hours	0.00	\$93.00	\$0.00

**Travel Expenses** \$0.00 (See attached travel expense form for details.)

> \$186.00 **TOTAL DUE**

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
10/17/22	Participated in Res Sector Team meeting		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	1.00	0.00	0.00	1.00	0.00	1.00
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$186.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$186.00	0.00	\$186.00



EcoMetric Consulting, LLC 555 Exton Cms Exton, PA 19341 610.400.8600 admin@ecometricconsulting.com

## **INVOICE**

**BILLED TO** 

Project #

Sam Ross Optimal Energy - NV5 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 TOTAL DUE

\$346.50

Project Name RI EEMRC Consultant

7465

Invoice # 1029-P10-22

Billing Period 10/01/2022 - 10/28/2022

Invoice Date 11/03/2022

Due Date 12/03/2022

Payment Terms Net 30

Task Number	Description	Amount
Task 1	EM&V Oversight	\$346.50
Task 2	Program Design & Policy	\$0.00

Subtotal \$346.50

Invoice Total \$346.50

Invoice Number 1029-P10-22

Period 10/01/2022 - 10/28/2022

Project	Task	Person	Title	Month	Hours	Rate	Amount	
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Salil Gogte	Partner	2022-10	0	\$ 212.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Michael Frischmann	Partner	2022-10	0	\$ 212.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Michael Honeychuck	Managing Consultant	2022-10	1.75	\$ 198.00	\$	346.50
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Bitul Sinha	Sr Engineer	2022-10	0	\$ 160.00	\$	-
RI EEMRC Consultant	EM&V Oversight	Cory Read	Data Scientist	2022-10	0	\$ 198.00	\$	-
Total					1.75		\$	346.50

fname	Iname	local_date	hours	task	notes
					Invoice & discussions
Michael	Honeychuck	10/4/2022	1	EM&V Oversight	Emails
Michael	Honeychuck	10/12/2022	0.75	EM&V Oversight	Monthly C&I EM&V call

Energy Futures Group, Inc. PO Box 587 Hinesburg, VT 05461

**INVOICE** 

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3

Hinesburg, VT 05461

Invoice Number:

5468

Invoice Date:

October 31, 2022

Amount

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

Services Performed 10/1/22 through	gh 10/31/22		
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 9.25 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$1,831.50 \$0.00
Travel Expenses			\$0.00

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$1,831.50

### Energy Futures Group, Inc. Services Performed 10/1/22 through 10/31/22

			006-02					
		006-01	Implementation			Sub-Total	Sub-Total	
		Council	Oversight & Plan	006-03		Regular	Travel	Total
Date	Description of Services	Representation	Development	Education Initiative	Travel Time	Hrs.	Hrs.	Hours
10/5/2022	Check-in call w/Richard		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
10/5/2022	HPWH standards review, share with team		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
	Review agenda from Adrian; respond with comments; sharepoint							
10/10/2022	access		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
10/13/2022	C&I sector team call		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
10/13/2022	RI contracts follow up		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
10/14/2022	Lighting subgroup agenda; lighting subgroup meeting; send notes		1.75			1.75	0.00	1.75
	HPWH follow up		1.50			1.50	0.00	1.50
10/17/2022	October Res Sector meeting, follow up with IRA principles list		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
	Review HPWH standards and windows, respond to follow up from							
10/18/2022	last meeting.		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
	RI emails; review performance lighting analysis from Erica; draft							
	and send response		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
10/21/2022	Follow-up with Travis re: NC baseline		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
10/25/2022	NASEO lableing quarterly meeting focused on IRA (split with CT		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	9.25	0.00	0.00	9.25	0.00	9.25
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$1,831.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,831.50	0.00	\$1,831.50

Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo

JLC Consulting, LLC 52 Bent Creek Road Hinesburg, VT 05461

INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461

Travel Expenses

(See attached travel expense form for details.)

Invoice Number: R-22.04
Invoice Date: October 31, 2022

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of	Amount		
Services Performed 10/1/2022 through			
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 1.50 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$297.00 \$0.00

TOTAL DUE \$297.00

\$0.00

Payable to: Jennifer Chiodo Services Performed 10/1/2022 through 10/31/2022

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
10/6/2022	Emails, access shared site		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
10/24/2022	Review and comment on Q3 rpt		1.25			1.25	0.00	1.25
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	1.50	0.00	0.00	1.50	0.00	1.50
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$297.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$297.00	0.00	\$297.00

## Ralph Prahl 7001 Stanhope Place, University Park FL 34201

## **INVOICE**

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461 Invoice Number:

33

Invoice Date:

October 31, 2022

Amount

OEI Project #: 7465

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of Services

Services Performed 10/01/22 through	gh 10/31/22		
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 8.50 0.00	<u>Hourly Rate</u> \$198.00 \$99.00	Amount Due \$1,683.00 \$0.00
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form f	or details.)		\$0.00

**TOTAL DUE** 

\$1,683.00

Date	Description of Services	006-01 Council Representation	006-02 Implementation Oversight & Plan Development	006-03 Education Initiative	Travel Time	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub- Total Travel Hrs.	Total Hours
10/1/2022	C&I custom impact study		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
10/2/2022	custom gas impact sample design memo		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
10/3/2022	custom gas impact eval		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
10/8/2022	custom gas impact		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
10/10/2022	custom gas impact – steam trap issue		0.50			0.50	0.00	0.50
10/11/2022	steam trap impact methods issue – conf call		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
10/12/2022	check-in call; cannabis report rev		0.75			0.75	0.00	0.75
10/13/2022	NRNC baseline study		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
10/14/2022	NRNC baseline study res plan		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
10/16/2022	NRNC baseline res plan, custom electric impact report		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
10/23/2022	swarmstat pilot		0.25			0.25	0.00	0.25
	swarmstat study conf call; NRNC baseline res plan; custom gas							
10/25/2022	res plan		2.25			2.25	0.00	2.25
10/27/2022	custom gas/steam trap impact issues – conf call + prep		1.00			1.00	0.00	1.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
						0.00	0.00	0.00
	Total Hours	0.00	8.50	0.00	0.00	8.50	0.00	8.50
	Total Amount	\$0.00	\$1,683.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,683.00	0.00	\$1,683.00

## Rachel Sholly Energy Consulting 48 Hudson St. Providence, RI 02909

INVOICE

TO: Optimal Energy Inc. 10600 Route 116, Suite 3 Hinesburg, VT 05461

Invoice Number: 58

October 31, 2022 Invoice Date:

7465 OEI Project #:

Work Performed for RI Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council

Description of S	Amount					
Services Performed 10/01/22 through						
LABOR - Regular Hours LABOR - Admin Hours LABOR - Travel Hours	<u>Hours</u> 32.75 2.50 0.00	Hourly Rate \$155.00 \$80.00 \$77.50	Amount Due \$5,076.25 \$200.00 \$0.00			
Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for	Travel Expenses (See attached travel expense form for details.)					

**TOTAL DUE** \$5,276.25

Date	Description of Services	006-03 Education Initiative	009-01 Meeting Attendance	009-02 Develop Materials	009-03 Other Council Responsibilities	010 - Research, Analysis & Council Support	011 - Admin	Travel	Sub-Total Regular Hrs.	Sub-Total Travel Hrs.	Sub- Total Admin Hrs.	Total Hours
	Reviewed talking points for video shoot; Outlined proposed visuals for video #5	0.75						'	0.75		0.00	0.75
	Coordinating RISE case study filming for edu videos; Emails re:	0.73							0.73	-	0.00	0.73
	edu contracts; Emails w/GBRI re: presentation follow-up, new							1			1	1
10/04/22	contract kick-off	1.25							1.25		0.00	1.25
	Reviewed GBRI invoice, referenced prior invoices & contract; Revised video #1 script per Education Committee discussion	1.50						1	1.50		0.00	1.50
	C-team planning re: Council mtg agenda & materials, handbook,								1			1
	LEAD session, education contracts; Sent new LEAD scheduling							1			1	1
	poll email; Emailed EERMC legal re: Council budget question;							1			1	1
	Reviewed draft GBRI contract; Drafted visuals suggestions for							1			1	1
	videos #1-4	3.75					0.25	1	3.75		0.25	4.00
	Reviewed D&S video contract amendment; Call w/D&S, OER re:											
	video filming; Organized/consolidated video visuals lists, emails							I			1	1
	re: Malloy shoot; Reviewed GBRI contract incl. other admin docs							1			1	1
10/07/22	for reference, related emails	3.25						1	3.25		0.00	3.25
	Emails re: videos & new GBRI contract	0.25							0.25		0.00	0.25
	Drafted edu agenda, sent to OER; Q3 activities report; LEAD							 I	1			
10/12/22	session content planning; Corrdinating RISE video shoot	0.50		0.25			1.00	I	0.75		1.00	1.75
	Mtg w/RISE re: customer video shoot, follow-up notes, review of											1
	job summaries, related correspondence; Final review of GBRI							I			1	1
	and D&S contracts; Mtg w/GBRI & OER incl. mtg prep; Videos							I			1	1
	check-in mtg w/D&S and OER; C-team planning re: Council mtg							I			1	1
	agenda & materials incl. handbook, LEAD session; Reviewed C-							I			1	1
10/13/22	team edits & finalized handbook update	3.00				1.50		1	4.50		0.00	4.50
	Energy expo kick-off mtg	1.00							1.00		0.00	1.00
10/16/22	Finalized & sent edu agenda & materials	1.25							1.25		0.00	1.25
	RISE video shoot coordination; Reviewed and drafted responses to brand RFP questions; Videos check-in mtg w/D&S	3.00							3.00		0.00	3.00
10/19/22	Reviewed D&S invoice; Brand RFP emails, Reviewed OER photos for videos; LEAD session scheduling; Edu mtg follow-ups	0.50					0.50		0.50		0.50	1.00
	C-team planning re: Council mtg, LEAD topics discussion, edu budget & RFPs; Correspondence re: Council budget procedures; Correspondence re: OMA presentation; EERMC mtg - OMA,											
	LEAD topics discussion, equity presentation	0.75	1.50	1.00				-	2.50		0.00	2.50
	RISE video shoot coordination; Videos check-in mtg w/D&S	0.75							0.75	<b></b>	0.00	0.75
	LEAD session logistics - Correspondence & RIC site visit; Correspondence w/homeowner for RISE video shoot;							İ				
	Correspondence w/GBRI, reviewed K-12 training fall 2022							ı			I	
	workplan, sent to EdComm for feedback	0.75					0.75	İ	0.75	]	0.75	1.50
	RISE video shoot prep & onsite	3.00					20		3.00		0.00	3.00
	C-team planning re: LEAD agenda, edu activities; Reviewed D&S	2.00							1			T
	events invoice	0.50						1	0.50		0.00	0.50
	Sent EdComm feedback to Expo planning team; Reviewed &							·	1			
	provided feedback on GBRI marketing plan, sent to EdComm	3.00						ı	3.00		0.00	3.00
	Videos check-in mtg w/D&S	0.50						<del> </del>	0.50		0.00	0.50
	Total Hours	28.50	1.50	1.25	0.00	1.50	2.50	0.00	32.75	0.00	2.50	35.25
	i otal nours			1.20	0.00	1.50	2.30	0.00	32.73	0.00	2.30	00.20

5,076.25 5,276.25

## **INVOICE**



Invoice # 987 Date: 11/14/2022 Due On: 12/14/2022

38 BELLEVUE AVE, UNIT H NEWPORT, RI 02840

RI Energy Efficiency Resource Management Council EERMC and Rhode Island Energy PURCHASE ORDER #3200171172

### 15-00012

## Legal Counsel to EERMC.

Туре	Date	Notes	Quantity	Rate	Total
Service	10/10/2022	Review of documents: Receipt, review, and filing of updated service list for Docket No. 22-05-EE.	0.10	\$225.00	\$22.50
Service	10/13/2022	Final review of 2 contracts. Emails re: same. Correspondence with client re: EE Docket.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	10/13/2022	Scheduling: Scheduling and calendaring invites in accordance with Procedural Schedule from John Harrington dated October 12, 2022; prepared simplified Intervention; to counsel to review; prepare mailings for filing.	0.70	\$225.00	\$157.50
Expense	10/13/2022	Postage: Postage - Filing of Motion to Intervene with Luly Massaro at RI PUC.	1.00	\$1.68	\$1.68
Service	10/13/2022	Correspondences: Client, C-Team PUC Attorney Harrington re: EE Docket.	1.40	\$275.00	\$385.00
Service	10/14/2022	Emails: PUC Attorney re: questions about budget. Team re: contracts.	0.60	\$275.00	\$165.00
Service	10/17/2022	Correspondences: Team re: EE docket, council meeting. Attention to contract review. Client re: meetings with PUC.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	10/17/2022	Drafting documents: Motion to intervene in 2023 EE docket, cover letter for submittal. Attention to service list. Finalize and file.	1.40	\$275.00	\$385.00
Service	10/18/2022	Correspondences: RIPUC re: data requests, filing, procedural directive. Virtual meeting with Team re: prefiled testimony.	2.30	\$275.00	\$632.50

		Client, C-Team re: response from PUC.			
Service	10/18/2022	Docket 22-33-EE: virtual meeting, Motion hard copy mailing, attention to materials from C-Team, PUC Attorney Harrington.	2.00	\$275.00	\$550.00
Service	10/19/2022	Attention to Order from 2022 EE docket, materials from PUC, C-Team re: testimony and budget. Annotate same.  Begin draft opening statement.  Review, revise URI contract.	3.70	\$275.00	\$1,017.50
Service	10/19/2022	Meeting: Virtual with client, C-team re: EE docket.	1.10	\$275.00	\$302.50
Service	10/20/2022	Emails: C-Team re: budget questions. DPUC, PUC re: DR for EE docket. Review same.	0.80	\$275.00	\$220.00
Service	10/20/2022	Appearance: Executive Committee Meeting, Council Meeting. Review presentation to prepare.	5.50	\$275.00	\$1,512.50
Service	10/20/2022	Review of documents: Review documents related to EERMC budgeting and meetings. Conference with Attorney Desautel.	1.50	\$275.00	\$412.50
Service	10/24/2022	Review, revise pre filed testimony and exhibits. Correspondences re: same. Virtual with C-Team re: testimony. Attention to EE filings.	3.10	\$275.00	\$852.50
Service	10/25/2022	Attention to EE docket discovery. Forward draft testimony to PUC Attorney for review. Correspondences with C-Team, client re: same.	1.40	\$275.00	\$385.00
Service	10/26/2022	Attention to EE docket discovery. Forward same. Correspondences with PUC, C-Team, client re: testimony. Review and finalize pre-filed testimony. Emails with C-Team, client re: same. Review DR, emails with C-Team. File testimony with PUC, service on docket list.	2.60	\$275.00	\$715.00
Service	10/27/2022	Compile, copy and package all materials to PUC for EE Docket.	3.20	\$275.00	\$880.00
Service	10/28/2022	Emails: OER re: contract review. Attention to payment clauses.	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00
Service	10/28/2022	Filing pre-filed testimony and exhibits with PUC.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	10/30/2022	File Management: Attention to budget items and materials provided by client.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	11/01/2022	Begin review and revise EE docket testimony.	0.50	\$275.00	\$137.50
Service	11/02/2022	Finish review and revise EE docket testimony. Forward same to team. Attention to team emails re: testimony.	0.80	\$275.00	\$220.00
Service	11/04/2022	File Management: Receipt, review, and filing of R.I.	0.30	\$225.00	\$67.50

		Energy's Responses to DIV First Set of Data Requests (Batch 2).			
Service	11/04/2022	Review revised pre-filed testimony. Attention to filing.	1.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
Service	11/04/2022	Filing of Documents: Prepare cover letter to Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission filing Rhode Island Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council's Joint Pre-Filed Direct Testimony of Samuel C. Ross, Craig K. Johnson, and Adrian Caesar, along with Exhibits 1 - 18; prepare and send Exhibits to be copied and collated; pick-up Exhibits from copy center; electronically file with Luly Massaro (RI PUC) and all parties contained on the Updated Service List of October 24, 2022; telephone call to Luly Massaro re hand-delivering original and copies on Monday, November 7, 2022; left message; prepared the original and seven (7) copies to be hand-delivered Monday, November 7, 2022 and placed in two (2) boxes for delivery by Attorney Desautel.	2.70	\$225.00	\$607.50
Expense	11/04/2022	Copies: Ten (10) complete sets of Exhibit copies to be filed with EERMC's Joint Pre-Filed Direct Testimony of Samuel C. Ross, Craig K. Johnson, and Adrian Caesar - (outside copy services).	1.00	\$914.85	\$914.85
Service	11/07/2022	EE Docket - review Division's testimony, Email to S. Ross re: same.	0.40	\$275.00	\$110.00
Service	11/07/2022	File Management: Organize and file office copies of Rhode Island Energy Efficiency & Resource Management Council's Joint Pre-Filed Direct Testimony of Samuel C. Ross, Craig K. Johnson, and Adrian Caesar, along with Exhibits 1-18 including receipt for Exhibit copying.	0.80	\$225.00	\$180.00
Service	11/07/2022	File Management: Receipt, review and filing of Division's Testimony in Docket No. 22-33-EE.	0.20	\$225.00	\$45.00
Service	11/07/2022	File Management: Receipt, review and filing of Commission's 3rd set of Data Requested directed to Rhode Island Energy in Docket No. 22-33-EE.	0.20	\$225.00	\$45.00
Service	11/07/2022	File Management: Receipt, review, and filing of Rhode Island Energy's Responses to PUC's First Set of Data Requests.	0.50	\$225.00	\$112.50
Service	11/08/2022	File Management: Receipt, review, and filing of Rhode Island Energy's Response to Data Request Division 9-1 in the Division's Ninth Set of Data Requests and National Grid USA's Motion for Protective Treatment of Legally Privileged Information and Objection of National Grid USA to Data Request Division 9-1.	0.40	\$225.00	\$90.00
Service	11/09/2022	Filing EE Docket pre filed tesimony.	1.50	\$275.00	\$412.50
Service	11/10/2022	Emails: C-Team, client re: OMA questions, URI	0.50	\$275.00	\$137.50

		contract. Attention to OMA research.			
Service	11/10/2022	Legal research: Research Open Meetings/Remote Meetings law.	3.30	\$275.00	\$907.50
Service	11/11/2022	Legal research: Attention to/further research re open meetings question.	0.20	\$275.00	\$55.00

Total \$14,124.03

### **Detailed Statement of Account**

### **Other Invoices**

Invoice Number	Due On	Amount Due	Payments Received	Balance Due
968	11/12/2022	\$4,965.72	\$0.00	\$4,965.72

### **Current Invoice**

Invoice Number	Due On	Amount Due	Payments Received	Balance Due
987	12/14/2022	\$14,124.03	\$0.00	\$14,124.03
			Outstanding Balance	\$19,089.75
			Total Amount Outstanding	\$19,089.75

Please make all amounts payable to: DESAUTEL LAW

Please pay within 30 days.

### Certificate of Service

I hereby certify that a copy of the cover letter and any materials accompanying this certificate was electronically transmitted to the individuals listed below.

The paper copies of this filing are being hand delivered to the Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission and to the Rhode Island Division of Public Utilities and Carriers.

Joanne M. Scanlon

December 15, 2022

Date

### Docket No. 5189 – Rhode Island Energy – 2022 Annual Energy Efficiency Program - Service list updated 11/21/2022

Name /Address	E-mail Distribution List	Phone
The Narragansett Electric Company	AMarcaccio@pplweb.com;	401-784-4263
d/b/a Rhode Island Energy	COBrien@pplweb.com;	
Andrew Marcaccio, Esq.	JHutchinson@pplweb.com;	
280 Melrose St.	JScanlon@pplweb.com;	
Providence, RI 02907	TEAst@RIEnergy.com;	
	DMMoreira@rienergy.com;	
Leticia C. Pimentel, Esq.	BSFeldman@rienergy.com;	
Robinson & Cole LLP	DJTukey@rienergy.com;	
One Financial Plaza, 14th Floor	FOOyenuga@RIEnergy.com;	
Providence, RI 02903	BJPelletier@rienergy.com;	
	JKessler@rienergy.com;	
	LPimentel@rc.com;	
National Grid	D1 Cl11	
	Brooke.Skulley@nationalgrid.com;	
Brooke Skulley, Esq. 40 Sylvan Road		
Waltham, MA 02451		
Division of Public Utilities and	Margaret.L.Hogan@dpuc.ri.gov;	401-780-2120
Carriers	Jon.hagopian@dpuc.ri.gov;	401-760-2120
Margaret L. Hogan, Esq.		
Waigaict L. Hogaii, Esq.	john.bell@dpuc.ri.gov;	
	Joel.munoz@dpuc.ri.gov;	
	Michelle.Barbosa@dpuc.ri.gov;	
	Machaela.Seaton@dpuc.ri.gov;	
Synapse Energy Economics	twoolf@synapse-energy.com;	

Tim Woolf		
Jennifer Kallay	jkallay@synapse-energy.com;	
22 Pearl Street	jkanay(wsynapse-energy.com,	
Cambridge, MA 02139		
RI EERMC	marisa@desautelesq.com;	401-477-0023
Marisa Desautel, Esq.	marisa@desauteresq.com,	101 177 0025
Office of Marisa Desautel, LLC	mdewey@desautelesq.com;	
55 Pine St.	guerard@optenergy.com;	
Providence, RI 02903		
1 Tovidence, Rr 02703	ross@optenergy.com;	
Mike Guerard, Optimal Energy		
Acadia Center	HWebster@acadiacenter.org;	401-276-0600 x402
Hank Webster, Director & Staff Atty.	<u> </u>	.01 2/0 0000 11.02
Office of Energy Resources (OER)	Albert.Vitali@doa.ri.gov;	401-222-8880
Albert Vitali, Esq.	Nancy.Russolino@doa.ri.gov;	
Dept. of Administration	Christopher.Kearns@energy.ri.gov;	
Division of Legal Services	Anika.Kreckel@energy.ri.gov;	
One Capitol Hill, 4 <sup>th</sup> Floor	Amka.Kreckei(d/energy.ri.gov;	
Providence, RI 02908	Nathan.Cleveland@energy.ri.gov;	
,	<u>Nathan.Cleverand(wenergy.ri.gov</u> ;	
Original & 9 copies file w/:	Luly.massaro@puc.ri.gov;	401-780-2107
Luly E. Massaro, Commission Clerk	John.Harrington@puc.ri.gov;	
John Harrington, Commission Counsel	Alan.nault@puc.ri.gov;	
Public Utilities Commission	Todd.bianco@puc.ri.gov;	
89 Jefferson Blvd.		
Warwick, RI 02888	Emma.Rodvien@puc.ri.gov;	
Warwick, RI 02888	Emma.Rodvien@puc.ri.gov;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual		
Warwick, RI 02888	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual  National Grid  Frederick Sneesby	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid  Frederick Sneesby Dept. of Human Services	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com; Frederick.sneesby@dhs.ri.gov;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid  Frederick Sneesby Dept. of Human Services Chris Vitale, Esq.,	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com; Frederick.sneesby@dhs.ri.gov;  cvitale@hvlawltd.com;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid  Frederick Sneesby Dept. of Human Services	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com; Frederick.sneesby@dhs.ri.gov;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid  Frederick Sneesby Dept. of Human Services Chris Vitale, Esq., RI Infrastructure Bank	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com; Frederick.sneesby@dhs.ri.gov;  cvitale@hvlawltd.com; SUsatine@riib.org;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid  Frederick Sneesby Dept. of Human Services Chris Vitale, Esq., RI Infrastructure Bank  Green Energy Consumers Alliance	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com; Frederick.sneesby@dhs.ri.gov;  cvitale@hvlawltd.com;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid  Frederick Sneesby Dept. of Human Services Chris Vitale, Esq., RI Infrastructure Bank  Green Energy Consumers Alliance Larry Chretien, Executive Director	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com; Frederick.sneesby@dhs.ri.gov; cvitale@hvlawltd.com; SUsatine@riib.org; Larry@massenergy.org;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid  Frederick Sneesby Dept. of Human Services Chris Vitale, Esq., RI Infrastructure Bank  Green Energy Consumers Alliance	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com; Frederick.sneesby@dhs.ri.gov;  cvitale@hvlawltd.com; SUsatine@riib.org;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid  Frederick Sneesby Dept. of Human Services Chris Vitale, Esq., RI Infrastructure Bank  Green Energy Consumers Alliance Larry Chretien, Executive Director	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com; Frederick.sneesby@dhs.ri.gov;  cvitale@hvlawltd.com; SUsatine@riib.org;  Larry@massenergy.org; kai@greenenergyconsumers.org;	
Warwick, RI 02888  Interested Party/Individual National Grid  Frederick Sneesby Dept. of Human Services Chris Vitale, Esq., RI Infrastructure Bank  Green Energy Consumers Alliance Larry Chretien, Executive Director	Theresa.Burns@nationalgrid.com; Scott.McCabe@nationalgrid.com; Frederick.sneesby@dhs.ri.gov; cvitale@hvlawltd.com; SUsatine@riib.org; Larry@massenergy.org;	