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Ms. Luly Massaro, Clerk 
Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission 
89 Jefferson Boulevard 
Warwick, RI  02888 
 
Re:   Docket No. 4890- The Narragansett Bay Commission 

General Rate Filing 
 
Dear Ms. Massaro: 
 
 Enclosed please find an original and nine copies of the following: 
 

1. The Narragansett Bay Commission’s Response to the Rhode Island Public 
Utilities Commission’s Hearing Record Requests.  

Also, please note that an electronic copy of this document has been provided to the 
service list. 

 
 Thank you for your attention to this matter. 
 
        Sincerely, 
 
 
        Joseph A. Keough, Jr. 
JAK/kf 
 
cc: Docket 4890 Service List (via electronic mail)  
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Request 1: Please provide the Chemical bids received by the Narragansett Bay Commission (NBC) 
referenced in the hearing testimony of Karen Giebink. 
 
Response:  See table below and attached bids. 
 

 
 
 
Prepared by:  Karen Giebink 

Account 54332 Settlement Actual Rate Increase
Gallons Hypochlorite 853,718                        853,718               -                                
Rate 0.5313$                        0.6890$               0.1577$                  
Rate Year Expense Hypochlorite 453,580$                     588,212$             134,632$                

Account 54337 Settlement Actual Rate Increase
Gallons Bisulfite 339,956                        339,956               -                                
Rate 1.2174$                        1.2300$               0.0126$                  
Rate Year Expense Bisulfite 413,862$                     418,145$             4,283$                    



BID PROPOSAL

NARRAGANSETT BA Y COMMISSION
One Service Road
Providence, Rhode Island 02905
Telephone (401) 461-8848
Fax (401) 461-6540

DATE: 4/22/2019 BILL TO: IMPORTANT- Insert unit price In both
BID NO: 1340 NARRAGANSETT BAY COMMISSION columns with brand, model numberBID OPENING: One Service Road

and name of.your firm be/ow.DATE: 5/20/19 Providence, RI 02905 BIDDER: BIDDER:

I
TIME: 10:00am Attention: Accounts Payable

SHIP TO:
BUYER: E. PETTERUTI NARRAGANSETT SAY COMMISSION Univar USA Inc. Univar USA Inc.

COST
ICENTER multiele 1 SERVICE ROAD BID # 1340 BID # 1340

FISCAL
YR. 2019 PROVIDENCE, RI 02905 PAGE NO.2 PAGE NO, 2REQ. NO .

• ICM
TOTALNO. COMMODITY CODE I DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE DELIVEREDPRICEVENDOR TO SUPPLY AND DELIVERTO NARRAGANSETTBAY COMMISSION

WASTEWATER TREATMENTFACILTIES, CHEMICALS USED IN TREATMENT
OFWASTEWATER PER ATTACHED 810 SPECIFICATIONS.
BLANKET PERIOD: JULY 1, 2019 TO JUNE 30, 2021, TWO (2) YEARBLANKET ,PERIOD.

CHEMICAL TOTAL E~TIMATED gUANTITIES
$0.689

J

ITEM #1 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITESOLUTION 1,616,727 #1 GALLON $ $1,113,924.90
Note. Trailer Rental IS for informationalpurposes and not part of bid consloerauon

Trailer Rental Pnee Per Day $ No Bid
SODIUM BISULFITE SOLUTION

J..
$1.23 per J

$ $831,555.03
ITEI\Ii#2

676.061 #2 GALLON

ITEM #3 LIQUID GLYCERIN BASED CARBON ~O~id No Bid34,000 GALLONS #3 AL ON sI$2.2928jerJ
$91,712.00

ITEM fJ4 HYDROXIDE (CAUSTIC 40,000 GALLONS #4 GALLO $
ITEM es GRADE 260 SODA ASH 330 TONS tiS ·51$451.44 per J

$ $148,975.20TON

ITEMtl6 LIQUID MANICH POLYMER 132,300GALLONS ~oBid
No Bid'6 ALLON $

No Bid
No Bid

ITEM #7 DRY POLYMER BAGS 50,000 LBS. #7 SO LB. BAG s
No Bid

No Bid
ITEM 1\18 EMULSION POLYMER TOTES 16,000GALLONS #8 GALLON s

CONTINUED Ow NEXTPAGE
TERMS TERMS

Net30 Net30
IPANY NAME: Univar USA Inc.

:ETAND NO.: 200 Dean Sievers Place
f\ A n.rri C'\ Ii r I0- r"__ •.__ ~.CDTV':

SIGNATURE: I '''\M/lQ".1/'-.>V'X...L6
"-1-'''- ~,.{~; .-,.-, ZID. 19067( ,,- b r, _ r.

~- ,-~ .~.-_."----'" - .-.. -. --... - -------~

May 16, 2019
TITLE: Michael Crea, Municipal Specialist-- ----- _ ...._--,-. --- - ,.__ . - _.

TELEPHONE: (215) 337-5411~-~--------'-.~-----. -~"'-
DATE:

f\!I8C-2
PAGE_2_0F _6_PAGES
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Request 2: Please describe how NBC accounts for revenues and funds its various accounts. 
 
Response:  Please see flow chart below and the narrative description of the monthly flow of funds 
as set forth in the Trust Indenture.  Please note that this is meant to be descriptive of the routine 
flow of funds and not reflect all possible scenarios. 
 

 
In accordance with NBC’s Trust Indenture, NBC’s Revenues, with the exception of EEF 
(Environmental Enforcement Funds) are deposited into the Revenue Fund.  
 
NBC prepares a spreadsheet (“cash flow”) that captures the monthly cash flow, which is used to 
determine the total cash receipts from Revenue during the month. The cash flow also includes 
expenses processed during the month in the Operation and Maintenance (O&M) Fund.  

O&M Fund 

Other DS Payment 
Accounts 

2008 DS Payment 
Account 

O&M 
Reimbursements 

Debt Service Fund 
Project Fund 

Revenue Fund 

Cash Receipts 

Stabilization 
Account 

Restricted Operating 
Capital Account 

Restricted CIP 
Account 
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The total Revenue Fund deposits from the cash flow is the cash available for the monthly 
fund/account transfers.  The transfers occur on the third day prior to the last business day of the 
month.  The order of the transfers is as follows: 
 
1. The first transfer is from the Revenue Fund to the O&M Fund.  This monthly transfer is 

required for for the payment of O&M expense. The amount of the transfer is based on the 
the prior fiscal year and is set forth in the budget. 

2. The next transfer is to fund deposits to the restricted debt service accounts in the Debt 
Service Fund. The monthly deposits are calculated by applying the restricted percentage (for 
debt service and debt service coverage) to the available cash. 

3. The first deposit is into the Debt Service 2008 Payment Account in the Debt Service Fund for 
interest related to the Variable Rate Demand Obligations. 

4. The next deposit is into the other Debt Service Payment Accounts in the Debt Service Fund.  
To the extent that funds are available, NBC deposits 1/6th of interest and 1/12th of principal 
based on NBC’s debt service schedule. 

5. Once all of the deposits to the Debt Service Payment accounts have been made, any 
remaining restricted funds are deposited into the Stabilization account. 

6. Deposits to the revenue fund that are related to pass-through costs recorded as charges 
and/or adjustments on customer accounts, such as the State of RI Septage Surcharge, are also 
transferred to the O&M Fund in a separate certification to the trustee outside of the monthly 
trust transfer. 

7. Payments made from the O&M fund that are reimbursed, such as COBRA payments 
reimbursed by the COBRA administrator and lien sale redemptions, are directly deposited 
into the O&M Fund, 

8. Capital reimbursements are deposited as Cash Receipts to the Revenue Fund and are 
transferred to the Project Fund to be used for future capital projects. 

9. After meeting the Indenture’s debt service coverage requirement, amounts in the Debt 
Service Fund’s Stabilization Account that are determined to not be needed for deposit into 
the Debt Service Payment Accounts are transferred to the Restricted – CIP and Restricted 
Operating Capital Accounts in the Project Fund in subsequent months to pay for capital 
projects and operating capital.   

 
Prepared by:  Karen Giebink 
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Request 3: In NBC’s Response to Comm. 2-7, it references RECVALS in the Coventry Solar Net 
Metering Agreement. Please indicate how the RECVALS were calculated. Were they negotiated 
or were they based on the spot market price, and what are the values used? 
 
Response: The RECVALS were calculated based upon the current rate NBC had contracted with a 
renewable energy broker.  The value of the contracted price in place was $16.50 per renewable 
energy credit. 
 
Prepared by: Jim McCaughey 
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Request 4: Regarding NBC’s response to Comm. 2-11, please update the schedules for the Field’s 
Point and Coventry Wind Turbines with actual performance to date for those turbines. 
 
Response: Both schedules are up-to-date through December 31, 2018 with respect to actual 
energy production and the value of the Renewable Energy Credits. Due to fluctuations in energy 
costs average, estimated values of $0.11/kWh for behind the meter electricity at Field’s Point 
and $0.14/kWh for net metered electricity from the Coventry wind turbine were utilized.  Both 
schedules have been updated through May 28th, 2019 which are as follows: 
 

Field’s Point Turbines 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Cost Item
 % 

Change
Period Period Year kWh/Year

Electricity 
Value 

($/kWh)

REC 
Value 

($/kWh)

Maintenance 
Contract 
($/year)

Extended 
Warranty 
($/year)

Insurance 
($/year)

Capital Cost 
Debt 

Repayment 
($/year)

Annual Net 
Benefit 
($/year)

Electricity 3.50% Annually 1 2013 6,463,451 $0.1100 $0.0640 $82,500 $46,800 $10,849 $516,947 $467,544.19
Maintenance Contract 6.50% Five Years 2 2014 7,542,074 $0.1100 $0.0640 $82,500 $46,800 $11,229 $516,947 $654,845.02

Extended Warranty 6.50% Five Years 3 2015 7,158,429 $0.1100 $0.0500 $82,500 $46,800 $11,229 $516,947 $487,872.68
Insurance 3.50% Annually 4 2016 6,893,758 $0.1100 $0.0525 $82,500 $46,800 $11,229 $516,947 $462,759.70

REC Devalue 5.00% Annually 5 2017 7,603,597 $0.1100 $0.0260 $82,500 $46,800 $11,229 $516,947 $376,613.20
Power Degradation 0.50% Annually 6 2018 7,711,983 $0.1100 $0.0163 $87,000 $87,000 $11,229 $516,947 $271,461.93

7A Jan-May 2019 3,817,161 $0.1139 $0.0200 $36,250 $36,250 $4,679 $215,395 $218,544.59
  7B June - Dec 2019 3,686,859 $0.1139 $0.0200 $50,750 $50,750 $6,550 $301,553 $84,067.85

 8 2020 7,673,423 $0.1178 $0.0190 $87,000 $87,000 $11,229 $516,947 $347,815.00
9 2021 7,466,501 $0.1220 $0.0181 $93,000 $99,000 $11,229 $516,947 $325,201.10
10 2022 7,635,056 $0.1262 $0.0171 $93,000 $99,000 $11,229 $516,947 $374,500.45

 11 2023 7,429,168 $0.1306 $0.0163 $99,000 $105,000 $11,229 $516,947 $359,433.48
12 2024 7,596,881 $0.1352 $0.0155 $99,000 $105,000 $11,229 $516,947 $412,626.17
13 2025 7,392,022 $0.1400 $0.0147 $99,000 $105,000 $11,229 $516,947 $411,019.21
14 2026 7,558,896 $0.1448 $0.0140 $99,000 $105,000 $11,229 $516,947 $468,295.78
15 2027 7,355,062 $0.1499 $0.0133 $99,000 $105,000 $11,229 $516,947 $468,075.46
16 2028 7,521,102 $0.1552 $0.0126 $105,435 $111,825 $11,229 $516,947 $516,385.73
17 2029 7,318,287 $0.1606 $0.0120 $105,435 $111,825 $11,229 $516,947 $517,491.13
18 2030 7,483,496 $0.1662 $0.0114 $105,435 $111,825 $11,229 $516,947 $583,584.78
19 2031 7,281,695 $0.1720 $0.0108 $105,435 $111,825 $11,229 $516,947 $585,966.50
20 2032 7,446,079 $0.1781 $0.0103 $105,435 $111,825 $11,229 $516,947 $656,833.75
21 2033 7,245,287 $0.1843 $0.0098 $105,435 $111,825 $11,229 $516,947 $660,453.10
22 2034 7,408,848 $0.1907 $0.0093 $112,288 $119,094 $11,229 $516,947 $722,243.63
23 2035 7,209,060 $0.1974 $0.0088 $112,288 $119,094 $11,229 $516,947 $727,071.87
24 2036 7,371,804 $0.2043 $0.0084 $112,288 $119,094 $11,229 $516,947 $808,323.32
25 2037 7,173,015 $0.2115 $0.0079 $112,288 $119,094 $11,229 $516,947 $814,341.08
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Coventry Wind Turbines 

 
 
 
Prepared by: Jim McCaughey 

 
  

Cost Item
 % 

Change
Period Period Year kWh/Year

Electricity 
Value 

($/kWh)

REC 
Value 

($/kWh)
LTSA ($/year)

Asset 
Management 

($/year)

Land Lease 
($/year)

Insurance 
($/year)

Capital Cost 
Debt 

Repayment 
($/year)

Annual Net 
Benefit 
($/year)

NMC 3.50% Annually 1 2016 3,393,469 $0.1400 $0.0525 $26,250 $11,250 $27,000 $3,129 $177,500 $435,113.53
LTSA 14.30% Five years 2 2017 8,780,228 $0.1449 $0.0260 $105,000 $45,000 $108,000 $12,517 $710,000 $628,023.97

Insurance 0.00% Annually 3 2018 8,587,804 $0.1500 $0.0163 $105,000 $45,900 $108,000 $12,517 $710,000 $554,060.66
REC Devalue 5.00% Annually 4A Jan-May 2019 4,255,733 $0.1552 $0.0163 $43,750 $19,508 $45,000 $5,215 $295,833 $365,426.43

Power Degradation 0.50% Annually 4B June - Dec 2019 4,428,283 $0.1552 $0.0200 $61,250 $27,311 $63,000 $7,302 $414,167 $265,897.22
Asset Management 2.00% Annually 5 2020 8,640,596 $0.1607 $0.0190 $105,000 $47,754 $108,000 $12,517 $710,000 $677,039.52

Land Lease 5.00% Five years 6 2021 8,597,393 $0.1663 $0.0181 $120,000 $48,709 $113,400 $12,517 $710,000 $693,497.32
 7 2022 8,554,406 $0.1721 $0.0171 $120,000 $49,684 $113,400 $12,517 $710,000 $726,662.92

  8 2023 8,511,634 $0.1781 $0.0163 $120,000 $50,677 $113,400 $12,517 $710,000 $761,545.82
9 2024 8,469,076 $0.1844 $0.0155 $120,000 $51,691 $113,400 $12,517 $710,000 $798,158.11

10 2025 8,426,730 $0.1908 $0.0147 $120,000 $52,725 $113,400 $12,517 $710,000 $836,514.35
 11 2026 8,384,597 $0.1975 $0.0140 $137,160 $53,779 $119,070 $12,517 $710,000 $859,471.62
  12 2027 8,342,674 $0.2044 $0.0133 $137,160 $54,855 $119,070 $12,517 $710,000 $901,369.40
 13 2028 8,300,960 $0.2115 $0.0126 $137,160 $55,952 $119,070 $12,517 $710,000 $945,069.61

14 2029 8,259,456 $0.2190 $0.0120 $137,160 $57,071 $119,070 $12,517 $710,000 $990,596.53
15 2030 8,218,158 $0.2266 $0.0114 $137,160 $58,212 $119,070 $12,517 $710,000 $1,037,976.78

  16 2031 8,177,068 $0.2345 $0.0108 $156,774 $59,377 $125,024 $12,517 $710,000 $1,067,625.47
17 2032 8,136,182 $0.2428 $0.0103 $156,774 $60,564 $125,024 $12,517 $710,000 $1,118,801.62
18 2033 8,095,501 $0.2513 $0.0098 $156,774 $61,775 $125,024 $12,517 $710,000 $1,171,924.98
19 2034 8,055,024 $0.2600 $0.0093 $156,774 $63,011 $125,024 $12,517 $710,000 $1,227,031.44
20 2035 8,014,749 $0.2692 $0.0088 $156,774 $64,271 $125,024 $12,517 $710,000 $1,284,159.21
21 2036 7,974,675 $0.2786 $0.0084 $179,193 $65,557 $131,275 $12,517 $710,000 $1,320,930.13
22 2037 7,934,802 $0.2883 $0.0079 $179,193 $66,868 $131,275 $12,517 $710,000 $1,382,224.36
23 2038 7,895,128 $0.2984 $0.0075 $179,193 $68,205 $131,275 $12,517 $710,000 $1,445,668.36
24 2039 7,855,652 $0.3089 $0.0072 $179,193 $69,569 $131,275 $12,517 $710,000 $1,511,309.61

 25 2040 7,816,374 $0.3197 $0.0068 $179,193 $70,960 $131,275 $12,517 $710,000 $1,579,197.93
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Request 5: Regarding NBC’s response to Comm. 2-11, please explain why the Electricity Values 
for the Field’s Point and Coventry Wind Turbines differ. 
 
Response:  The value of electricity generated by the Field’s Point wind turbines is based on the 
cost to purchase electricity at that location.  At Field’s Point NBC purchases electricity through a 
contract with a separate electricity supplier and pays National Grid for delivery services. Delivery 
services through National Grid are based on the G-032 Large Demand Rate. On average the 
combined value of delivery and electricity for Field’s Point is about $0.11/kWh.   
 
The value of the electricity generated by the Coventry wind turbine is realized by NBC through 
Net Metering Credits applied to our electric bills with National Grid.  In accordance with RIGL 39-
26.4 - the rates applicable to net-metered accounts are those that apply to the rate classification 
were the power is produced. In the case of the Coventry Wind turbines the rate classification is 
C-O6 which equates to about $0.14/kWh. 
 
Prepared by: Jim McCaughey 
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Request 6: Please compare the last two years of NBC’s electricity costs to what it would have 
paid if it were on standard offer. 
 
Response:  
 

  
 
 
Prepared by:  Karen Giebink 
 
  

NBC Supply per 
Contract Standard Offer

Increased Cost 
(Savings)

FY 2017 1,641,887.97$          1,474,680.42$       167,207.55$        
FY 2018 1,726,193.23            1,898,052.21         (171,858.98)         
FY 2019 YTD 1,811,064.79            2,318,227.15         (507,162.36)         

5,179,145.99$          5,690,959.78$       (511,813.79)$       

* All  except smaller Interceptor Maintenance accounts

Contract vs. Standard Offer*
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Request 7: Regarding NBC’s response to Comm. 2-8: 

a. Under what program is NBC receiving the $540,000 grant from National Grid? 
b. Under what program is NBC receiving the $200,000 grant from the Regional 

Greenhouse Gas Initiative? 
c. Which part of the Rhode Island Renewable Energy Fund is providing the $80,000 

grant?  
d. For each of the grants in subparts a.-c., please state whether NBC has received a 

letter of commitment, and if so, please provide the letter(s). 
e. When does NBC expect to receive each of the grants in subparts a.-c.; are there 

restrictions on the grants; if so, what are they; and, if not, what does NBC plan to 
do with the grant funds? 

Response:   

a. NBC will receive these funds as the result of National Grid Custom Retrofit 
Application No. 7286259.  The signed Terms, Conditions and Minimum Technical 
Requirements are attached. NBC expects to receive 80% of the funds upon 
completion of the project as verified by an inspection performed by the grant 
giver, and the remaining 20% after fulfilling all items in the attached Minimum 
Requirements Document (MRD). 

b. NBC will receive these funds as allocated by the Rhode Island Office of Energy 
Resources (RIOER) from the funds which are a result of Rhode Island’s 
participation in the Regional Greenhouse Gas Initiative (RGGI).  NBC expects to 
receive 100% of the funds upon completion of the project as verified by an 
inspection performed by the grant giver. 

c. This is from the Commercial Scale Program.  NBC expects to receive 100% of the 
funds upon completion of the project as verified by an inspection performed by 
the grant giver.  The Commercial Scale Program Award letter is attached. 

d. NBC has no Letters of Commitment other than those that are attached. 
e. NBC expects to receive the funds according the timelines stated above in response 

to items a, b and c above.   NBC is not aware of restrictions on the grants.  The 
grant funds will be deposited in the Grant and Project Reimbursement Account in 
the Project Fund to be used for capital improvements. 
 

Prepared by:  Barry Wenskowicz  
  





























 

June 22, 2018 

Mr. Thomas Uva 
Narragansett Bay Commission  
1 Service Road 
Providence, RI 02905 
 
RE: RI Renewable Energy Fund Application: Project #7-276 
 
Dear Mr. Uva,  
 
I am pleased to inform you that the Rhode Island Commerce Corporation (“Commerce RI”) has awarded 
Narragansett Bay Commission a grant of $80,000 as part of the Renewable Energy Fund’s (“REF”) 2018 
Commercial Scale Grant Program. This award is based upon the information in your application received by 
Rhode Island Commerce Corporation, and funds shall be used towards completing an anaerobic digestion 
project with a 644kW engine generator installation at 102 Campbell Avenue in Rumford as outlined in your 
application received on February 15, 2018. 
 
REF Staff will contact Narragansett Bay Commission in the near future to arrange the execution of a Grant 
Agreement at the offices of Rhode Island Commerce Corporation in Providence. Work on your project can 
begin as soon as the Grant Agreement is fully executed and all of the items listed on Exhibit A, attached 
hereto, have been received. 

In accepting this award, please note that all approved projects are subject to availability of REF funds. 
Completed project payments will be processed in the order of submission, conditional to availability of funds 
or as funds become available.   
 
If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me directly at 401-278-9196, or 
ref@commerceri.com 

Sincerely, 

 
Annie Ratanasim 
Renewable Energy Fund Program Manager 
Rhode Island Commerce Corporation 
 

Cc: Daniel O’Connell’s Sons, Greg Waugh ; Biospark, Thomas Moore  

mailto:ref@commerceri.com


 

 

 

EXHIBIT A 
 

1. Certificate of Commission Secretary certifying authorization of project, incumbency of officers, and 
authorized signatories 
 

2. Insurance Binder indicating that the Rhode Island Commerce Corporation is an additional named 
insured 
 

3. W-9 for Grantee 
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Request 8: Regarding NBC’s response to Comm. 3-5, please: 

a. Identify the details of any contract “with a third party to pay for or reimburse all or a 
portion of the costs associated with the installation or extension of a sewer line” as 
referenced in subsection a. of the response.  

b. Please explain how the cost and expense allocation reference in subsection b. of the 
response were calculated. 

 
Response:   
 

a. Contract 304.60: Johnston Sewer Improvements/Greenville Ave. -  
The Greenville Avenue Interecptor Project was initiated at the request of multiple 
parties including the State of Rhode Island. It was identified as a major economic 
development undertaking and NBC played a key role on making it come to fruition. 
Written agreements for cost sharing /reimbursement were negotiated with Citizens 
Bank, RIDOT and Charda Properties. Please refer to the attached agreements for 
details. 
 
Contract 304.64: Johnston Sewer Improvements/Hartford Ave. - 
The Hartford Avenue Interceptor Project was initiated at the request of property 
owners along Hartford Avenue west of Rt 295 and the Town of Johnston. NBC 
informed the interested parties that they would need to reimburse the NBC for the 
cost of installation of the pipeline based on method “to be determined” and that it 
would be fairly apportioned. The interested property owners agreed to that 
approach.  No written agreement was executed. 

 
In addition, the RIDOT had a road improvement project scheduled for that same area 
during the same construction season and was working to coordinate with other 
entities any upcoming projects that were scheduled. Once RIDOT completes a road 
project there is a five year moratorium on digging up the roadway. As a result NBC 
entered into a written agreement for some cost sharing/reimbursement and 
coordinated scheduling.  See attached agreement. 

 
 
b. The cost for the projects was based on the bid prices submitted by the contractors 

who completed the work. 
 

Contract 304.60: Johnston Sewer Improvements/Greenville Ave. - The cost allocation 
for the Greenville Avenue project was negotiated with several parties and contained 
in the written agreements referenced in 8a.   
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Contract 304.64: Johnston Sewer Improvements/Hartford Ave. - The allocation of cost 
for Contract the Hartford Avenue project is planned to be apportioned based on a 
“per acre served” for properties immediately tributary to the installed interceptor.  

 
Prepared by: Ray Marshall 
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SEWER EXTENSION AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE
NARRAGANSETT BAY COMMISSION
AND CHARDA PROPERTIES. LLC

This Agreement is entered into between the Narragansett Bay Commission (hereinafter
the "NBC") a nonprofit public corporation authorized, created and established under the
laws of the State of Rhode Island, having a principal place of business at One Service
Road, Providence, Rhode Island, 02905, and Charda Properties. LLC (hereinafter
"Charda"), a duly organized business in the State of Rhode Island, having a principal
place of business at 44 Davis Street, Seekonk, MA 02771, (hereinafter the NBC and
Charda may collectively be referred to as the "Parties" and each individually as a
"Party").

The Parties to said agreement understand the following to be true and.accurate:

RECITALS:

WHEREAS, the NBC is in the process of construction of certain sewer facilities
along Greenville Avenue (Route 5) in the Town of Johnston

WHEREAS, Chardaholds title to real estate in the Town of Johnston located at
Plat S.!: .Lot 2..~ 6~ 7S(hereinafter the "Subject Property"); and

WHEREAS, Charda requests an extension of the aforementioned sewer facilities
to service the Subject Property; and

WHEREAS, the NBC is willing to extend a 12" sewer approximately three
hundred and sixty (360) feet westerly to accommodate Charda's request (hereinafter the
"Sewer Extension"); and

WHEREAS, Charda agrees to pay for all costs associated with the Sewer
Extension work; and

WHEREAS, the NBC agrees to undertake the work necessary to complete the
Sewer Extension upon receipt of payment from Charda,
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NOW TIlEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual promises hereinafter set forth, and
other good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby
acknowledged, the Parties hereby agree as follows:

Section 1. Payment.

Charda agrees to pay an initial one hundred seventy thousand dollars ($170,000.00)
within ten (10) days of the execution of this Agreement by both Parties (hereinafter the
"Initial Payment"). If the total cost for the Sewer Extension exceeds the Initial Payment,
then Charda agrees to pay any and all additional amounts necessary to complete the
Sewer Extension. If the Sewer Extension costs less than the Initial Payment, then the
NBC agrees to return all remaining funds to Charda,

Charda acknowledges and agrees that the Initial Payment does not include any fees or
costs relative to a sewer connection permit from the NBC's Permit, Policy, and
Regulation Division. Charda agrees that it will pay for all such costs separately from the
Initial Payment. No such permit will be issued to Charda, however, unless the Initial
Payment and all additional and ancillary costs related to the Sewer Extension and the
aforementioned permit application are paid in full.

Section 2. Responsibilities of Charda.

In addition to Charda's payment obligations referenced in Section 1. above, Charda will
adhere to and be responsible for all of the conditions and deadlines imposed in by the
NBC relative to the Sewer Extension and/or the sewer permit application process.
Charda will not discharge any flow to the NBC facilities until the Sewer Extension work
is complete or upon specific instructions from the NBC.

Section 2. Responsibilities of NBC.

At Charda's expense, and on their behalf, the NBC will oversee the Sewer Extension
work. The Sewer Extension will begin at the east entrance to Citizens Bank Campus on
Greenville Ave. and extend to the Subject Property.

The NBC will supply the method and schedule for Sewer Extension as well as conduct
field inspections of the work to ensure that the Sewer Extension is progressing as
scheduled and in an acceptable manner.

Section 4. Liaisons.

Both Charda and the NBC will appoint a specific contact person to be the sole liaison
between the Parties. The liaisons shall be:
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For the NBC: For Charda:

Richard Bernier,
Director of Construction Services
Narragansett Bay Commission
One Service Road
Providence, RI 02905
Phone: (401) 461-8848 ext. 326

Ii· Ch.ttv-l·(~ ~ f.tAft(i.1'I .
O~a.:hrl.j M.(Wt.~

(hwJp... ~17J~h".tf, LLC.
P.o. gp}C ("foffY-

f r» If,l..e"c.-< I (Z I 62'i «? 0
(elf /- lfc> 1- <f 'f 1- o g if"

..(-h.II.:1 fA.r('U,CI>M (! (1..61. C. oY/1Se(:tion 5. Commencement.

This Agreement will commence on the date it is executed by both Parties. The Sewer
Extension work will begin upon receipt of the Initial Payment. If Charda fails to make
the Initial Payment, then the NBC is under no obligation to undertake the work necessary
for the Sewer Extension. If Charda fails to make any additional or ancillary payments
required to complete the Sewer Extension, the NBC will be under no obligation to
continue or complete Sewer Extension work.

Section 6. Amendments.

The Agreement represents the entire understanding of the NBC and Charda to those
matters contained herein. No prior oral or written understanding shall be of any force or
effect with respect to those matters covered hereunder. This Agreement may not be
modified or altered except pursuant to a mutual agreement in writing and signed. by both
parties.

Sedion 7. Extent of Agreement.

Nothing herein shall be construed as creating any personal liability on the part of any
officer or agent of any public body which may be a party hereto, nor shall it be construed
as giving any rights or benefits hereunder to anyone other than the NBC and Charda. The
failure of the NBC to demand from Charda performance of any act under the Agreement
shall not be construed as a waiver of the NBC's right to demand, at any subsequent time,
such performance. Words and phrases herein, including any acknowledgment hereof,
will be construed as in the singular or plural number, and as masculine, feminine or
neutral gender according to the context

Section 8. Cantions.

Captions and section headings are for reference only and shall not limit or otherwise
affect the meaning of the sections.
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Section 9. JurisdiciiolL

This Agreement shall be administered and interpreted under the laws of the State of
Rhode Island. Jurisdiction of litigation arising from this Agreement shall be in the State
of Rhode Island.

~tion 9. Remedies.

Claims, counter-claims, disputes, and other matters in question between the NBC and
Charda arising out of. or relating to, this Agreement or the breach of it will be decided by
arbitration if the Parties mutually agree, or by a court of competent jurisdiction.

SeeDOD 10. Iudemnifi4:ation..

Charda agrees to forever defend, indemnify, and hold harmless the NBC, and their
agents, successors, assigns, servants, contractors, and employees, from and against any
and all claims, complaints, demands, causes of action, actions and liabilities arising out
of, or in any way connected with this Agreement. howsoever caused, except to the extent
that such claims, complaints, demands, causes of action, actions or liabilities are the
proximate result of the sole negligence or willful misconduct of the NBC. The
obligations set forth in this Section 10 will continue to remain in force and effect after
completion of the Sewer Extension work or any termination of this Agreement.

Section 11. Severability.

If any provision of this Agreement or the application thereof is held invalid by a court,
arbitrator or government agency of competent jurisdiction or ifany provision of this
Agreement is found to be in conflict with applicable laws, such provision will be
inoperative, null and void insofar as it is in conflict with said decision or law, but the
remainder of this Agreement shall be in full force and effect.

Section U. Tax Implications.

Charda agrees that if it is later determined by the Internal Revenue Service or any other
taxing body that taxes of any type should have been paid in connection with any benefit
they receive pursuant to this Agreement, they will be solely responsible for paying such
taxes. The NBC makes no representations or warranties regarding the legal effect or tax
consequences of this Agreement, or of any such filing or reporting by the NBC. Charda
further expressly acknowledges that they neither received nor relied upon any tax advice
from the NBC or their representatives and attorneys.
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Section 13. Advi.:e of CounseL

Each Party to this Agreement acknowledges that it has bad the benefit of advice of
competent legal counsel or the opportunity to retain such counsel with respect to its
decision to enter into this Agreement. The individuals whose signatures are affixed to
this Agreement in a personal or representative capacity represent that they are competent
to enter into this Agreement. are doing so freely and without coercion by any other Party
or non-party hereto, and are authorized to enter into this Agreement.

THE NARRAGANSETT BAY COMMISSION

Date

v~~~m~--~~----------
Chairman

Date

Print Name: t/..cII#S" 7/tfAJ-.lfUt!

Tit1e:~ i 7?P~
7/)dz

Dat~/

Page50f5

















DOCKET NO. 4890 
Response from the Narragansett Bay Commission 

to the Rhode Island Public Utilities Commission  
Hearing Record Requests 

May 23, 2019 
 

12 
 

Request 9:  Regarding NBC’s response to Comm. 3-6, please provide any cost/benefit analyses 
for the two contracts referenced. 

 
Response:    
 
Contract 304.60: Johnston Sewer Improvements/Greenville Ave.  
 
The project was estimated to generate annual revenue of $517,500-$532,888 based on flow 
estimates and 110 direct connections and 570 indirect connections. The original estimate for the 
project was $3.0 million and the useful life of the interceptor was conservatively estimated to be 
30 years.  Therefore, the project would result in a net positive revenue stream of $417,500 to 
$432,888.  During the project’s construction several modifications were necessary and the net 
cost of the interceptor in Greenville Avenue was more than had been anticipated. As identified 
in NBC’s response to 3-6 after removing the Facilities Planning costs (this cost relates to all sewer 
extension projects in Johnston), cost sharing and reimbursements the net cost of the project was 
$6.8 million and spread over 30 years calculates to $277,836 per year.  The project still results in 
a projected net positive cash flow of $289,664 to $305,052. 
 
See following tables: 
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Citizens Flat Fees (Based on 6" or 8" Meter) 25,600$                  40,988$        
Citizens Consumption 172,300                  172,300        
110 Residential Direct Connections 51,700                    51,700           
570 Residential Indirect Connections 267,900                  267,900        
Estimated Annual Revenue 517,500$               532,888$      

Johnston Sewer Improvements - Greenville Ave
Original Estimate Project # 30460

Design and Construction 3,000,000$  

Useful Life (years) 30                   
Annual Cost 100,000$      

Net Revenue Stream 417,500$               432,888$      

Johnston Sewer Improvements - Greenville Ave
 Actual Costs Project # 30460

Planning - Facilities Plan 496,417$      
Design 316,270$      

Construction 6,718,802     

Total Design & Construction 7,531,490$  

Reimbursements (200,000)       

Total 7,331,490$  

Less Facilities Planning (496,417)$    

Net Design and Construction 6,835,073$  

Useful Life (years) 30                   
Annual Cost 227,836$      

Net Revenue Stream 289,664$               305,052$      

Estimated Annual Revenue
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Contract 304.64: Johnston Sewer Improvements/Hartford Ave.  
 
NBC planned to seek reimbursement of the contruction costs through the proposed new fee 
structure based upon a new customer’s parcel size prior to their connection to NBC’s system.  
Accordingly, no revenue projections or cost/benefit analyses were prepared. 
 
 
Prepared by:  Ray Marshall 
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Request 10: Provide the winning electricity supply bid. 
 
Response:  
 
The winning bid accepted by NBC for electricity is a 12-month term at $0.06642/kWh from Direct 
Energy (see Attachment PUC RR-10).  The rate includes the capacity charge.  See table below for 
updated rate year electricity cost based on the bid for electricity supply. 
 

 
 
Karen Giebink 
 

  

COB/WQSB
Interceptor 

Maintenance
Field's Point

Tunnel Pump 
Station

Net Bucklin 
Point

Total 

kWh Purchased      2,022,646           1,336,374       6,736,393     8,034,750        13,271,914    31,402,077 
Fixed Annual Customer Charge 13,209.60$  17,938.56$       13,209.60$   13,209.60$ 13,209.60$      70,777$        

Supply and Delivery Composite Rate 0.1211$        0.1773$             0.1316$         0.1305$       0.1220$            
Supply and Delivery 244,963        236,994             886,307         1,048,374    1,618,775        4,035,413$  

Subtotal 258,172$      254,933$           899,517$      1,061,584$ 1,631,985$      4,106,190$  
Rhode Island Gross Earnings Tax 10,757          10,622               37,479           44,232          67,998              171,089        

with RIGET 268,929$      265,555$           936,996$      1,105,816$ 1,699,983$      4,277,279$  

Actual supply rate 0.06642$     /kWh
Per Settlement Agreement 4,230,551$ 

Increase (Decrease) 46,729$       

Rate Year Electricity Expense Projection



Attachment PUC RR-10



Attachment PUC RR-10



Attachment PUC RR-10



Attachment PUC RR-10
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CERTIFICATION 

 I hereby certify that on June 5, 2019, I sent a copy of the within to all parties set forth on 
the attached Service List by electronic mail and copies to Luly Massaro, Commission Clerk, by 
electronic mail and regular mail.  
 

Parties/Address E-mail Distribution  Phone 
Karen L. Giebink, Director of A&F 
Narragansett Bay Commission 
One Service Road 
Providence, RI 02905 

Kgiebink@narrabay.com; 401-461-8848 
 Sarnold@narrabay.com;  

gdegnan@narrabay.com; 

Harold Smith, Raftelis Financial 
Consultants 
 

Hsmith@raftelis.com;  

Christy Hetherington, Esq. 
Dept. of Attorney General 
150 South Main St. 
Providence, RI 02903 

Chetherington@riag.ri.gov; 401-222-2424 
 Tparenteau@riag.ri.gov; 

Mfolcarelli@riag.ri.gov;   
Al.mancini@dpuc.ri.gov;  
dmacrae@riag.ri.gov; 
pat.smith@dpuc.ri.gov;  
albert.demiranda@dpuc.ri.gov; 
Thomas.kogut@dpuc.ri.gov;   
John.bell@dpuc.ri.gov;  

Ralph Smith, Larkin Associates 
Dawn Bisdorf 
Mark Cady 
Megan Cranston 

rsmithla@aol.com;   
dawn.bisdorf@gmail.com;   
msdady@gmail.com;    
mcranston29@gmail.com;   

Original and nine (9) copies w/: 
Luly E. Massaro, Commission Clerk 
John Harrington, Commission Counsel 
Public Utilities Commission 
89 Jefferson Blvd. 
Warwick, RI 02888 

Luly.massaro@puc.ri.gov; 401-780-2107 
 Alan.nault@puc.ri.gov; 

Cynthia.WilsonFrias@puc.ri.gov;  
Sharon.ColbyCamara@puc.ri.gov;  

John.Harrington@puc.ri.gov;  
Margaret.hogan@puc.ri.gov; 

Office of the General Treasurer 
Amy L. Crane, General Counsel 
Office of the General Treasurer 
50 Service Ave., 2nd Floor 
Warwick, RI 02886 
 
 

Amy.Crane@treasury.ri.gov;  401-462-7615 
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The George Wiley Center 
Jennifer L. Wood, Executive Director 
R.I. Center for Justice 
1 Empire Plaza, Suite 410 
Providence, RI 02903 
(401) 491-1101 ext. 801 

jwood@centerforjustice.org;  401- 491-1101 
ext. 801 

camiloviveiros@gmail.com;  

Ted Nesi TNesi@wpri.com  

Providence Apartment Association 
Matthew L. Fabisch, Esquire 

Fabisch@fabischlaw.com 
 

 

 
 
       
 Joseph A. Keough, Jr., Esquire # 4925  

  KEOUGH + SWEENEY, LTD. 
       41 Mendon Avenue 
       Pawtucket, RI  02861 

 (401) 724-3600 (phone) 
 (401) 724-9909 (fax)    

  jkeoughjr@keoughsweeney.com 
 
 

 
 
       

 

 

JKeough
New Stamp




